

Law Offices of James B. Gottstein

406 G Street, Suite 206
 Anchorage, AK 99501
 (907) 274-7686 Tel
 (907) 274-9493 Fax

Invoice

DATE	INVOICE #
11/29/2008	12

BILL TO
Law Project for Psychiatric Rights

			TERMS
DATE	WORK PERFORMED	HOURS	AMOUNT
10/21/2008	Call from PD, call from AG, prepare for hearing, prepare limited entry of appearance (2.7), continue prepare for hearing, hearing (to 6.62), e-mail to V. Leonard, e-mail to L. Derry, call to S. Musante. (to 6.78)	6.78333	2,204.58
10/22/2008	Work on Motion to Dismiss (1.32)(to 2.28), serve & file Motion to Dismiss (to 2.88)	2.88333	937.08
10/23/2008	Call from W. Bigley (.1), e-mail to L.Derry (.05) (.15), prepare K. Khari Deposition Package (.2), e-mail to L. Derry, e-mail to L. Smith to (.8)	0.8	260.00
10/24/2008	Call from W. Bigley, call(s) to L. Derry, instructions to L. Smith (.15), call from L. Derry, instructions to L. Smith, e-mail to L. Derry (.35)	0.35	113.75
10/27/2008	Call from B. Bigley, call from L. Derry (.15), review court order, call to E. Bozzini (.05), attempt to view court file, call to E. Bozzini, Review Motion to Dismiss Pkg, call to Supreme Ct. Clerk's Ofc, work on written testimony submission, call to E. Bozzini, call to Supreme Ct. Clerk's Ofc., work on summary judgment motion, call from B. Bigley, continue work on summary judgment motion (5.63) (to 6.90), work on motion to vacate hearing order (TO 8.45)	8.45	2,746.25
		Total	

Law Offices of James B. Gottstein

406 G Street, Suite 206
 Anchorage, AK 99501
 (907) 274-7686 Tel
 (907) 274-9493 Fax

Invoice

DATE	INVOICE #
11/29/2008	12

BILL TO
Law Project for Psychiatric Rights

			TERMS
DATE	WORK PERFORMED	HOURS	AMOUNT
10/28/2008	Work on summary judgment motion pkg, instructions to L. Smith, serve & file pleading package, work on Motion for Stay, call from E. Bozzini, prepare for status conference, status conference, instructions to L. Smith (2.92), prepare for hearing (3.35)call from/to K. Banfield, e-mails to K. Banfield (to 3.48), Addendum to Dismiss (.8), message from L. Derry, e-mail to R. Adler, call to R. Adler, continue Addendum to Dismiss, serve & file, continue prepare for hearing (to 6.77)	6.76667	2,199.17
10/29/2008	Prepare for Hearing, Motion to Hold Hearing at Courthouse pkg (1.38)(to 4.30), finalize, serve & file (to 5.18), motion to dismiss .838 Petition (to 8.12)(to 9.17)	9.16667	2,979.17
10/30/2008	Prepare for hearing, .838 Motion to Dismiss pkg, deposition notices and subpoenas, instructions to L. Smith, finalize, serve & File (5.05), litigation swirl (to 12.73)	12.73333	4,138.33
10/31/2008	Litigation swirl (witnesses, motions, discovery, document review, communications with opposing counsel, call with BB etc.) (11.77)(12.35)	12.35	4,013.75
11/1/2008	Work on oppositions to discovery motions & reply to dispositive motion (9.78)(to 14.85)	14.85	4,826.25
11/2/2008	Oppositions to discovery motions, reply to dispositive motions, Initial Hearing Submission, prepare for depositions & hearing, calls with B. Bigley (1.55)(to 11.78)	11.78333	3,829.58
11/3/2008	Reply re: Dispositive Parens Patriae Motions, Pre-Hearing Submission, prepare for K.Khari deposition, prepare for hearing, hearing, C. Siciliano deposition, continue (16.10)(to 16.53)	16.53333	5,373.33
		Total	

Law Offices of James B. Gottstein

406 G Street, Suite 206
 Anchorage, AK 99501
 (907) 274-7686 Tel
 (907) 274-9493 Fax

Invoice

DATE	INVOICE #
11/29/2008	12

BILL TO
Law Project for Psychiatric Rights

			TERMS
DATE	WORK PERFORMED	HOURS	AMOUNT
11/4/2008	Work on Hearing Brief, prepare for depos and hearing, R. Adler deposition, K. Khari deposition (4.40)(to 5.03)(to 6.60)(to 9.75)(to 13.53)	13.53333	4,398.33
11/5/2008	Prepare for hearing, hearing, prepare for hearing (15.52)	15.51667	5,042.92
11/6/2008	Prepare for Hearing, hearing, conf. w/ L. Derry (2.92)(to 9.92), e-mail to L. Derry (to 10.35)	10.35	3,363.75
11/7/2008	E-mail to J. Bodick, call from A. Wolf, e-mail to L. Derry (.62), call to J. Bodick, e-mails, prepare for hearing (to 1.13), review stipulation, e-mail E Pohland, supplemental witness list (.3), teleconference re: possible Worrall affidavit, continue prepare for hearing (2.75)	2.75	893.75
11/8/2008	prepare for hearing (1.2)	1.2	390.00
11/9/2008	Work on Chronology, call from BB (1.02)(to 3.87)(to 10.10)	10.1	3,282.50
11/10/2008	Prepare for hearing, hearing (6.88)	6.88333	2,237.08
11/12/2008	Call to R. Whitaker (.2), try and track down S. Porter (.2), return e-mail from L. Derry (.1)	0.5	162.50
11/13/2008	Call from L. Derry, Appendix ToC (1.1)	1.1	357.50
11/14/2008	Response to Objections to Testimony (.23)(to 1.83), e-mail from S. Porter, call to S. Porter, revise Response (to 2.03), serve & file (.2), look at Chart update (.5)	2.73	887.25
11/15/2008	Prepare for Hearing (2)	2	650.00
11/16/2008	Prepare for Hearing, call from B. Bigley (.88)	0.88	286.00
11/17/2008	prepare for hearing, hearing, call to S. Porter, e-mail to E. Pohland, call to E. Pohland, call to Judge Morse's chambers (3.38), attempted tele-hearing (.2)	3.58	1,163.50
		Total	

Law Offices of James B. Gottstein

406 G Street, Suite 206
 Anchorage, AK 99501
 (907) 274-7686 Tel
 (907) 274-9493 Fax

Invoice

DATE	INVOICE #
11/29/2008	12

BILL TO
Law Project for Psychiatric Rights

			TERMS
DATE	WORK PERFORMED	HOURS	AMOUNT
11/18/2008	Hearing for Sarah Porter telephonic Cross-X, etc. (.38), review API History, response to API History (to .62)	0.61667	200.42
11/19/2008	Response to API History, serve & file, call to B. Bigley (to 2.98), call from B. Bigley (.2)	3.18	1,033.50
11/20/2008	E-mails from/to L. Beecher (.1), call from B. Bigley (to .23)	0.23333	75.83
11/24/2008	Work on Motion for Service pkg, serve & file (.93), call from B. Bigley (.05), e-mail to L. Derry/E. Pohland (.05), call from B. Bigley (to 1.10)	1.1	357.50
11/25/2008	Call from B. Bigley (.12), review Forced Drugging Oorder (to.90), call from B. Bigley (to .93)	0.93333	303.33
11/28/2008	e-mail to L. Derry/E. Pohland/Tim Twomey (.68), motion to modify stay (to 1.53) (to 4.53)(to 6.70)(to 7.17)	7.16667	2,329.17
11/29/2008	Motion for stay pkg, Motion for Expedited Consideration (1.3)	1.3	422.50
		Total	\$61,458.57