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INTRODUCTION

1. This is an action to,

(a) obtain a declaratory judgment that Alaskan children and youth have the

right not to be administered psychotropic drugs unless and until,

(i) evidence-based psychosocial interventions have been exhausted,

(ii) rationally anticipated benefits of psychotropic drug treatment

outweigh the risks,

(iii) the person or entity authorizing administration of the drug(s) is fully

informed of the risks and potential benefits, and

(iv) close monitoring of, and appropriate means of responding to,

treatment emergent effects are in place,

(b) permanently enjoin the defendants and their successors from authorizing or

paying for the administration of psychotropic drugs to Alaskan children and youth

without conformance with subparagraph Ca) of this paragraph I, and

(c) obtain an order

(i) requiring an independent reassessment of each Alaskan child or youth

to whom defendants have authorized the administration or payment of

psychotropic drugs for conformance with subparagraph (a) of this

paragraph I by a qualified contractor appointed and monitored by the

Court, or a Special Master, to be paid by defendant State of Alaska,

appointed for that purpose,

and

Amended Complaint
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(ii) for each child for whom it is found the administration of or payment

for psychotropic drugs is taking place out of conformance with

subparagraph (a) ofthis paragraph I, that immediate remedial action

be commenced to prudently eliminate or reduce such administration

of or payment for psychotropic drugs and diligently pursued to

completion.

JURISDICTION AND VENUE

2. This Court has jurisdiction pursuant to AS 22.10.020

3. Venue is proper under Rule 3 of the Alaska Rules of Civil Procedure.

PARTIES

4. Plaintiff, the Law Project for Psychiatric Rights, an Alaska non-profit

corporation (PsychRights~, is a public interest law firm whose mission is to mount a

strategic litigation campaign against forced psychiatric drugging and electroshock.

5. Defendant State of Alaska, is the state of Alaska, one of the United States of

America (State), which through various of its agencies, agents and delegees, (a) pays for

the administration of psychotropic drugs to Alaskan children and youth and (b) has taken,

does take, and will take Alaskan children and youth into care and custody and assume

control over them, including authorizing the administration of psychotropic drugs.

6. Defendant Sarah Palin is the Governor of the State and has ultimate

responsibility for its operation, including its agencies, agents and delegees who (a) pay

for the administration of psychotropic drugs to Alaskan children and youth, and (b) take

Amended Complaint -4-
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Alaskan children and youth into care and custody and assume control over them,

including authorizing the administration of psychotropic drugs.

7. Defendant Alaska Department of Health and Social Services is the agency of

the State of Alaska that primarily (a) pays for the administration of psychotropic drugs to

Alaskan children and youth, and (b) has taken, does take, and will take Alaskan children

and youth into care and custody and assume control over them, including authorizing the

administration of psychotropic drugs.

8. Defendant William Hogan, is the Commissioner of the State of Alaska's

Department of Health and Social Services, one of the agencies which (a) pays for the

administration of psychotropic drugs to Alaskan children and youth, and (b) has taken,

does take, and will take Alaskan children and youth into care and custody and assume

control over them, including authorizing the administration of psychotropic drugs.

9. Defendant Tammy Sandoval, is the Director of the Office of Children's

Services (OCS), within the Department of Health and Social Services, one of the

agencies which (aJ pays for the administration of psychotropic drugs to Alaskan children

and youth, and (bJ has taken, does take, and will take Alaskan children and youth into

care and custody and assume control over them, including authorizing the administration

ofpsychotropic drugs.

10. Defendant Steve McComb is the Director of the Division of Juvenile Justice

within the Department of Health and Social Services, one of the agencies which (a) pays

for the administration of psychotropic drugs to Alaskan children and youth, and (bJ has

taken, does take, and will take Alaskan children and youth into care and custody and

Amended Complaint -5-
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assume control over them, including authorizing the administration of psychotropic

drugs.

11. Defendant Melissa Witzler Stone is the Director of the Division of

Behavioral Health, which has programs in which Alaskan children and youth are

administered psychotropic drugs.

12. Defendant Ron Adler is the Director/Chief Executive Officer of the Alaska

Psychiatric Institute, an inpatient psychiatric hospital that administers psychotropic drugs

to Alaskan youth.

13. Defendant William Struer is a Deputy Commissioner of the Alaska

Department of Health and Social Services and the Director of the Division of Health Care

Services, which pays for the administration of psychotropic drugs to Alaskan children

and youth.

CHILDREN AND YOUTH'S CONSTITUTIONAL RIGHTS NOT TO BE
ADMINISTERED PSYCHOTROPIC DRUGS UNLESS IT IS IN THEm BEST

INTERESTS AND THERE ARE No LESS INTRUSIVE ALTERNATIVES

14. Because decisions to administer psychotropic medication to children and

youth are not made by the children and youth themselves, the administration of such

medication is involuntary as to them.

15. Under the Alaska Constitution involuntary administration ofpsychotropic

drugs infringes upon fundamental constitutional rights, and before the State may

administer such drugs, Ca) there must be a compelling state interest in doing so, Cb) the

action must be in the best interests of the person, and (c) there must be no less intrusive
I

I
. I

a ternattves.

I
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16. Under the Alaska Constitution Alaskan minors have the right to enforce their

own fundamental constitutional rights.

17. Under the Fourteenth Amendment to the Constitution of the United States,

Alaskan children and youth have the right not to be harmed by the actions of, or through,

the State of Alaska, its employees, delegees and agents.

18. Alaskan children and youth have one or more other constitutional rights not

to be harmed by the actions of, or through, the State, its employees, delegees, and agents.

CHILDREN AND YOUTH'S STATUTORY RIGHTS WHEN IN STATE CUSTODY

19. Under AS 47.10.084(a) and AS 47.12.150(a), when a child is in state

custody, as a child in need of aid pursuant to AS 47.10 or a delinquent minor under AS

47.12, the Alaska Department of Health and Social Services and its delegees have a duty

to care for the child, including meeting the emotional, mental, and social needs of the

child, and to protect, nurture, train, and discipline the child and provide the child with

education and medical care.

20. Decisions by the Alaska Department of Health and Social Services and its

delegees with respect to fulfilling their duties under AS 47.10.084(a) and AS

47.12.150(a) to meet the emotional, mental, and social needs of the child and to protect,

nurture, train, and discipline children and youth in their custody and provide them with

education and medical care must be made on the basis of what is in the best interests of

the children and youth.

Amended Complaint -7-
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21. Under AS 47.14.100(d)(I), the Alaska Department of Health and Social

Services has a duty to pay the costs ofhabilitative and rehabilitative treatment and

services for children and youth diagnosed with a mental illness.

MEDICAID PAYMENT FOR OUTPATIENT PRESCRIPTIONS Is NOT
ALLOWED UNLESS ApPROVED FOR THE INDICATION BY THE FDA OR

INCLUDED IN CERTAIN MEDICAL COMPENDIA

22. It is unlawful to for the State to use Medicaid to pay for outpatient drug

prescriptions except for indications approved by the Food and Drug Administration

(FDA) or included in the following compendia:

(a) American Hospital Formulary Service Drug Information,

(b) United States Pharmacopeia-Drug Information (or its successor

publications), or

(c) DRUGDEX Information System.

THE LAW PROJECT FOR PSYCHIATRIC RiGHTS' RAISING THE ALARM To
AND DEMANDING CORRECTIVE ACTION By GOVERNMENT OFFICIALS

HAs BEEN IGNORED

23. By letter dated December 10, 2004, to Alaska State Senator Fred Dyson and

Alaska State Representative Peggy Wilson, who were holding hearings regarding OCS,

with a copy to then Commissioner of the Alaska Department of Health and Social

Services, Joel Gilbertson, James B. (Jim) Gottstein, president of the Law·Project for

Psychiatric Rights, requested they look into the situation in Alaska, writing in part:

[1]1 is almost certain a large number of children in state custody are on
dangerous psychotropic medications that have never been approved for
children. The worst of these drugs are the neuroleptics, including the newer
ones, called "atypicals." These medications make it tremendously difficult
for children to ever grow up to lead normal lives. They cause, rather than
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cure mental illness. It has been found in other states that a large number of
children in foster care or outright custody are on these drugs in order to
control their behavior, rather than help them deal with the traumas in their
lives that are causing the troubling behavior.

See, Exhibit A.

24. On August 14, 2006, Mr. Gottstein spoke with then Commissioner of the

Alaska Department of Health and Social Services, Karleen Jackson (Commissioner

Jackson), about the problem of the State's pervasive psychiatric drugging of children and

youth in State custody.

25. On February 8,2007, Mr. Gottstein testified before the Judiciary Committee

of the Alaska House of Representatives that children and youth in State custody were

being pervasively over-drugged with psychotropic drugs to their extreme harm.

26. On March 9, 2007, Mr. Gottstein e-mailed members of the Judiciary

Committee of the Alaska House of Representatives, with copies to Governor Palin, other

legislators and various interested parties, conveying additional infonnation, including

that, as far as he knew, Alaska was not even keeping track of the extent to which it was

administering psychotropic drugs to Alaskan children and youth and stating his hope that

Alaska would voluntarily do something about the serious harm it is inflicting on Alaskan

children and youth in State custody by administering psychotropic drugs to them. See,

Exhibit B.

27. On March 14, 2007, Mr. Gottstein e-mailed defendant Governor Palin,

among other things, about children and youth in custody in other states dying from the

administration of psychotropic drugs, and stating:

Amended Complaint -9-
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The massive over-drugging of America1s children is a titanic health
catastrophe caused by the govemmenfs failure to protect its most precious
citizens, who rely on the adults in their lives to shield them from harm, not
inflict it upon them. Perhaps the worst of all is the State inflicting this harm
on children it has taken from their homes IIfor their own good.1!

Please correct this situation.

See, Exhibit C.

28. By letter dated March 22, 2007, Commissioner Jackson responded to Mr.

Gottstein's e-mail to Governor Palin in a March 14,2007, e-mail stating in pertinent part:

Indications for the use of psychotropic medications in children includes, but
is not limited to, symptoms consistent with psychosis, Bipolar Disorder,
severe depression, Attention Deficit Hyperactivity Disorder (ADHD), and,
in certain situations, severe behavioral disturbances. Concern should be
raised when multiple medications ofone class are used or when doses are
prescribed which are considered high for this population. Concern should
also be raised when it appears that these medications are being used for
behavioral control alone, or to hasten a response to inpatient treatment or,
for that matter, outpatient or residential treatment.

The State of Alaska, in cooperation with First Health Corporation, has for
the past 3 1/2 years utilized a behavioral pharmacy management system
that compares evidence-based and consensus based practice guidelines to
the prescribing practices of Alaskan clinicians. If discrepancies are
identified, the company uses a combined approach of education and peer
consultation to address specific concerns. Since this program started, there
have been changes made in prescribing practices with the goal being
improved care for Alaska1s children.

The Office of Children's Services (OCS) operates under policy which
requires that caseworkers must staff medication recommendations for
children on their caseloads with their Supervisor and their regional
Psychiatric Nurse prior to giving consent to the treatment provider. The
OCS Psychiatric Nurses have weekly contacts with the professionals
treating OCS children in acute care settings, i.e., North Star, Alaska
Psychiatric Institute, Providence Discovery, and in residential treatment
centers. oes caseworkers and Psychiatric Nurses also participate in
monthly treatment plans for children in the residential treatment facilities.
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A medication can be increased or decreased for a child in custody, but
cannot be started without the OCS' knowledge and consent.

See, Exhibit D.

29. By letter dated February 4, 2008, Mr. Gottstein wrote Governor Palin, with

copies to the Attorney General, Commissioner Jackson, defendants Hogan and Stone, and

others, conveying scientific evidence regarding the harm being done to children and

youth by the massive over-prescribing of psychotropic drugs to them, and stating:

It is a huge betrayal of trust for the State to take custody of children and
then subject them to such harmful, often life-ruining, drugs. They have
almost always already been subjected to abuse or otherwise had very
difficult lives before the State assumes custody, and then saddles them with
a mental illness diagnosis and drugs them. The extent of this State inflicted
child abuse is an emergency and should be corrected immediately.

Children are virtually always forced to take these drugs because, with rare
exception, it is not their choice. PsychRights believes the children,
themselves, have the legal right to not be subject to such harmful treatment
at the hands of the State of Alaska. We are therefore evaluating what legal
remedies might be available to them. However, instead of going down that
route, it would be my great preference to be able to work together to solve
this problem. It is for this reason that I am reaching out to you again on this
Issue.

See, Exhibit E. l

30. By letter dated March 4, 2008, Commissioner Jackson responded to her

courtesy copy of Mr. Gottstein's February 4, 2008 letter to Governor Palin, in part, as

follows:

The Office ofChildren's Services (OCS) policy 6.3.1 clearly states that
administration of psychotropic medication, or any drugs prescribed for
mental illness or behavioral problems, falls under the definition of major
medical care. This reflects the fact that administration of these medications
is viewed in a serious manner. The oes policy further states, "Parental

1 This letter is incorrectly dated 2007, rather than 2008, which is noted on the Exhibit.
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permission or a court order is also required for administration of
psychotropic medication. If parental rights have been terminated, the
assigned worker may approve administration of psychotropic medication
following consultation with the supervisor, OCS regional psychiatric nurse
and GAL. The consultation and resulting decision should be documented in
the case file."

The policy does allow a physician or nurse to immediately administer
medication if this is necessary to preserve the life of the child or prevent
significant physical harm to the child or another person. Crisis
administration of medications should be for a very brief duration oftime
and the assigned worker should be immediately informed. The worker
should notify the parent of any medication administered on a crisis basis
and the regional psychiatric nurse should review the circumstances
regarding the administration to ensure adherence to policy. ...

Thank you for advocating for the rights of Alaska's children.

See, Exhibit F.

31. In early June of 2008, "Critical ThinkRx, A Critical Curriculum on

Psychotropic Medications" (Critical ThinkRx), David Cohen PhD, principal investigator,

was released.

32. The "Critical Think Rx" program was developed under a grant from the

Attorneys General Consumer and Prescriber Grant Program through the multi-state

settlement of consumer fraud claims regarding the marketing of the prescription drug

Neurontin, one of the anticonvulsants/anti-seizure drugs marketed as mood stabilizers

described below, in order to give guidance to people making decisions regarding

authorizing the administration of psychotropic drugs to children and youth.

33. The Attorney General of the State of Alaska is one of the participants in the

Attorneys General Consumer and Prescriber Grant Program.
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34. On June 11,2008, Mr. Gottstein e-mailed then Acting Commissioner,

defendant Hogan, with copies to the Attorney General of the State of Alaska, and among

others, defendants Melissa Stone and Tammy Sandoval, as follows:

In a last-ditch effort to avoid litigation as I begin drafting my complaint
seeking a declaratory judgment and injunction against the state of Alaska
for its massively harmful psychiatric drugging of children it has taken into
custody, I thought I would draw your attention to a terrific, just launched,
on line program about this issue, called CriticaIThinkRx.. Paid for by a
grant from the Attorneys General Consumer and Prescriber Grant Program,
funded by the multi-state settlement of consumer fraud claims regarding the
marketing ofNeurontin®, CriticalThinkRx. was developed specifically for
non·medical personnel making decisions about giving psychiatric drugs to
children. In other words, it was put together so that people such as those
working for the State of Alaska authorizing the psychiatric drugging of
children subject to State control are able to make infonned decisions.

By this e-mail, I am requesting (demanding) the State implement such a
program for informed decision making regarding the administration of
psychiatric drugs to children it has taken into custody.

Frankly, even if the State continues to ignore this problem, it might as well
start looking at the CriticalThinkRx program now because it will be faced
with this same infonnation in the lawsuit. More importantly, the State
should use the information to change what it is doing to the children whom
it has taken into custody and subjecting to what can quite legitimately be
characterized as State-inflicted child abuse. I suspect you take umbrage at
this characterization and think it is an exaggeration, but it is an accurate
one. It is a huge betrayal by the State of this most vulnerable population
and should be stopped immediately.

As you know, PsychRights has tried for years to get the State to address the
problem of it's very harmful program of psychiatrically drugging kids it has
taken into custody. See,
http://psychrights.org/States/AlaskalKidslKids.htm

I hope the State will now recognize the problem and immediately take steps
to correct it. Unfortunately, based on past experience, my guess is this will
not happen. Therefore, I am proceeding with developing the lawsuit unless
I hear otherwise from you and we work out a satisfactory program to
address this crisis, such as one consistent with CriticalThinkRx, that does
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not inflict such damage on Alaska's children for whom the State has taken
responsibility.

See, Exhibit G.

35. Despite Plaintiffs repeated requests, no substantive negotiations between

Plaintiff and any State personnel regarding the administration of and payment for

psychotropic drugs to Alaskan children and youth have taken place.

THE "CRITICAL THINKRx" CURRICULUM

36. Most of the allegations in the below sections on the FDA Drug Approval

Process, Undue Drug Company Influence, Pediatric Psychotropic Prescribing Practices,

Neuroleptics, Antidepressants, Stimulants and Anticonvulsants Promoted as "Mood

Stabilizers" and Evidence-Based, Less Intrusive Alternatives: Psychosocial Interventions,

and all of the allegations in the below section "Critical ThinkRx Specifications,u are from

the Critical ThinkRx Curriculum.

The FDA Drug Approval Process

37. The legal availability of a psychotropic drug and its approval by the United

States Food and Drug Administration (FDA) for prescription by medical practitioners

does not, in itself, signify that it is safe or effective for use with children and youth

diagnosed with a mental illness.

38. The FDA's Center for Drug Evaluation and Research (CDER) oversees

testing and approval of medications for the FDA, but conducts no drug trials of its own.

39. Drug companies pay for and conduct all tests and trials considered by CDER

in the drug approval process, and CDER judges a drug's efficacy and safety based on the
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data submitted by the sponsoring drug company (Sponsor) in support of what is called a

New Drug Application (NDA).

40. When the FDA approves a drug for a specific use (Approved Use), it means

it has reviewed limited data on safety and efficacy for one indication, usually in one

population or age group.

41. Fees paid by drug companies (User Fees) now make up over half ofCDER's

budget.

42. Since User Fees were initiated in 1992, the FDA has slashed its own testing

laboratories and network of independent drug-safety experts.

43. To approve a drug, the FDA requires only two "Phase UI trials," or large

multi-site, randomized comparisons of active drug to placebo that result in positive

findings, even if there are more Phase III trials that result in negative fmdings.

44. For purposes of drug approval by the FDA, "efficacy" means the drug has

shown less than a 5 percent chance of being worse than placebo; it does not mean the

drug has shown it helps a patient's condition or works better than another drug or non-

drug intervention.

45. Each FDA-approved drug has a "Label," in which fmdings from the pre-

clinical (laboratory and animal) and clinical (human) trials are summarized, the exact

content secretly negotiated by the FDA and the Sponsor.

46. In developing drugs for physical diseases, researchers start with a target of

drug action identified by understanding how a disease affects the body at the cellular and

molecular levels and target identified biological anomalies.
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47. Completely unlike drugs for physical diseases, potential psychotropic or

psychiatric drugs are selected for human trials based on their effects on animal behavior

and expected effects on people's complaints and behavior.

48. Experts in the field admit (a) there are no biomarkers for psychiatric illness,

(b) they do not understand the supposed neurobiology or genetic underpinnings of

psychiatric disorders, (c) they do not understand the developmental factors and causes of

mental illness, (d) there are few good animal models for psychiatric research, and (e) all

of these problems are worse when diagnosing and researching treatments in children and

youth.

49. There are many problems with the design and conduct of clinical trials of

psychotropic drugs. resulting in the trials' inability to provide a valid basis to determine

the drugs' genuine benefits and risks.

50. Trials at all phases neglect most psychoactive effects of the drug being

studied because the researchers focus on measuring narrowly selected complaints and

behavior, leaving main psychological alterations produced by the drug unknown.

51. Phase II and III trials are short, typically lasting only three to eight weeks,

with up to 70 percent of the subjects dropping out before the trials' end, detecting only

some of the acute effects and few that emerge over a longer time frame.

52. Clinical trial subjects are incorrectly assumed to have the same l!disorder,"

such as depression, or Major Depressive Disorder, where 200 distinct symptom

combinations are considered to be the same "disorder," and the same subjects usually
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meet criteria for several different psychiatric diagnoses, resulting in an invalid

comparison of treatments.

53. Because active placebos causing physical sensations are usually not used,

clinical trial subjects. as well as the researchers. can often determine whether subjects are

being given a placebo or the drug beiog tested, i.e, "breaking the blind," thus destroying

the scientific validity of the trial.

54. In clinical trials comparing a new drug to an older one, very high doses of the

older drug are often used, producing more side effects for the older drug, and resulting in

the intentionally misleading conclusion that the newer drug is safer than the older one.

55. Primary outcomes of most psychiatric drug clinical trials are rated by the

researchers rather than the subjects. ignoring relevant measures. such as in the Phase III

pediatric trials of antidepressants where not one often parent or child rated scales showed

advantages for antidepressant use over placebo.

56. Sponsors routinely remove prospective subjects who respond to placebo

from clinical trials. making the results invalid.

57. Adverse effects of the drugs occurring during clinical trials are carelessly

invesrigated, at best, resulting in a false impression of a drug's safety.

58. During clinical trials, adverse events are often miscoded by the Sponsor.

59. During clinical trials, adverse events are often arbitrarily determined to be

unrelated to the drug being studied, and ignored.

60. Sponsors announce in their study protocols that they will gather data for

weeks after clinical trial subjects stop treatment, but do not submit these data to the FDA
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even though subjects often rate their experience differently once the mind-altering drug

has been discontinued.

61. While the FDA often officially "requires II Sponsors to conduct trials once the

drugs have been approved in what is known as the "post marketing phase" or "Phase IV

Trials," as oflate 2006, more than 70 percent of these promised post marketing or Phase

IV trials had not even been started by Sponsors.

62. Sponsors often design drug studies solely to get positive results.

63. Sponsors often suppress and distort negative results.

64. Sponsors often publish purported positive results multiple times to give the

appearance the results have been replicated multiple times.

65. In conducting clinical trials, sponsors now extensively use Contract Research

Organizations, which are private, for profit companies who get paid to achieve positive

results for the Sponsors.

66. In 90 percent of studies pitting one newer neuroleptic against another, the

best drug was the Sponsor's drug.

67. Sponsors keep negative data about their drugs secret, claiming they are trade

secrets or otherwise entitled to be kept secret from prescribers and other people making

decisions on whether to give them to children and youth.

68. The foregoing problems and limitations, and other problems and limitations

of drug trials, give clinicians and policymakers false, misleading, and incomplete ideas

about how these medications can help and how they can harm people.
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69. Because of the foregoing problems and limitations, and other problems and

limitations of drug trials, FDA approval of a psychotropic drug, by itself, does not

substantiate that the approved drug is either safe or efficacious.

70. An accurate portrait of the benefits and risks of FDA-approved drugs is not

achieved until the drug has been in use for many years by many people.

Undue Drug Company Influence Over Prescribing
Practices

71. Drug company marketing of psychiatric drugs targets all types of participants

potentially involved in prescribing these drugs, or in making them available for

prescription, to children and youth.

72. Drug companies influence physicians to prescribe psychiatric drugs to

children and youth through, among other things:

(a) Free meals,

(b) Free drug samples,

(c) Providing free continuing medical education, which states require of

physicians to maintain their licenses,

(d) Payments for lecturing, consulting and research,

(e) Publishing misleading articles in medical journals,

Cf) Funding their professional organizations' activities,

(g) Advertising in professional journals,

(h) Paying doctors to serve on "expert committees" that create and promote

guidelines for drug treatments used by other doctors, and
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(i) Promotion of mental health screening programs in state and federal

policy, including for children and youth in foster care that have very high false

positive rates and that lead to over diagnosis and over use of these dangerous and

ineffective medications.

73. Drug companies influence consumers, or the lay public, to seek specific

drugs from physicians through, among orher things:

(d) Direct-to-consumer advertising ofprescription drugs on national

television and popular magazines,

(e) "Disease awareness" campaigns,

(f) Funding "patient advocacy" groups,

(g) Websites purporting to provide objective information, and

(h) Online promotions.

74. Drug companies influence medical and health "experts" to evaluate drugs

positively through, among other things:

(a) Paying researchers, and their academic institutions, to run clinical trials

and develop treatment guidelines, and

(b) Paying researchers and academics to lend their names to articles they

have not written in a practice called "ghostwriting. n

75. Drug companies often require researchers to sign secrecy agreements

whereby the drug companies are able to suppress negative information about their

products from publication.
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Pediatric Psychotropic Prescribing

76. Mainstream mental health practice endorses a "medical model" of mental

illness that supports medicating children and youth with little or no evidence of the drugs'

safety or efficacy.

77. Mainstream mental health practice endorses medicating children and youth

for mental illness when there is considerable disagreement and lack of scientific evidence

about psychiatric diagnoses in children and youth.

78. Prescriptions of psychotropic drugs to youths tripled in the 1990s and are still

rISIng.

79. The proportion of children and youth prescribed psychiatric drugs is 2 to 20

times higher in the United States, Canada, and Australia than in any other developed

nations.

80. Seventy-Five percent of all medication administered to children and youth is

prescribed for uses not approved by the Food and Drug Administration.

81. At least forty percent of all psychiatric drug treatments today involve

polypharmacy'

82. Most psychotropic medication classes lack scientific evidence of their

efficacy or safety in children and youth.

83. The FDA only evaluates trials testing a single drug, not drug combinations,

ie, "polypharmacy. n

2 As employed herein, tlpolypharmacy" means concomitant or multiple psychotropic
medication use.

,--'- I
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84. No studies have established the safety and efficacy of polypharmacy in

children and youth.

85. Almost all psychiatric drugs have been shown to cause brain damage in the

form of abnormal cell growth, cell death and other detrimental effects, which is

especially harmful for growing and developing children and youth.

86. Psychotropic drugs given to children and youth cause "behavioral toxicity.'"

87. Psychotropic drugs given to children and youth suppress learning and

cognition and produce cognitive neurotoxicty, interfering with the basic mental

development of the child, which adverse effects often do not go away after the drugs are

withdrawn.

88. No studies show that the administration of psychotropic drugs to children and

youth increases learning or acadenic performance in the long term.

89. Adverse drug effects are often confused with symptoms of disorders, leading

to the addition of inappropriate diagnoses, increased doses of current medications, and

even more complex drug regimens.

90. Nine often children and youth seeing a child psychiatrist receive

psychotropic medication.

91. Use of most classes of psychotropic dr~gs among 2-4 year-olds, or

preschoolers. continues to increase with almost half of those receiving prescriptions given

two or more medications simultaneously.

3 As employed herein, "behavioral toxicity" means drug-induced adverse effects and
behavioral changes, including apathy, agitation, aggression, mania, suicidal ideation and
psychosis.
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92. Thousands of infants less than one year of age have received psychotropic

medications.

93. The fastest increases have been in newer drugs, which by definition have

little or no established efficacy or safety profiles.

94. Treatment of preschoolers with psychiatric drugs has barely been studied.

95. There is insufficient evidence on the administration of psychotropic drugs to

preschoolers to provide guidelines for treatment, establish efficacy of treatment,

guarantee safe use, or evaluate shon~ and long-tenn consequences on development of

drug prescriptions to preschoolers.

96. Children and youth in child welfare settings are two and three times more

likely to be medicated than children and youth in the general community.

97. Medicain-enrolled children and youth are more likely to receive psychotropic

medication, be treated with multiple medications, and receive medications as sole

treatment for psychiatric diagnoses than other children and youth.

98. After controlling for demographic and clinical factors, youths in group homes

are twice as likely to be administered psychotropic medications tha'.l youths in therapeutic

foster care.

99. Both because minority and poor children and youth are more likely to be

involved in child protection and foster care placements and because the drugs are paid for

by Medicaid and other governmental programs, these children and youth are given more

psychotropic drugs than other children and youth.
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100. In 2006, the FDA strengthened its warnings about stimulants, which are

routinely given to children after a diagnosis of Attention Deficit Hyperactivity Disorder

(ADHD), because of more evidence they cause cardiovascular problems. psychosis and

hallucinations at usual prescribed doses.

101. In 2004, the FDA issued a "Public Health Advisory" about all

antidepressants, warning these drugs cause anxiety and panic attacks, agitation and

insomnia, irritability and hostility, impulsivity and severe restlessness, and mania and

hypomania after the British equivalent of the FDA banned the use of all antidepressants

except Prozac in children and youth under 18.

102. Currently the FDA requires a "Black Box" warning on the label for all

antidepressants, stating, "WARNING Suicidality and Antidepressant Drugs-

Antidepressants increase the risk of suicidal thinking and behavior (suicidality) in short-

term studies in children, youth, and young adults, with Major Depressive Disorder and

other psychiatric disorders. II

103. Between 1993 and 2002, the number of non-institutionalized six to eighteen

year aIds on neuroleptics, also misleadingly called "antipsychotics,n increased from

50,000 to 532,000.

104. Nationwide, neuroleptics are typically prescribed to children for non-

psychotic conditions.

105. Seventy-seven to eighty-six percent of youths taking neuroleptics do so with

other prescribed psychotropic drugs.

. ,

:
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106. In the 1996-2001 time period, neuroleptic use in children increased the most

dramatically in Medicaid populations, with prescriptions increasing 61 percent for

preschool children, 93 percent for children aged six to twelve, and 116 percent for youth

aged thirteen to eighteen.

107. Children are particularly vulnerable to harm from psychiatric drugs because

their brains and bodies are developing.

108. There is little or no empirical evidence to support the use of drug

interventions in traumatized children and youth.

109. Fewer than ten percent of psychotropic drugs are FDA-approved for any

psychiatric use in children.

110. The use of psychiatric drugs in children and youth far exceeds the evidence

of safety and effectiveness.

Neuroleptics

Ill. The following "second-generation" of neuroleptics have been approved for

the following pediatric uses:

Brand Generic Approved
Name Name Approved Use Ages

Risperdal risoeridone Autism bioolar mania schizophrenia 5+
Abilify aripriprazole Schizophrenia 10+
Clozaril c10zapine Treatment-Resistant schizophrenia
Zvprexa olanzapine

Seroauel quetiapine
Geodon ziprasidone

Bipolar mania, schizophrenia
Adults oniy

olanzapine
Symbyax & fluoxetine
Invega paliperidone
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112. The following first-generation neuroleptics have been approved for the

following pediatric uses:

Brand
Name

Orap

Haldol

Mellaril

Generic
Name

Ipimozide

haloperidol

thioridazine

Approved Use
lourette's Disorder (for Haldol non­

responders)

Schizophrenia, lourette's Disorder

Schizophrenia

Approved
Ages

12+

3+

2+

113. Neuroleptics have been used to treat psychoses since the 1950s despite high

toxicity and limited effectiveness.

114. Starting in the 1990s, the newer, more expensive, second-generation

neuroleptics were heavily promoted as safer and more effective than the first-generation

neuroleptics.

115. In 2005, in the largest ever study regarding the treatment ofpeople diagnosed

with schizophrenia, the Clinical Antipsychotic Trials oflntervention Effectiveness

(CATIE) study, conducted by the National Institute of Mental Health, it was found that

the second-generation neuroleptics were neither more effective nor better tolerated than

the older drugs and that seventy five percent of patients quit either type of drug within

eighteen months due to inefficacy or intolerable side effects, or both.

116. Neuroleptics are most often prescribed to children and youth to suppress

aggression and agitation, which are common reactions to abuse and the trauma of being

removed from their homes and families, rather than for psychosis.
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117. The latest randomized-controlled trial ofneuroleptics for aggression, which

had no drug company sponsorship, found inert placebo more effective than Haldol a first-

generation neuroleptic, or Risperdal, a second-generation neuroleptic, in reducing

aggression in patients with intellectual disability.

118. There are few clinical trials of second-generation neuroleptics for pediatric

use, and most existing trials are short-term with the results favoring the funder's drugs.

119. Overall, current prescriptions of neuroleptics to children and youth

overwhelmingly exceed the available evidence for safety and effectiveness.

120. No studies show that second-generation neuroleptics are safe or effective for

children and youth.

121. The dopamine-blocking action of all neuroleptics is believed to account for

the following observed main effects:

(a) Indifference, sedation, drowsiness and apathy;

(b) Reduced spontaneity and affect;

(c) Reduced ability to monitor one's state;

(d) Increased abnormal movements;

(e) Cognitive and motor impairments;

(I) Confusion and memory problems; and

(g) Depression, mood swings and agitation.

122. The following observed effects ofneuroleptics are regularly misconstrued as

therapeutic by physicians and other practitioners:

(a) Increased indifference, including to psychotic symptoms,
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(b) Reduced spontaneity and affect,

(c) Reduced ability to monitor one's state, and

(d) Increased compliance with social norms.

123. The following are undesirable observed behavioral effects ofneuroleptics:

(a) Cognitive and motor impairments,

(b) Sedation and drowsiness,

(c) Confusion and memory problems,

(d) Anxiety,

(e) Depression and mood swings,

(I) Abnormal thinking, and

(g) Hostility and aggression.

124. The following are undesirable observed physical effects ofneuroleptics:

(a) Weight gain and high blood sugar (second-generation),

(b) Extrapyramidal symptoms (abnormal movements of all body parts),

(c) Diabetes (second-generation) and other endocrine problems, to which

children and youth are more susceptible,

(d) Cardiac problems,

(e) Liver problems and jaundice,

(I) Neuroleptic malignant syndrome, which occurs at a rate ofone to two

percent per year, is often fatal, can occur with any neuroleptic, at any dose, at any

time, characterized by extreme muscular rigidity, high fever and altered

consciousness,
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(g) Stroke, and

(h) Death.

125. Exrapyramidal symptoms (involuntary abnonnal movements) caused by both

first and second-generation neuroleptics include:

(a) Akathisia, an inner distress, often manifested by rocking, pacing and

agitation, and known to cause extreme violence including suicide and homicide;

(b) Dystonia, which are sudden, bizarre, sustained muscle spasms and

cramps;

(c) Dyskinesia, which consists of uncontrollable, disfiguring, rhythmic

movements of the face, mouth and tongue and sometimes of the extremities;

(d) Parkinsonism, which manifests as rigid muscles, slowed movement, loss

of facial expression, unsteady gait and drooling.

126. Long-lasting extrapyramidal symptoms affect twelve to thirteen percent of

children who receive first-generation neuroleptics for more than three months.

127. The rate of acute extrapyramidal symptoms affecting children who receive

second-generation neuroleptics has not been extensively studied, but from what is known,

it appears the rates are comparable to the first-generation neuroleptics.

128. Among the extrapyramidal symptoms caused by buth the first and second-

generation neuroleptics is often irreversible Tardive Dyskinesia, resulting from the brain

damage caused by the neuroleptics, characterized by (a) disfiguring and stigmatizing

involuntary movements, (b) difficulties in walking, silting still, eating and speaking and

(c) impaired nonverbal function.
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129. Tardive Dyskinesia is such a common. serious and severe negative effect of

neuroleptics that AS 47.30.837(d)(2)(B) requires specific information about it being

taken into account when seeking informed consent.

130. The second-generation neuroleptics cause elevated prolactin levels. resulting

in sexual and menstrual disturbances, infertility and decreased bone density. and which

has resulted in severe gynecomastia (the development of abnormal breast tissue) in bo.th

boys and girls, but particularly disturbing and disfiguring for boys.

131. Fifty percent of patients on second-generation neuroleptics gain twenty

percent of their weight, primarily as fat, that has been linked to what is called "Metabolic

Syndrome," which dramatically increases the risk of obesity, elevated blood sugar and

diabetes, elevated cholesterol and blood lipids, and hypertension.

132. All the second-generation neuroleptics also cause potentially lethal

pancreatitis.

133. Withdrawal of children and youth from neuroleptics often results in very

disturbed behavior worse than anything experienced prior to starting on the medication.

134. Between 1998 and 2005, Clozaril (clozapine) was reported to the FDA as

suspected to have caused the death of3,277 people, Risperdal (risperidone) 1,093 and

Zyprexa (olanzapine) 1,005.

135. Currently, second-generation neuroleptics carry the following FDA "Black

Box" warnings:
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All Second Generation
Neuroleptics Increased mortality in frail elderly

I"erlous risk of agranulocytosIs (severe arop In wnIle
blood cells), seizures, myocarditis and other

Clozaril cardiovascular and respiratory effects
Seroauel Suicidality in children and adolescents

136. One study showed a lifespan decrease of twenty-five years for people

diagnosed with schizophrenia who take these medications chronically.

137. Another study showed a 20 fold increase in suicide rates for patients

diagnosed with schizophrenia who were treated with neuroleptics from 1994-1998

compared to those in the period from 1875-1924.

138. Experts recommend that neuroieptics not be considered first-line treatment

for childhood trauma because of their serious adverse effects.

Antidepressants

139. The following antidepressants have been approved for the following pediatric

uses:

Approved IApproved
Brand Name Generic Name Use Ages

Sinequan doxepin
Obsessive

12+
Anafranil clomipramine 10+
Luvox Fluvoxamine

Compulsive 8+
Zoloft sertraline Disorder

Tofranil imiprimine (OCD) 6+

DepreSSion,
Prozac fluoxetine OCD 7+

140. Meta-analyses of controlled clinical trials of antidepressants submitted to the

FDA by Sponsors show 75 percent to 82 percent afthe response, as measured by

clinician-rated scales, was duplicated by placebo.
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141. Fifty Seven percent of the antidepressant controlled clinical trials submitted

to the FDA failed to show a difference between the drug and placebo.

142. Only three of fifteen (20%) published and unpublished controlled pediatric

trials of the newer selective serotonin reuptake inhibitor (SSRl) antidepressants found the

drugs more effective than placebo in depressed children and no trial found the drugs

better as measured by the children themselves or their parents observing them.

143. There is no evidence that the older tricyclics or monoamine oxidase inhibitor

(MAO) antidepressants have any efficacy with depressed youths.

144. Tricyclic antidepressants commonly produce abnormalities in cardiovascular

function in children and there are reports of cardiac arrest and death in children.

145. Short term desirable observed effects of the newer SSRl antidepressants at

usual doses include:

(a) Increased physical activity,

(b) Elevated mood,

(c) Decreased expressions of distress, such as crying and hopelessness, and

(d) Improved sleep and appetite.

146. Undesirable observed behavioral effects of antidepressants include:

(a) Anxiety and nervousness,

(b) Agitation and irritability,

(c) Mood swings, including mania,

(d) Aggressiveness,

(e) Thoughts of suicide,
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(I) Apathy, and

(g) Attempted and actual suicide.

147. Undesirable observed physical effects of antidepressants include:

(a) Gastrointestinal distress (nausea, vomiting, stomach pain, constipation,

diarrhea),

(b) Sexual problems (loss of libido, anorgasmia, erectile dysfunction),

(c) Sleep disruption (insomnia, hypersomnia), which is particularly

problematic in growing children,

(d) Urinary retention,

(e) Blurred vision,

(I) Weight gain, and

(g) Headaches and dizziness.

148. The following six clusters of withdrawal effects are likely upon abrupt

discontinuation of SSRls:

(a) Neurosensory effects (vertigo, tingling and burning),

(b) Neuromotor effects (tremor, spasms, visual changes),

(c) Gastrointestinal effects (nausea, vomiting, diarrhea, weight loss),

(d) Neuropsychiatric effects (anxiety, depression, crying spells, irritability,

suicidal thinking),

(e) Vasomotor effects (heavy sweating, flushing), and

(I) Insomnia, vivid dreaming and fatigue.
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149. In 2005, the FDA issued a "Black Box" warning of sulcidality in children and

adolescents, that "Antidepressants increased the risk of suicidal thinking and behavior

(suicidality). "

150. Later, in 2007, the FDA extended the warning on suicidality to young adults,

aged eighteen to twenty-four.

151. The FDA also warns of increased agitation, irritability, aggression,

worsening anxiety, severe restlessness, and other unusual behaviors in youth treated with

antidepressants.

152. Continuing to expose children and youth to antidepressant drugs who

experience Doe or more of the negative effects they induce. such as mania, is likely to

lead to those effects being misinterpreted as psychiatric symptoms and increases in

dosage or additional drugs when reducing or stopping the offending drug would solve the

problem.

Stimulants

153. The following stimulants have been approved for the following pediatric

""VVCL.:.\v.::a"ns"'e::- -tI"'isc=d"e"xt"-ro"'a"'m"'n=pth"et"'a"-m"'i'"n"e-iADHD

uses:

Brand Nam9 Generic Name

Adderal, Adderall XR, Dexedrine, amphetamine,
Dextrostat dextroamohetamine
Concerta, Ritalin, Daytrana,
Metadate Focalin Focalin Xr methvlohenidate

Strattera (inaccurately portrayed
as a non-stimulant atomoxetine

Approvea
Use

ADHD
narcoleosv

Approvea
Ages

3+

6+
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154. The drugs set forth in the preceding paragraph show minimal, if any, long-

term efficacy in general life domains of the child, including social and academic success.

155. The following are short-term observed desirable effects of the stimulants at

usual doses:

(a) Increase alertness and wakefulness,

(b) Induce sense of well-being (euphoria), and

(c) Improve accuracy on brief physical and mental tasks.

156. The following are effects of the stimulants regularly misconstrued as

therapeutic in children and youth by physicians and other practitioners:

(e) Increased repetitive, persistent behavior,

(f) Decreased exploration and social behavior, and

(g) Increased compliance with the wishes of adults in their lives.

157. The following are undesirable observed behavioral effects of stimulants:

(a) Nervousness and restlessness,

(b) Insomnia,

(c) Agitation,

(d) Depression, including a "zombie tl look,

(e) Irritability and aggression,

(I) Psychological dependence, and

(g) Mania and psychosis.

158. The following are undesirable observed physical effects of stimulants:

(a) Increased blood pressure,
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(b) Dizziness and headaches,

(c) Palpitations,

(d) Stomach cramps and nausea,

(e) Appetite and weight loss,

(f) Stunted growth, including stunted brain growth,

(g) Brain atrophy, and

(h) Cardiac arrest.

159. Decreases in growth caused by the stimulants given to children and youth are

a result of their impact on the brain and pituitary gland disrupting growth hormone

production and average three fourths of an inch and 6 pounds without evidence the

affected children and youth will make up the stunted growth even after stopping the

stimulant(s).

160. Brain dysfunctions induced by stimulants include the following:

(a) Reduced blood flow,

(b) Reduced Oxygen supply,

(c) Reduced energy utilization,

(d) Persistent biochemical imbalances,

(e) Persistent sensitization (increased reactivity to stimulants),

(f) Permanent distortion of brain cell structure and function,

(g) Brain cell death and tissue shrinkage,

(h) Cytotoxicity with chromosomal abnormalities,

(i) Dependence and tolerance, and
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G) Withdrawal symptoms.

161. Stimulants prescribed to children and youth are Drug Enforcement

Administration nSchedule II Drugs," which means they result in tolerance. dependence

and abuse.

162. Children and youth prescribed stimulants are more prone to use cocaine and

smoke cigarettes as young adults than children and youth who were not prescribed

stimulants.

163. In 2006, the FDA warned that stimulants increase aggression, mania and/or

psychotic symptoms, including hallucinations, as well as the risk of sudden death in

patients with heart problems.

164. The FDA "black box" warning for Adderall (amphetamine and

dextroamphetamine), which is prescribed to millions of American children and youth,

reads: "Amphetamines have a high potential for abuse. Administration of amphetamines

for prolonged periods oftime may lead to drug dependence. II The warning also states:

"Misuse of amphetamines may cause sudden death and serious cardiovascular adverse

events. It

165. The Surgeon General's Report on Mental Health, the American

Psychological Association report, and a review of over 2,200 studies of ADHD treatment

did not find these drugs safe or effective.

AnticoDvulstants Promoted as "Mood Stabilizers"

166. Starting in the 1980s and 1990s, due to dissatisfaction with lithium and

neuroleptics in the treatment of people diagnosed with Bipolar Disorder, previously

Amended Complaint -37-

S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 37



known as Manic Depressive Illness, drug companies promoted the use of anticonvulsants,

Le" antiepileptics and antiseizure drugs, for people diagnosed with Bipolar Disorder.

167. None of these drugs, including Tegretol, Equetro, Neurontin, Lamictal,

Depakene, Depakote, Topamax, Trileptal, and Gabitril have been approved for pediatric

psychiatric indications.

168. The following anticonvulsants carry the following FDA "Black Box

Warnings:"

Liver toxicity (particularly for under 2 yrs of age); birth defects;
Depakote pancreatitis

Aplastic anemia and agranulycytosis Tegretol (severe reduction in
Te~retol white blood cells)

Serious rash requiring hospitalization; Stevens-Johnson Syndrome
for children under 16 yrs of age (fatal sores on mucuous

Lamictal membraoes of mouth, nose, eves and ~enitals)

All Anticonvulsants Suicidal ideation and behavior

169. A 40-fold increase in the diagnosis of pediatric Bipolar Disorder over ten

years ensued upon the promotion of these drugs for children and youth given this

diagnosis.

170. No studies confirm the efficacy and safety of anticonvulsants to treat children

diagnosed with Bipolar Disorder.

171. No anticonvulsant has been approved by the FDA for aoy psychiatric

indication in children or youth.

172. More than ninety percent of children diagnosed with Bipolar Disorder

receive more than one psychoactive drug and less than forty percent receive any

psychotherapy.

--
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173. In an open trial oflithium divalproex or carbamezepine (Tegretol) on youth,

in which fifty eight percent received at least one of the two drugs plus a stimulant, an

atypical neuroleptic, or an antidepressant, half of all participants did not respond to the

drug treatment.

174. In 2008, the FDA warned that anticonvulsants double the risk of suicidal

behavior or ideation, with treatment of epilepsy having the highest risk, ruling out

psychiatric status as a confounding variable.

175. Desired observed behavioral effects of anticonvulsants include:

(a) Reducing aggression and impulsivity, and

(b) Calming restlessness and excitability.

176. Undesired observed behavioral effects of anticonvulsants include:

(a) Depression and sedation,

(b) Hostility and irritability,

(c) Aggression and violence,

(d) Anxiety and nervousness,

(e) Hyperactivity,

(f) Abnormal thinking,

(g) Confusion and amnesia,

(h) Slurred speech, and

(i) Sedation and sleepiness.

177. Undesired observed physical effects of anticonvulsants include:

(a) Nausea and dizziness,
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(b) Vomiting and abdominal pain,

(c) Headaches and tremors,

(d) Fatal skin rashes,

(e) Hypothyroidism,

(I) Blood disorders,

(g) Pancreatitis, liver disease,

(h) Birth defects and menstrual irregularities, and

(i) Withdrawal seizures.

Evidence-Based, Less Intrusive Alternatives: Psychosocial
Interventions

178. "Evidence-Based Practice" in medicine and in non-medical helping

professions has been defined as the integration of best research evidence, clinical

.udgment, and client preferences and values.

179. Criteria for judging an intervention as an Evidence-Based Practice, such as

the administration of psychotropic medication to children and youth, include (a) whether

it has a sound theoretical basis, (b) whether it carries a low risk of harm or an acceptable

risk-benefit ratio, (c) whether unbiased research supporting the intervention exists, and

(d) whether the decision maker, the child or youth and/or the child or youth's parent(s) or

guardian concur.

180. In order for an intervention such as the administration of a psychotropic

drug(s) to a child or youth to be an Evidence Based Practice, the intervention must have
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at least some unbiased observations or tests supporting its usefulness with the particular

problem sought to be addressed, taking into account the age of the child or youth.

181. Published evidence is often biased, being influenced by funding sources,

researcher biases and conventional wisdom.

182. Children and youth experience loss and trauma because of disrupted

attachments to biological parents, which result in foster care placements, both with and

without termination of parental rights.

183. Children and youth experience emotional disruption from out-of-home

placement, from their difficulty adjusting to a foster care setting, from experiencing

unsettling multiple foster care placements, multiple school placements, high turnover of

caregivers, as well as sometimes experiencing more trauma and physical and or sexual

abuse in foster carel step families, group homes, residential treatment centers, and

psychiatric hospitals.

184. The brains of children develop in a socially dependent manner, through

secure attachments and consistent, competent adults attuned to the needs ofthe children.

185. Trauma, abuse and neglect disrupt a child's ability to form secure

attachments, impair brain development and regulation, make self-control difficult and

alter the child's identity and sense of self.

186. The ability to function well despite living or having lived in such adversity

rests mainly on normal cognitive development and involvement from a caring, competent

adult.
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187. Risk and protective factors in the foster child, foster-families, agencies, and

birth family all interact to produce positive or negative spirals of development.

188. Understanding children and youth's resilience helps create interventions that

produce positive turning points in children and youth1s lives.

189. Three key elements in positive outcomes for children and youth in foster care

settings are (a) having a secure base where the child or youth has a strengthening sense of

security and is able to use his or her foster parents as a secure base, (b) having a sense of

permanence where the foster placement is stable and foster-parents offer family

membership, and (c) positive social functioning in which the child or youth is functioning

well in school and with peers.

190. Treatment goals for children and youth in state custody who are presenting

emotional and/or behavioral problems should be to (a) enhance their sense of personal

control and self-efficacy, (b) maintain an adequate level of functioning, and (c) increase

their ability to master, rather than avoid, experiences that trigger intrusive re-

experiencing, numbing, or hyper-arousal sensations.

191. Proven effective alternatives to psychotropic medication for children's

emotional and/or behavioral problems include (a) consistent, structured, supportive adult

supervision, (b) opportunities for self-expression and physical activity to give them a

sense of mastery over their minds and bodies, and (c) a stable academic environment

where they master both academic basics and more complicated academic material.

192. Activities that have been proven helpful for children's emotional and/or

behavioral problems include (a) teaching problem solving and pro-social skills, (b)
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modeling appropriate behaviors, (c) teaching self-management, and (d) helping them

learn to comply and follow rules.

193. Interactions that have been shown to be helpful for children's emotional

andlor behavioral problems include (a) desensitizing hyper-reactivity, (b) promoting self-

calming and modulation of arousal states, (c) organizing sustained attention, and (d)

facilitating organized, purposeful activity.

194. Interventions that have been shown helpful for children and youth's

emotional andlor behavioral problems include (a) Cognitive-Behavioral Therapy (CBT),

(b) Interpersonal Psychotherapy, (c) Psychodynamic Psychotherapy, (d)Exposure-based

Contingency Management, and (e) Problem-solving and Coping-Skills Training.

195. In addition to the foregoing, family-based behavioral interventions are

effective for children and youth diagnosed with disruptive and conduct disorders.

196. In addition to the foregoing, effective psychosocial treatments shown to be

helpful for children diagnosed with Bipolar Disorder and Schizophrenia include (a) Child

and Family Focused CBT, combined with interpersonal and "social rhythm" therapy to

stabilize mood, activities and sleep, and (b) Community support and social acceptance

through day programs and sports and cultural activities.

197. Effective parenting is the most powerful way to reduce child and youth

problem behaviors.

198. The types of parenting training with the strongest evidence base are (a)

Parent Management Training (PMT), (b) Problem-Solving Skills Training (PSST), (c)

Brief Strategic Family Therapy (BSFT), and (d) Functional Family Therapy (FFT).
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199. The goals of such parent training include Ca) promoting parent competencies

and strengthening parent-child bonds, (b) increased consistency, predictability and

fairness of parents, and Cc) producing positive behavior change in their children.

200. Maltreatment is consistently linked to aggressive behavior in children and

youth, with a history of trauma being virtually universal in youth diagnosed with conduct

disorders.

20 I. Children and youth in foster care have socio-emotional problems tluee to ten

times more often than other children and youth.

202. Coercive interactions, including the administration ofpsychotropic drugs,

result in escalation of aggressive behaviors.

203. A large evidence base supports behavioral interventions for children

diagnosed with ADHD, including parenting training, social skills training and school-

based services, resulting in at least as positive outcomes as stimulant medications without

the attendant physical harm.

204. Mentoring has been defined as a relatively long term, non-expert relationship

between a child and non-parental adult, based on acceptance and support, aiming to foster

the child's potential, where change is a desired but not predetermined goal.

205. Strong evidence exists that mentaring programs have significant positive

effects, with community-based programs being more effective than school based

programs.

206. Mentoring in foster care settings has been found particularly helpful for

children and youth placed in foster homes by providing a bridge to employment and
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higher education and helping with problems surrounding transitioning from foster care,

sometimes called "aging out."

207. Factors found to be important in mentoring children and youth in foster care

include (a) frequent contacts, (b) emotional closeness, also called "attunement," (c)

relatively long duration, (d) structured activities, and (e) ongoing training for the mentors.

208. Sensitive mentoring has been found to increase self-esteem and well-being,

reduce aggression, and open new relationships beyond the foster care system,

significantly reducing negative outcomes as youth uage out" of the foster care system.

209. Mentoring also reduces the likelihood of children and youth in foster care

committing violent offences through "having someone to count on when needed," which

softens the impact of trauma.

210. Medicalizing children and youth's distress and disability is part of

mainstream mental health practice, defining their distress and disability as disorders or

diseases, and managing them with medical means, pathologizing their behavior and

ignoring the context of their experiences leading to the problem behavior.

211. Understanding rather than diagnosing, changes the meaning of distressing

behaviors and can lead practitioners to adopt less harmful and more helpful interventions.

"CriticalTbink Rx" Specifications

212. The Critical ThinkRx program specifies that certain questions should be

considered before a legitimate determination to authorize the administration of

psychotropic medication to children and youth can be made.
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213. The Critical ThinkRx Program specifies that the following questions should

be asked and answered about the child or youth to whom the administration of

psychotropic drugs is contemplated:

Ca) What are the client's symptoms or observed behaviors of concern, who

has observed them?

(b) Has the client experienced any fecent or chronic life events or stressors

that may contribute to the problems?

(c) Could any of the client's problems be caused by a current medication?

(d) Does the client's psychiatric diagnosis truly reflect the client's

problems? Is the diagnosis useful to plan for interventions with this client?

(e) What interventions have been tried to address client's problems? By

whom, and with what results?

(I) Are alternative interventions available to address the client's problems?

Why have they not yet been tried?

(g) Why is medication being prescribed for this client? What other

medication has been prescribed currently or in the past?

(h) How long before we see improvements? How will the improvements be

measured?

Ci) How long will the patient be on the medication? How will a decision to

stop be made?

G) If client is a minor, is the medication designed to benefit the child, or

the child's caregivers?
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214. The Critical ThinkRx Program specifies that the following questions should

be asked and answered about psychotropic medication proposed for administration to a

child or youth:

(a) Why is this particular medication prescribed for this client?

(b) How lon.g has it been on the market? Is it FDA-approved for use in

children? Are there any FDA "black box" warnings about this medication?

(c) What is known about the helpfulness of this medication with other

children with similar conditions? Have any studies about this drug been evaluated

by the professionals working with this child? Is there scientific support for this

medication's helpfulness with other children with similar conditions?

(d) How much scientific evidence exists to support the safety and efficacy

of this drug with children, whether used alone or in combination with other

psychotropic medications?

(e) What is the recommended dosage? How often will the medication be

taken? Who will administer it?

(f) Has this medication been shown to induce tolerance and/or dependence?

What withdrawal effects may be expected when it is discontinued?

(g) Do any laboratory tests need to be done before, during, or after use of

this medication?

(h) Are there other medications or foods the child should avoid while on

this medication?

(i) What are the potential positive and adverse effects of this medication?
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G) How long will the effects of the medication be monitored? By whom,

how, and how often? Where will the effects be documented? What should be done

if a problem develops?

(k) How will the use of medication impact other interventions being

provided?

(I) How much does this medication cost? Who is paying for it? Are there

cheaper, safer, generic versions of this medication?

215. The Critical ThinkRx Program specifies that the following questions should

be asked and answered about the prescriber who is proposing that the administration of

psychotropic medication to a child or youth be authorized:

(a) What is the experience of the physician prescribing the medication?

(b) Would you consider the physician's prescribing habits cautious and

conservative?

(c) Does this physician have any financial relationships with

pharmaceutical companies? Have these been disclosed to patients?

(d) Have all the risks and benefits of this medication, and those of

alternative interventions, been evaluated and discussed by the physician with t~e

client or the client's family?

(e) Is there an adequate monitoring schedule and follow-up in place?

(I) Do I or my client/client's family have the opportunity to speak regularly

with the physician and other healthcare providers about the medication's effects?

Should my feedback be expressed in writing?
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216. The Critical ThinkRx Program specifies that the following questions should

be asked and answered by the decision maker, termed tltherapist,r' when considering

whether to authorize the administration ofpsychotropic medication to children and youth

or youth:

(a) Has a comprehensive assessment (e.g.• biopsychosocial, holistic,

integral) been conducted? Does it offer plausible reasons for the client's

problems?

(b) Are there other explanations for the client's behavior?

(c) Am I familiar with all the risks and benefits of this medication, as well

as those of alternate interventions? Have I discussed them with the client/client's

family?

(d) Do I know how the client/client's family feel about the use of

medication?

(e) What is my role and has it been clearly delineated with all other

providers?

(I) Has the client/client's family been provided with all the information

necessary to provide informed consent? Do they understand their choices?

(g) Do I feel confident that I can recognize the effects, adverse or

otherwise, of this medication on my client? How should I record my observations?

(h) WillI be able to educate my client about these effects so helshe can

raise concerns with the prescribing physician?

(i) What alternative services/interventions does this family need or want?
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Ul Can I provide these or help them obtain access?

217. The Critical ThinkRx Program specifies that children and youth not be

administered psychotropic drugs unless and until,

(i) Evidence-based psychosocial interventions have been exhausted,

(ii) Rationally anticipated benefits outweigh the risks,

(iii) The person or entity authorizing administration of the drug(s) is fully

infonned, and

(iv) Close monitoring of and appropriate responses to, treatment emergent

effects are in place.

DEFENDANTS' AUTHORIZING AND PAYING FOR THE ADMINISTRATION OF
PSYCHOTROPIC DRUGS TO CHILDREN AND YOUTH IS ILL-INFORMED AND

EXTREMELY HARMFUL

218. The Defendantst practice of authorizing and paying for the administration of

psychotropic drugs to children and youth far exceeds evidence of safety and

effectiveness.

219. Defendants l reliance on prescribers in authorizing and paying for the

administration of psychotropic drugs to Alaskan children and youth is improper,

constituting a violation of their right to competent and informed decision making by

Defendants.

220. Competent and informed decisions regarding the administration of or

payment for psychotropic drugs to children and youth and informed consent, include, at a

minimum, consideration of:
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Ca) the child or youth's diagnosis and prognosis, or their predominant

symptoms, with and without the medication;

(b) the proposed medication, its purpose, the method of its administration,

the recommended ranges of dosages, possible side effects and benefits, ways to

treat side effects, and risks of other conditions, such as Tardive Dyskinesia;

Cc) the child's history, including medication history and previous side

effects from medication;

(d) interactions with other drugs, including over-the-counter drugs. street

drugs, and alcohol; and

(e) alternative treatments and their risks, side effects, and benefits,

including the risks ofnontreatment.

221. Defendantst authorization and payment for the administration ofpsychotropic

drugs to Alaskan children and youth is not based on competent and knowledgeable

decision making and informed consent.

222. Defendants' authorization and payment for the administration of psychotropic

drugs to Alaskan children and youth is rarely in the best interest ofthe child or youth.

223. Defendants' authorization and payment for the administration of psychotropic

drugs to Alaskan children and youth is often to suppress their negative emotions leading

to disruptive actions- especially under stressful conditions that tax the child or youth's

adaptive capacities.

224. Children and youth are commonly administered psychotropic medication to

suppress impulsive aggression.
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225. Defendants' authorization and payment for the administration of psychotropic

drugs to Alaskan children and youth is often for the convenience of the adult or adults in

the child's or youth's life.

226. Defendants' authorization and payment for the administration ofpsychotropic

drugs to Alaskan children and youth is rarely, if ever, based on a valid assessment of the

potential benefits and risk of harm.

227. Defendantsl authorization and payment for the administration of psychotropic

drugs to Alaskan children and youth rarely, if ever, occurs after the less intrusive

evidence-based psychosocial interventions set forth in the above section on Evidence-

Based, Less Intrusive Alternatives: Psychosocial Intervention have been tried, let alone

exhausted.

228. Defendants' authorization and payment for the administration ofpsychotropic

drugs to Alaskan children and youth always, or almost always, occurs without close

monitoring of, and appropriate means of responding to, treatment emergent effects being

in place.

229. From April!, 2007, through June 30, 2007, at least 1,033 Alaskan children

and youth under the age of 18 receiving Medicaid benefits were prescribed second-

generation neuroleptics.

230. From April!, 2007, through June 30, 2007, at least 1,578 Alaskan children

and youth under the age of 18 receiving Medicaid benefits were prescribed stimulants.
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231. From April 1,2007, through June 30, 2007, at least 293 Alaskan children and

youth under the age of 18 receiving Medicaid benefits were prescribed supposedly 000-

stimulant drugs such as atomoxetine hydrochloride (Strattera).

232. From April 1,2007, through June 30, 2007, at least 871 Alaskan children and

youth under the age of 18 receiving Medicaid benefits were prescribed antidepressants.

233. From April I, 2007, through June 30, 2007, at least 15 Alaskan children and

youth under the age of 18 receiving Medicaid benefits were prescribed first-generation

neuroleptics.

234. From April I, 2007, through June 30, 2007, at least 723 Alaskan children and

youth under the age of 18 receiving Medicaid benefits were prescribed anticonvulsants

marketed as mood stabilizers.

235. From April 1,2007, through June 30, 2007, at least 470 Alaskan children and

youth under the age of 18 receiving Medicaid benefits were prescribed noradrenergic

agonists, most likely Clonidine to counteract problems caused by the administration of

neuroleptics.

PRAYER FOR RELIEF

WHEREFORE, Plaintiff, the Law Project for Psychiatric Rights, an Alaska non-

profit corporation, requests the Court enter the following relief:

A. Issue a declaratory judgment that Alaskan children and youth have the

constitutional and statutory right not to be administered psychotropic drugs unless and

until,

(i) evidence based psychosocial interventions have been exhausted,

Amended Complaint -53-

S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 53



(ii) rationally anticipated benefits of psychotropic drug treatment
outweigh the risks,

(iii) the person or entity authorizing administration of the drug(s) is fully
informed of the risks and potential benefits, and

(iv) close monitoring of, and appropriate means of responding to,
treatment emergent effects are in place.

B. Permanently enjoin the defendants and their successors from authorizing or

paying for the administration ofpsychotropic drugs to Alaskan children and youth

without conformance with Paragraph A of this prayer for relief.

C. Order that

(i) all children and youth in state custody currently being administered
psychotropic drugs, and

(ii) all children and youth to whom the state of Alaska currently pays for the
administration of psychotropic drugs

be reassessed in aCl.:ordance. and brought into compliance, with the specifications of

Critical ThinkRx, as set forth above, by a contractor knowledgeable of the Critical

ThinkRx curriculum and ready, willing and able to implement the Critical ThinkRx

specifications, appointed and monitored by the Court, or a Special Master to be paid for

by the State, appointed for that purpose.

D. Award Plaintiff costs and attorney's fees.

E. Such other relief as the court finds just in the premises.

DATED: September 29, 2008.
.ghts l an Alaskan non-
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PsychRights
LAW PROJECT FOR

PSYCHIATRIC RIGHTS,INC.
406 G Street, Suite 206, Anchorage, Alaska 99501

(901)274-7686 Phone - (907) 274-9493 Fax
http://psychrights.org

December 10,2004

Sen. Fred Dyson
10928 Eagle River Road Suite 238
Eagle River, AK 99577
(fax) 694-1015

State Capitol, Room 121
Juneau,AK 99801-1182

Rep. Peggy Wilson
PO Box 109
Wrangell, AK 99929
(fax) 907-874-3055

State Capitol, Room 104
Juneau,AK 99801-1182

Re: Office of Children's Services

Dear Sen. Dyson and Rep. Wilson:

I am pleased you are holding hearings regarding the Office of Children's Services and the
difficulties they have had in protecting children it seems they should have known about and
acted upon. I am, however, writing about another side of the coin. That is there is increasing
reason to believe children taken into custody by oes are being abused on a large scale.

More specifically, it is almost certain a large number of children in state custody are on
dangerous psychotropic medications that have never been approved for children. The worst of
these drugs are the neuroleptics, including the newer ones, calJed "atypicals." These medications
make it tremendously difficult for children to ever grow up to lead normal lives. They cause,
rather than cure mental illness. It has been found in other states that a large number of children
in foster care or outright custody are on these drugs in order to control their behavior, rather than
help them deal with the traumas in their lives that are causing the troubling be~;avior.

When a psychiatrist employed by the State of Pennsylvania to perform a quality
assurance review there defied his orders not to look into prescribing practices, he was fired. He
found four children had died from improper prescribing. Thousands more are merely being
harmed for life. There is every reason to believe the same thing is happening to Alaska kids.

In my view, your committee should look into the situation here in Alaska. Please feel
free to contact me with any questions or if you would like further information.

Yours truly,

Commissioner Joel Gilbertson
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X-Mailer: QUALCOMM Windows Eudora Version 7.0.1.0
Date: Fri, 09 Mar 200717:13:32 -0900
To: Representative_Jay_Ramras@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Nancy_Dahlstrom@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_John_Coghill@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Bob_Lynn@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Ralph_Samuels@legis.state.ak.us,
Representativ€_Max_Gruenberg@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Lindsey_Holmes@legis.state.ak.us
From: Jim Gottstein <jim.gottstein@psychrighls.org>
Subject: Follow-Up: Over Drugging of Kids in State Custody
Cc: sarah_palin@gov.state.ak.us,Senator_Bettye_Davis@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Peggy_Wilson@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Bob_Roses@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Sharon_Cissna@legis.state.sk.us,
Representative_Anna_Fairciough@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Mark_Neuman@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Berta_Gardner@legis.state.ak.us,
Senator_Joe_Thomas@legis.state.ak.us,
Senator_John_Cowdery@legis.state.ak.us,
Senator_Kim_Elton@legis.state.ak.us,
Senator_Fred_Dyson@legis.state.ak.us,
Senator_Johnny_Ellis@legis.state.ak.us,"Demer, Lisa" <LDemer@adn.com>,
"Bruce Whittington" <BruceWhittington@PsychRights.Org>,
"jeff jessee-mhta.revenue.state.ak. us" <jeffjessee@mhta.revenue.state.ak.us>,
"OJRICCIO-aol.com" <OJRICC IO@aol.com>,lIoydross1@worldnet.att.net,
krcffrem@pro-ns.net,ARONWOLF@aol.com,doolttle@ptialaska.net,
Jim Gottstein <jim.gottstein@psychrights.org>

Dear Members of the House Judiciary Committee:

When I testified to the committee on February 8th, one of the things I reported on was the
pervasive over-drugging of kids in state custody with psychiatric drugs not approved for
children and in combinations that had never even been studied. Representative Coghill
challenged me on whether I had any proof and I informed the committee that as far as I knew
the State is not keeping track of this extremely important information, but that based on what is
being found in other states that have looked into it, approximately 70% of the children in state
custody are on psychiatric drugs, many in especially harmful combinations. There is every
reason to believe the same is happening to Alaska kids. I wrote to Senator Dyson and
Repre::;entativa Wilson about this issue in December of 2004.
http://psychrighls.org/States/Alaska/Kids/OCSHearingltr.pQf

Thus, this is not a new issue about a problem negatively impacting many Alaskan children, but
it is being ignored as far as I can tell. There is an article today by Evelyn Pringle at
ht\pJLwwwJ,riiY!lL,,-a_Q.9setUjlmentgol1J!articles/00660Izyprexa-meq!QllJ-cQsts)llml , which
includes a description of some of what is happening in other states. I have reproduced a
couple of passages from the article below:

In the summer of 2002, psychiatrist, Dr Kruszewski, was employed with the
Pennsylvania Department of Public Welfare, and charged with reviewing psychiatric
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care provided by state-funded agencies to identify waste, fraud, and abuse. He was
also responsible for reviewing the deaths of individuals in state care who died
under suspicious circumstances in facilities inside and outside of Pennsylvania.
Early in his investigation, Dr Kruszewski noticed that almost all of the patients
under state care were on drug cocktails consisting of antipsychotics,
antidepressants, and anticonvulsants. The populations he found drugged most
often, he said, were children in state care, the disabled, people in state prisons, and
children in the juvenile justice system.

For instance, he says, Neurontin was only approved for controlling seizures, but
"was being prescribed for anxiety, social phobia, PTSD, oppositional defiant
behavior, and attention deficit disorder with no evidence to support these uses."
When he informed his superiors about the high rate of off-label prescribing and
warned about the risk of liability to the state of Pennsylvania if it continued, he was
told, "it is none of your business."
In June 2003, Dr Kruszewski inspected a facility in Oklahoma that housed children
from Pennsylvania after an unexpected death of a child, and found children were
being overmedicated and housed in deplorable living conditions, in addition to
being sexually and physically abused by staff and kept in unnecessary restraints
and seclusion.
In a report, Dr Kruszewski recommended removing the children from the facility, "in
order to protect other innocent individuals from morbid and mortal consequences of
severe over-medication, including chemical restraints; emotional, physical and
sexual abuse; seclusion; and dirty and inadequate living conditions."
A day later, Dr Kruszewski was accused of "trying to dig up dirt," and was
sUbsequently fired in July 2004, because he refused to keep qUiet and accept that it
was none of his business, hid says.

• • •

TMAP required doctors to prescribe atypicals rather than the older, less expensive
antipsychotics. "The plan," Mr Jones explains, "was part of a larger scheme designed to
infiltrate public institutions to influence prescribing practices in which drug companies bought
the opinions of a few key doctors and state policymakers, and opened the door for spending
billions oftax dollars on dangerous drugs."

The Texas lawsuit describes exactly how the TMAP preferred drug list was developed in
Texas in 1997, and according to the complaint, Dr Shon traveled around the country at J&J's
expense to convince officials in other states to adopt the TMAP model, which is now used in
17 states.

The lawsuit says, J&J promoted Risperdal by influencing policymakers with trips, perks,
travel expenses, speaking fees and other payments and that Risperdal was recommended as
the drug of choice for children, even though it was not approved for use with children.

TMAP was highly successful in getting doctors to prescribe atypicais to kids. According
to an investigation of psychiatric drug use by Texas children on Medicaid, ACS~Heritage, a
medical consulting firm, found 19,404 teens were prescribed an antipsychotic in July or August
of 2004, with nearly 98% bein9 atypicals.

ACS also found that more than half of the doses were inappropriately high, almost half of
the prescriptions did not appear to have diagnoses warranting their use, and one~third of the
children were on two or more drugs.

The Texas lawsuit alleges that J&J concealed Risperdal's link to hyperglycemia, stroke,
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and renal failure, to qualify for reimbursement under Medicaid, and that Texas seeks to
recover money paid to purchase the drug for off-label uses and the cost of medical cafe for the
people injured by Risperdal.

It is my hope Alaska will voluntarily do something about the serious harm it is inflicting on kids
it is taking from their families on the grounds that they are not safe, and also those it is having
locked up and drugged in what are called "Residential Treatment Facilities."

Note New E-mail Address

James 8. (Jim) Gottstein, Esq.

Law Project for Psychiatric Rights
406 G Street, Suite 206
Anchorage, Alaska 99501
USA
Phone: (907) 274-7686) Fax: (907) 274-9493
jim.gottstein@psychrights.org
bttg;ilgs}'.chrights.orgl

Psych Rights ~
Law Project for

Psychiatric Rights

The Law Project for Psychiatric Rights is a public interest law firm devoted to the defense of
people facing the horrors of unwarranted forced psychiatric drugging. We are further
dedicated to exposing the truth about these drugs and the courts being misled into ordering
people to be drugged and subjected to other brain and body damaging interventions against
their will. Extensive information about this is available on our web site. hUI2:llp.sychrigbts.QIQl.
Please donate generously. Our work is fueled with yo"r IRS 501 (c) tax deductible donations.
Thank you for your ongoing help and support.
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X-Mailer: QUALCOMM Windows Eudora Version 7.0.1.0
Date: Wed, 14 Mar 200709:31 :04 -0800
To: sarah_palin@gov.state.ak.us,Representative_Jay_Ramras@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Nancy_Dahlstrom@Jegis.state.ak.us,
Representative_John_Coghill@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Bob_Lynn@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Ralph_Samuels@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Max_Gruenberg@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Lindsey_Holmes@iegis.state.ak.us,
Senato,-Bettye_Davis@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Peggy_Wilson@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Bob_Roses@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Sharon_Cissna@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Anna_Fairclough@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Mark_Neuman@legis.state.ak.us,
Representative_Berta_Gardner@legis.state.ak.us,
Senator_Joe_Thomas@legis.state.ak.us,
Senator_John_Cowdery@legis.state.ak.us,
Senator_Kim_Elton@legis.state.ak.us,
Senator_Fred_Dyson@legis.state.ak.us,
"jeff jessee-mhta. revenue.state.ak.us" <jeff_iessee@mhta.revenue.state.ak.us>,
doolttte@ptialaska.net,william_hogan@health.state.ak.us,
karleenjackson@health.state.ak.us,Stacy_Toner@health.state.ak.us
From: Jim Gottstein <jim.gottstein@psychrights.org>
SUbject: Follow-Up: Over Drugging of Kids in State Custody
Cc: "Derner, Lisa" <LDemer@adn.com>,
"Bruce Whittington" <Bruce.whittington@PsychRighrs.Org>,
"OJRICCI O-aol.com" <DJRI CCIO@aol.com>,lloydross1@worldnet.att.net,
kreffrem@pro-ns.net,ARONWOLF@aol.com,
Jim Gottstein <jim.gottstein@psychrights.org>,
Vera Sharav <veracare@ahrp.org>,
"Iist-psychrights.org" <Iist@psychrights.org>,
Senator_Johnny_Ellis@legis.state.ak.us,
"Susan Musante" <susan@soteria-alaska.com>,mgstone@arctic.net

Dear Governor Palin and other Alaska Mental Health Policy Makers,

I wrote to most of you last Friday about Alaska's over-drugging of children In state custody:

[Als far as I knew the State is not keeping track of this extremely important
information, but that based on what is being found in other states that have looked
into it, approximately 70% of the children in state c~stody are on psychiatric drugs,
many in especially harmful combinations. There is every reason to believe the
same is happening to Alaska kids. I wrote to Senator Dyson and Representative
Wilson about this issue in December of 2004.
httR:IIRsychrights.org/States/Alaska/Kids/OCSHearingltr.Rdf

Thus, this is not a new issue about a problem negatively impacting many Alaskan
children, but it is being ignored as far as I can tell.
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I included some information about what has been happening in other states, including kids
being killed by these drugs. Yesterday, as reported by the Alliance for Human Resource
Protection (AHRP) today, the AP issued a report about this problem (beiow). This is state
inflicted child abuse. It is your responsibility to investigate what the State of Alaska is
doing to children in its custody as well as in "residential treatment centers" and stop this
abuse.

The massive over-drugging of America's children is a titantic health catastrophe caused by the
government's failure to protect its most precious citizens, who rely on the adults in their lives to
shield them from harm, not inflict it upon them. Perhaps the worst of all is the State inflicting
this harm on children it has taken from their homes "for their own good."

Please correct this situation.

ALLIANCE FOR HUMAN RESEARCH PROTECTION (AHRP)
Promoting Openness, Full Disclosure, and Accountability
W'WV'I.ahro,org and http://ahro.blogspot.com

FYI

The chemical abuse of U.S. children in foster care represent the collapse of
civilized medicine.

The Associated Press report (below) provides but a glimpse into a worid of
wantonly prescribed psychotropic drugs for children.
Children are being chemically assaulted under the guise of "treatment."
Psychiatrists under the influence of drug manufacturers are misusing their
prescribing license all across the U.S when they prescribe toxic
combinations of psychotropic drugs for helpless children.

"The picture is bleak, and rooted in profound human sUffering."
That was the stinging verdict of a report on psychiatric treatment of foster
children, including the misuse of medication issued by outgoing Texas state
comptroller Carole Keeton Strayhorn in December. The report recommended
hiring a full-time medical director for foster children and requiring prior
approval for certain prescriptions.
!It!g:llwww.window.state.tx.uslsgecialmUhccfoster06

In New York--"Children who are having normal reactions to the trauma of
being separated from their families are often misdiagnosed or overdiagnosed
as suffering from psychiatric problems, and the system is too quick to
medicate," said Mike Arsham of the Child Welfare Organizing Project. '

'It's a chemical sledgehammer that makes children easier to manage."

Among the New York parents sharing that view is Carlos Boyet, who says his
son was routinely and unnecessarily medicated, at one point suffering an
overdose, while bouncing through several foster homes as a toddler.
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The boy, Jeremy, had been taken away from Boyet's ex-girlfriend; Boyet
eventually established paternity and was able to gain custody of his son,
then 6, in 2005. "It's crazy," Boyst said.

"A child is acting out because he was moved away from his parent, and
you're going to medicate him because of that? It's not right."

"There is such a lack of good psychiatric services, and you have the
pharmaceutical companies and managed care companies saying, 'Medicate,
Medicate,'" Abramovitz said. "That's all they want psychiatrists to do.
They don't pay for anything else,"

Referring collectively to child psychiatrists, he added, "We do not want to
be pill-vending machines, But the alternatives aren't there,"

Carole Keeton Strayhorn's son, the former head of the FDA, Dr, Mark
McClellan, testifies before the Senate HELP committee tomorrow about drug
safety. The FDA bears some responsibility for failing to prevent the
widespread abusive prescribing of psychotropic drug combinations for
children. Inasmuch as these drugs and drug combinations have not been tested
for safety or approved for use in children, the FDA could have but failed to
use its authority to ban their use.

ALliANCE FOR HUMAN RESEARCH PROTECTION (AHRP)
Promoting Openness, Full Disclosure, and Accountability
WWoN.ahro.ora and http://ahro.blogsDot.com

Contact: Vera Hassner Sharav
212-595-8974
veracare@ahrp.org

March 13, 2007
A Dilemma: Medications for Foster Kids
By THE ASSOCIATED PRESS
Filed at 3:51 p.m. ET

- - ----1<JEW?OHK fAPF--CoastlocoasCstaies-are wrestiTngwithhow best to treat--- - - - -- - - ­
the legions of emotionally troubled foster children in their care. Critics
contend that powerful psychiatric drugs are overused and say poor
record·keeping masks the scope of the problem.
Nationwide, there are more than 500,000 children in foster care at anyone
time, and more than half have mental illness or serious behavioral problems,
according to the Child Welfare League of America.

"The child welfare system wasn't prepared for the deluge of kids that have
mental health problems," said Dr. Chris Bellonci, a child psychiatrist in
Needham, Mass. "By default, it's become a mental health delivery system,
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and it's ill-equipped to do that."
Some states have taken broad action -- often in response to overdose
tragedies, lawsuits or damning investigations. California requires court
review of any psychotropic drug prescription for a foster child; Illinois
has designated a prominent child psychiatrist to oversee such reviews.

In other states, however, experts say the issue is not being adequately
addressed and basic data is lacking that would show the extent of medication
usage.

"It's a problem that's really ugly I and growing under a rock, and no one
wants to turn the rock over," said Dr. Michael Naylor, the psychiatrist in
charge of Illinois' review program, who recently struggled to get responses
from other states for a paper he is writing on the lopic.
Some parents and advocacy groups say child welfare authorities routinely
resort to drugs to pacify foster children without fully considering
non-medication options. Among the aggrieved parents is Sheri McMahon of
Fargo, N.D., whose son Willy was in foster care for 28 months from 2001 to
2003 because of an inspector's rUling that their home was substandard.

McMahon said Willy, now 17, had been diagnosed with multiple disorders and
was taking an antidepressant when he entered foster care. But she said that
in a residential foster-care facility, he was placed on five psychotropic
medications simultaneously -- becoming sleepy and overweight and developing
breathing difficulties.

"When he came back home, his pediatrician and psychiatrist expressed
concern about the number and doses of medications," McMahon said. "It took
many months to get them down to a level where he had a chance of attending
school regularly."

Child psychiatrists say a shortage of funds and resources complicate the
already daunting task of effectively diagnosing and treating mental illness
in foster children. One problem, Bellonci said, is a nationwide shortage of
child psychiatrists, often leaving pediatricians to handle complex
behavioral problems.

Bellonci helped Tennessee's Department of Children's Services -- the target
of a sweeping lawsuit -- overhaul its procedures for psychotropic drugs
after em investigation found that 25 percent of foster children were taking
them, often without legal consent. Tennessee's policies are now considered
among the best, encouraging expert reviews of prescriptions and urging
prescribing doctors to consull with the youth, caseworkers and the
biological and foster parents before deciding on medication.

The issue is very much alive in several other states. Among them:

--In Florida, child welfare officials will be reporting to the legislature
within weeks on the effects of a 2005 bill that tightened rules on when
foster children can be given psychotropic drugs. The law requires prior
consent of a foster child's parents or a court order before such drugs can
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be used. The bill's approval followed a report concluding that mood-altering
drugs were being prescribed to 25 percent of Florida's foster children.

--In Texas, outgoing state comptroller Carole Keeton Strayhorn issued a
stinging report in December on psychiatric treatment of foster children,
including the use of medication. "The picture is bleak, and rooted in
profound human SUffering," said the report, which recommended hiring a
full-time medical director for foster children and requiring prior approval
for certain prescriptions. Some activists say the recommendations, 48 in
all, are unlikely to be embraced by the task force studying them; state
health officials say use of psychotropic drugs for foster children is
already declining because of guidelines adopted in 2005.

--In California, Assemblywoman Noreen Evans introduced a bill last month
that would require the state to collect the necessary data to show whether
foster children are being overmedicated. "Many foster youth have told me
that they are given pills instead of counseling," Evans said. ''The state
doesn't track who receives prescriptions and why. We need to do that in
order to prevent abuses."

Oversight and data collection is complicated in California because the
medication regulations are handled by county courts. Dr. George Fouras, a
psychiatrist hired to review foster-care prescriptions for San Francisco
County, said the overwhelming majority of medication decisions are proper,
and he has rejected only four out of many hundreds. But he said
child-welfare systems nationwide are overloaded, sometimes tempting
authorities to look for qUick fixes instead of ensuring detailed
mental-health evaluations.

--In New York City, the public advocate - who serves in a watchdog role-­
asked child welfare officials three years ago for data on the use of
psychotropic drugs in the foster care system. The data is still not
available, although Assistant Commissioner Angel Mendoza of the city's
Administration for Children's Services said a database should be ready
later this year.

Mendoza said his agency has strict procedures governing the use of powerful
medications; activists nonetheless worry that they are used too often.
"Children who are having normal reactions to the trauma of being separated
from their families are often misdiagnosed or overdiagnosed as suffering
from psychiatric problems, and the system is too quick to medicate," said
Mike Arsham of the Child Welfare Organizing Project. "It's a chemical
sledgehammer that makes children easier to manage,"

,Among the New York parents sharing that view is Carlos Boyet, who says his
son was routinely and unnecessarily medicated, at one point suffering an
overdose, while bouncing through several foster homes as a toddler.

The boy, Jeremy, had been taken away from Boyet's ex-girlfriend; Boyet
eventually established paternity and was able to gain custody of his son,
then 6, in 2005. "It's crazy," Boyet said. "A child is acting out because
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he was moved away from his parent, and you're going to medicate him because
of that? It's not right."

Some child psychiatrists are concerned about a possible overreaction against
the use of psychotropic drugs, saying many foster children genuinely need
them. However, leading psychiatrists acknowledge the many hurdles to coming
up with thorough, thoughtful diagnoses for children who have been wrested
from their own families, often shift through mUltiple foster homes and
perhaps have no appropriate blood relative with whom to consult regarding
treatment.

"More limes than not, kids do not get a really adequate psychiatric
evaluation," said Dr. Robert Abramovitz of the New York-based Jewish Board
of Family and Children's Services.

"There is such a lack of good psychiatric services, and you have the
pharmaceutical companies and managed care companies saying, 'Medicate,
Medicate,''' Abramovitz said. "That's all they want psychiatrists to do.
They don't pay for anything else."
Referring collectively to child psychiatrists, he added, "We do not want to
be pill-vending machines. But the alternatives aren't there."

Copyright 2007 The Associated Press <http://www.ap.org/ >

FAIR USE NOTICE: This may contain copyrighted (C) material the use of which
has not always been specifically authorized by the copyright owner. Such
material is made available for educational purposes, to advance
understanding of human rights, democracy, scientific, moral, ethical, and
social justice issues, etc. It is believed that this constitutes a 'fair
use' of any such copyrighted material as provided for in Title 17 U.S.C.
section 107 of the US Copyright Law. This material is distributed without
profit.

Note New E-mail Address

James B. (Jim) Gottstein, Esq.

Law Project for Psychiatric Rights
406 G Street, Suite 206
Anchorage, Alaska 99501
USA
Phone: (907) 274-7686) Fax: (907) 274-9493
jim.gottstein@psychrights.org
httRJIRsy_chrights.orgl

Psych Rights@
Law Project for

Psychiatric Rights
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The Law Project for Psychiatric Rights IS a public interest law firm devoted to the defense of
people facing the horrors of unwarranted forced psychiatric drugging. We are further
dedicated to exposing the truth about these drugs and the courts being misled into ordering
people to be drugged and SUbjected to other brain and body damaging interventions against
their will. Extensive information about this is available on our web site, http://psychrights.org/.
Please donate generously. Our work is fueled with your IRS 501(c) tax deductible donations.
Thank you for your ongoing help and support.
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DEPT. OF HEALTH AND SOCIALSERVICES
OFFICI' OF THE COMMISSIONER

March 22. 2007

James B. (Jim) Gottstein, Esq.
Law Project for Psychiatric Rights
406 G Street. Suite .206
Anchorage, Alaska 99501

Dear Mr. Go.ttstein:

SARAH PALIN, GOVERNOR

P.O. BOX 110601
JUNEAU, ALASKA 99.8H·0601
PHONE: (907) 46~3030
FAX: (907) 4~5-J(J5B

RECEI'JE[
f.1I~R 27 7~ri7

Thank.you for your March. 1£I.," 2007 e-mail regarding the concern that children in State custody
are being o.ve( medicated.

Indications for the use ofpsychotropic medications iIi dhildren inclildes, but is tiot limited to,
symptoms consistent with psychosi$, bipolar disorder, severe depression, Attention Defici't
Hyp.eractivity Disorder (ADHD)J and, in certain situations, 'severe beh.avioral distui:bartces..
Conc.em:should be raised when mult1ple-medi.cations .ofol')e·cIass,ate used Dr when doses are
piescnoed which are considered high for this population. Concern should ~so be raised.when it
appears that these medications are being. used for behavioral control aJone, or to 'hast,en a re,sponse
tq .jnpatien~ treatment 9r" for tbat.marter, outpatient or residential treatment.

The State ~fA1aSk~ 'iii cooperatiori ~th.First Health Corporation, 111!sfor the·past.3 ~ 'yeats
utilized a behavioral phaiinacy management system,that cOmpares eVidence-based ahd coilsensus­
based practice guidelines t6 the prescribing pi:actices of Alaskan' Clinicians. ifdiscrepancies ·.are
identified, the company uses a co-mbined approach of education and peer consultation to ·address
specific'concerns. Since this progIaIIfstarted, therena,,:e been ch~ges made fn prescribIng
practices wjth the goal being.'improved CJl(e for AJaska'-s chjld'rcfl..

The Office ofCbildren~s'Services (OeS) operates under poli"cy whicb.requiresthat'caseworkers
must staff'medication recommendations for children on their easelaads with their Supervisor. and
their regional Psychiatric Nurse prior to. giving c".ohsent to the treatmenf provider, The.OCS
Psychi2.tric NiJrses 'have weeklY contacts with the prcfessionals treating..oCS children in aciJte
care settii'lgs, i.e" North Star; Alaska:.Psychiatric Insti.tute, Provjdence DiScovery, and in.
residential treatment centets., OCS casewo.rkers and Psychiatric,Nurses aiso participate in
montbly treatment plans fot ehildren'·i-n the residential treatment facilitil;ls.

A medication can be increased or decreased for a child in custody, but cannoJ be started·without
the.OCS' knowledge arid consent.... '.. . ,
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James B. (JIDl) Gottstein, Esq.
Law Project for Psychiatric Rights
March 22, 2007
Page 2

Persons with concerns about a. specific child in State custody being over medicated should contact
the OCS at (907) 465-3191 to report the pertinent infonnation. Thank you fur bringing this
matter to my attention.

S· cerely,

Karleen JacKSon, Ph.D.
Commissioner

cc: Anna Kim, Special StaffAssistant, Office of the Governor
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Psychiatric Rights, Inc.

February4,~ (should be 2008)

Governor Sarah Palin
PO Box 110001
Juneau, AK 99811-0001

Re: Alaska's Psychiatric Drugging of Children in It's Custody

Dear Governor Palin:

I am the President and CEO of the Law Project for Psychiatric Rights (PsychRights),
founded in late 2002 to mount a strategic litigation campaign against unwarranted forced
psychiatric drugging. The reason for undertaking this mission is, contrary to the story sold by
the pharmaceutical industry, these drugs:

(I) have limited effectiveness, especially for those upon whom they are forced,
(2) are causing great harm, including reducing life spans to the point where people in the

public mental health system taking these drugs have a 25 year reduced lifespan,
(3) decrease, rather than increase public safety, and
(4) at least double the number ofpeople categorized as chronically mentally ill. I

The latter, of course, causes great unnecessary expense to the State because almost all of these
people end up as Medicaid recipients and a large percentage receive Alaska Adult Public
Assist::mce.

In 2006 PsychRights won its fust Alaska Supreme Court case, Myers v. Alaska
PSl,'chiatric Institl/te, 138 P.3d 238, in which the Court held Alaska's statutory forced psychiatric
drugging regime unconstitutional, requiring, before the State may constitutionally force adults to
take these drugs against their will it must prove the forced drugging is in the patient's best
interest and there are no less intrusive alternatives. 2

The terrible consequences of adult forced drugging is bad enough, but due to what is
probably illegal pharmaceutical company "off-label" promotion of these drugs for use on
children,3 in recent years there has been an explosion in the administration of the most powerful,
most harmful, and most debilitating psychiatric drugs to children in state custody. In connection
with this, I am enclosing a copy of Bipolar Children: Cutting Edge Controversy, Insights, and
Research, Shama Olfman, Ed., which describes the great harm being done through the 40 times
increase in the rate of diagnosing children with bipolar disorder.

It is a huge betrayal of trust for the State to take custody of children and then subject
them to such harmful, often life~ruining, drugs. They have almost always already been subjected

1 See, enclosed copy of affidavit ofRobert Whitaker.
2 PsychRights won its second Alaska Supreme Court case in 2007, Wetherhorn v. Alaska Psychiatric
Institute, 156 P.3d 371, which held involuntarily committing someone as being gravely disabled under the
definition in AS 47.30.915(7)(8) is constitutional only if construed to require a level of incapacity so
substantial the respondent is incapable of surviving safely in freedom.
3 See, enclosed article by David Healy and Joanna Le Nourv.

406 G Street, Suite 206, Anchorage, Alaska 99501 - (907) 274·7686 Phone - (907) 274-9493 Fax
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Governor Sarah Palin
February 4, 2008
Page 2

to abuse or otherwise had very difficult lives before the State assumes custody, and then saddles
them with a mental illness diagnosis and drugs them. The extent of this State inflicted child
abuse is an emergency and should be corrected immediately. 4

Children are virtually always forced to take these drugs because, with rare exception, it is
not their choice. PsychRights believes the children, themselves, have the legal right to not be
subject to such harmful treatment at the hands of the State of Alaska. We are therefore
evaluating what legal remedies might be available to them. However, instead of going down that
route, it would be my great preference to be able to work together to solve this problem. It is for
this reason that I am reaching out to you again on this issue.

Yours truly,

~

Ene. 1. Bipolar Children: Cutting Edge Controversy. Insights, and Research, Sharna Olfrnan,
Ed.

2. Pediatric bipolar disorder: An object ofstudy in the creation aran illness, by David
Healy and Joanna Le Noury

3. Affidavit of Robert Whitaker

cc Talis Colberg (w/o book)
Karleen Jackscn (w/o book)
Sen. Bettye Davis
Sen. Hollis French
Rep. Jay Ramras
Rep. Les Gara (w/o book)
Rep. Berta Gardner (w/o book)
Rep. Sharon Cissna (w/o book)
Rep. Max Gruenberg (w/o book)
William Hogan (w/o book)
Melissa Stone (w/o book)
Anna Kim

4 I know calling it State inflicted child abuse seems extreme, but is warranted.
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DEPT. OF HEALTH AND SOCIAL SERVICES
OFFICE OF THE COMMISSIONER

March 4, 2008

James B. (Jim) Gottstein, Esq.
PsychRights
406 G Street, Suite 206
Anchorage, AK 99501

Dear Mr. Gottstein:

'SARAH PALIN. GOVERNOR

P.O. BOX 110601
JUNEAU, ALASKA 99811·0601
PHONE: (907) 465-3030
FAX: (907) 465-3068

RECEIVED
MAR 0 6 Z008

Thank you for my courtesy copy of the letter and attachments you addressed to Governor Palin
regarding unwarranted psychiatric drugging and the potential over-diagnosis ofbipolar disorder
of children in the custody of Alaska's Department of Health and Social Services.

The Office of Children'. Services (OCS) policy 6.3.1 clearly states that administration of
psychotropic medication, or any drugs prescribed for mental illness of behavioral problems, falls
under the definition ofmajor medical care. 1b.is reflects the fact that administration of these
medications is viewed in a serious manner. The OCS policy further states, "Parental permission
or a court creer is also required for administration ofpsychotropic medication. Ifparental rights
have heen terminated, the assigned worker may approve administration ofpsychotropic
medication following consultation with the supeIVisor. OCS regional psychiatric -nurse and GAL.
The consultation and resulting decision should be documented in the case file,"

The policy does allow a physician or nurse to immediately administer medication if this is
necessary to preserve the life of the child or prevent significant physical harm to the child or
another person. Crisis administration ofmedications should be for a very briefduration of time
and the assigned worker should be immediately informed. The worker should notify the parent
of any medication administered on a crisis basis and the regional psychiatric nurse should review
the circwnstances regarding the administration to ensure adherence to policy.

R~gardingthe increase in the diagno'iis ofpediatric bip\:>lar disorder, I appreciate you raising this
concern. Your attached article is being fOrn'arded to the regional psychiatric nurses within the
OCS for their review and consideration.

Exhibit F, page 1 of 2
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James B. (Jim) Gottstein
PsychRights
March 4, 2008
Page 2

The OCS is currently reviewing all policies and procedures. Please be encouraged to submit any
future recommendations you might have regarding administration ofpsychotropic medications
to:

Kristie Swanson
Office ofChildren's Services
PO Box 110630
Juneau,i\1C 99811

Thank you for advocating for the rights of i\laska's children.

Sincerely,

~
Karleen WtiaCl ;:;;"_cf.D.
Commi

C'" Governor Sarah Palin
Talis Colberg, i\ttomey General
Anna ICim, Special Staff i\ssistant, Office of the Governor
William Hogan, Deputy Commissioner
Tammy Sandoval, Director, Office of Children's Services
Melissa Stone, Director, Division ofBehavioral Health

Exhibit F, page 2 of 2
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CriticalThinkRx & the Psychiatric Drugging of Children in State Custody

Subject: CriticalThinkRx & the Psychiatric Drugging of Children in State Custody
From: Jim Gottstein <jim.gottstein@psychrights.org>
Date: Wed, ll1un 2008 11:49: 14 -0800
To: wiltiam.hogan@alaska.gov
CC: melissa.stone@alaska.gov, talis.colberg@alaska.gov,1im Gottstein <jim.gottstein@psychrights.org>,
sarah.palin@alaska.gov, jeffjessee@mhta.revenue.state.aleus, tammy.sandoval@alaska.gov,
anna.kim@alaska.gov, LDemer@adn.com,nancy.gordon@alaska.gov, "Toomey, Sheila" <SToomey@adn.com>,
doolittle@acsalaska.net

Dear Mr. Hogan:

In a last-ditch effort to avoid litigation as I begin drafting my complaint seeking a declaratory judgment and
injunction against the state of Alaska for its massively harmful psychiatric drugging of children it has taken into
custody, I thought I would draw your attention to a terrific,just launched, on line program about this issue, called
Critica1111inkRx. Paid for by a grant from the Attorneys General Consumer and Prescriber Grant Program, funded
by the multi-state settlement of consumer fraud claims regarding the marketing of Neurontin®, CriticalThinkRx
was developed specifically for non-medical personnel making decisions about giving psychiatric drugs to children.
In other words, it was put together so that people such as those working for the State ofAlaska authorizing the
psychiatric drugging of children subject to State control are able to make infonned decisions.

By this e-mail, I am requesting (demanding) the State implement such a program for infonned decision making
regarding the administration of psychiatric drugs to children it has taken into custody.

Frankly, even if the State continues to ignore this problem, it might as well start looking at the CriticalThinkRx
program now because it will be faced with this same infonnation in the lawsuit. More importantly, the State should
use the infonnation to change what it is doing to the children whom it has taken into custody and subjecting to what
can quite legitimately be characterized as State-inflicted child abuse. I suspect you take umbrage at this
characterization and think it is an exaggeration, but it is an accurate one. It is a huge betrayal by the State of this
most vulnerable population and should be stopped immediately.

As you know, PsychRights has tried for years to get the State to address the problem of it's very hannful program of
psychiatrically drugging kids it has taken into custody. See, http://psycluigbts.orglStates/AlaskaIKids/Kids.htm

I hope the State will now recognize the problem and immediately take steps to correct it. Unfortunately, based on
past experience, my guess is this will not happen. Therefore, I am proceeding with developing the lawsuit unless I
hear otherwise from you and we work out a satisfactory program to address this crisis, such as one consistent with
CriticalThinkRx, that does not inflict such damage on Alaska's children for whom the State has taken responsibility.

James B. (Jim) Gottstein, Esq.
President/CEO

Law Project for Psychiatric Rights
406 G Street, Suite 206
Anchorage, Alaska 99501
USA
Phone: (907) 274-7686) Fax: (907) 274-9493
j im.gottstein[[at] ]psychrights.org
http://psych rights. org}

PsychRights®
Exhibit G, page 1 of 2
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CriticalThinkRx & the Psychiatric Drugging of Children in State CuslOdy

Law Project for
Psychiatric Rights

The Law Project for Psychiatric Rights is a public interest law firm devoted to the defense of people facing the
horrors of forced psychiatric drugging. We are further dedicated to exposing the truth about these drugs and the
courts being misled into ordering people to be drugged and subjected to other brain and body damaging
interventions against their will. Extensive information about this is available on our web site,
http://psychrlghts.orgJ. Please donate generously. Our work is fueled with your IRS 501(c) tax deductible
donations. Thank you for your ongoing help and support.

Exhibit G, page 2 of 2
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IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA
THIRD JUDICIAL DISTRICT AT ANCHORAGE

ANSWER TO AMENDED COMPLAINT FOR DECLARATORY
AND INJUNCTIVE RELIEF

Defendants, the State of Alaska; Sarah Palin, Governor of the State of

Alaska; the Department of Health and Social Services; William Hogan, in his official

capacity as Commissioner of the Department; Tammy Sandoval, in her official capacity

as Director of the Office of Children's Services' Steve McComb, in his official

capacit.y as Director of the Division of Juvenile Justice; Melissa Stone, in her official

STATE OF ALASKA, SARAH PALIN,

RECEiVe...
OCT 2 0 2008

Case No. 3AN-08-101IS CI

Plaintiff,

Defendants

vs.

LAW PROJECT FOR PSYCHIATRIC
RIGHS, an Alaskan non-profit corporation,

)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)

Governor of the State of Alaska, )
ALASKA DEPARTMETN OF HEALTH AND)
SOCIAL SERVICES, WILLIAM HOGAN, )
Commissioner, Department of Health and )
Social Services, TAMMY SANDOVAL, )
Director of the Office of Children's )
Services, STEVE McCOMB, Director of the )
Division of Juvenile Justice, MELISSA )
WITZLER STONE, Director of the Division of )
Behavioral Health, RON ADLER, )
Director/CEO of the Alaska Psychiatric )
Institute, WILLIAM STREUER, Deputy )
Commissioner and Director of the Division of )
Health Care Services, )

)
)
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capacity as Director of the Division of Behavioral Health; Ron Adler, in his official

capacity as Director of Alaska Psychiatric Institute; and William Streur, in his official

capacity as Deputy Commissioner of the Department of Health and Social Services

(hereinafter collectively "the state"), answer the plaintiffs Complaint for Declaratory

and Injunctive Relief in the above-captioned matter as follows:

INTRODUCTION

1. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied. To the extent the paragraph alleges a legal

conclusion, no response it required.

JURISDICTION AND VENUE

2. Admit.

L.

IS

3. Admit.

PARTIES

16
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4. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph.

5. Admit that Alaska is one of the states in the United States of America.

Admit that the State of Alaska pays for medically necessary medication, including

psychotropic medication. Admit that under AS 47.10 and AS 47.12, the state has the

authority, through a court order, to assume custody of children in need of aid. The

remainder of the paragraph is denied.

6. Admit that Sarah Palin is the governor of Alaska. Admit that the State of

Alaska, under the Palin Administration, pays for medically necessary medication,

including psychotropic medication. Admit that under AS 47.10, the state, under the

Palin Administration, has the authority, through a court order, to assume custody of

children in need of aid. The remainder of the paragraph is denied.

ANSWER TO AMENDED COMPLAINT
Law Project for Psychiatric Rights v. State ofAlaska, et a'.

Page 2 or22
Case No. )AN·08·10115CI
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6

7

,

7. Admit that the Department of Health and Social Services is the state

agency that assumes state custody over children. Admit that the Department of Health

and Social Services is the state Medicaid agency and is the department responsible for

paying for medically necessary medication, including psychotropic medication. Admit

that the Department of Health and Social Services is the department that oversees the

Office of Children's Services to assume custody through a court order of children need

of aid. The remainder of the paragraph is denied.

8. Admit that William Hogan is the Commissioner of the Department of

10

11

12

15

16

17

18

19

20

2S

Health and Social Services. Admit that the Department of Health and Social Services

is the state Medicaid agency and is the department responsible for paying for medically

necessary medication, including psychotropic medication. Admit that the Department

of Health and Social Services is the department that oversees the Office of Children's

Services to assume custody through a court order of children need of aid. The

remainder of the paragraph is denied.

9. Admit that Tammy Sandoval is the director of the Office of Children's

Services. Admit that the Department of Health and Social Services is the state

Medicaid agency and is the department responsible for paying for medically necessary

medication, including psychotropic medication. Admit that the Department of Health

and Social Services is the department that oversees the Office of Children's Services to

assume custody through a court order of children need of aid. The remainder of the

paragraph is denied.

10. Admit that Steve McComb is the Director of the Division of Juvenile

Justice. Admit that the Department of Health and Social Services is the state Medicaid

agency and is the department responsible for paying for medically necessary

medication, including psychotropic medication. Admit that the Department of Health

and Social Services is the department that oversees the Office of Children's Services to

ANSWER TO AMENDED COMPLAINT
Law Project for Psychiatric Rights v. Stale ofAlaska, et af.
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assume custody through a court order of children need of aid. The remainder of the

paragraph is denied.

11. Admit that Melissa Witzler Stone is the Director of the Division of

Behavioral Health. Admit that the Department of Health and Social Services is the

state Medicaid agency and is the department responsible for paying for medically

necessary medication, including psychotropic medication. Admit that the Department

of Health and Social Services is the department that oversees the Office of Children's

Services to assume custody through a court order of children need of aid. The

remainder of the paragraph is denied.

12. Admit that Ron Adler is the Director/CEO of Alaska Psychiatric Institute.

Admit that the Department of Health and Social Services is the state Medicaid agency

and is the department responsible for paying for medically necessary medication,

including psychotropic medication. Admit that the Department of Health and Social

Services is the department that oversees the Office of Children's Services to assume

custody through a court order of children need of aid. The remainder of the paragraph

is denied.

13. Admit that William Streur is a Deputy Commissioner oflbe Department

of Health and Social Services and the Deputy Director of the Division of Health Care

Services. Admit that the Department of Health and Social Services is the state

Medicaid agency and is the department responsible for paying for medically necessary

medication, including psychotropic medication. Admit that the Department of Health

and Social Services is the department that oversees the Office of Children's Services to

assume custody through a court order of children need of aid. The remainder of the

paragraph is denied.

ANSWER TO AMENDED COMPLAINT
Law Project/or Psychiatric Rights v. Siale 0/Alaska. el al.
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CHILDREN AND YOUTH'S CONSTITUTIONAL RIGHT NOT TO BE
ADMINISTERED PSYCHOTROPIC DRUGS UNLESS IT IS IN THEIR BEST

INTERESTS AND THERE ARE NO LESS INTRUSIVE ALTERNATIVES

14. This paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required. To

the extent a response is required, the paragraph is denied.

15. This paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required.

16. This paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required.

17. This paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required.

18. This paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required.

CHILDREN AND YOUTH'S STATUTORY RIGHTS WHEN IN STATE
CUSTODY

19. This paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required.

20. This paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required.

21. This paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required.

MEDICAID PAYMENT FOR OUTPATIENT PRESCRIPTIONS IS NOT
ALLOWED UNLESS APPROVED FOR THE INDICATION BY THE FDA OR

INCLUDED IN CERTAIN MEDICAL COMPENDIA.

22. This paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required.

THE LAW PROJECT FOR PSYCHATRIC RIGHTS' RAISING THE ALARM
TO AND DEMANDING CORRECTIVE ACTION BY GOVERNMENT

OFFICIALS HAS BEEN IGNORED

23. This paragraph is a statement to which no response is required.

24. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph. To the extent a response is required, the paragraph is denied.

25. This paragraph is a statement to which no response is required. The

legislative history speaks for itself.

26. This paragraph is a statement to which no response is required.

27. This paragraph is a statement to which no response is required.

ANSWER TO AMENDED COMPLAINT
Law Projectfor Psychiatric Rights v. State ofAlaska. et af.
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28. This paragraph is a statement to which no response is required.

29. This paragraph is a statement to which no response is required.

30. This paragraph is a statement to which no response is required.

31. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

32. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

33. Admit that the Attorney General's Office is a participant in the Attorneys

General Consumer and Prescriber Grant Program.

34. Admit that Mr. Gottstein e-mailed a number of state officials on June 11,

2008; the remainder of the paragraph is a statement to which no response is required.

35. Admit.

THE "CRITICAL THINKRx" CURRICULUM

36. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the

substance of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

THE FDA DRUG APPROVAL PROCESS

37. This paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required; to

the extent a response is required, the paragraph is denied.

38. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

39. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

40. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

41. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

ANSWER TO AMENDED COMPLAINT
Law Projecf/or P$ychiatric Right$ v. State 0/Ala$ka. el af.
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42. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph~ therefore, it is denied.

43. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

44. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

45. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

46. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

47. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

48. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

15 49. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

'0 of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

17
50. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.
18

51. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

" 19
of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.'"'""~ ,; '0 52. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance" m

~ •0 • of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.w :::!~ "~ 5;: 8
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of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.•z
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of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

56. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.
5

"

55.

57.

The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

7 of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

s 58. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

I) of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

10
59. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

II
of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

60. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

61. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

15

16

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

62. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

17
63. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

18

19

'0

"..'

,-.,

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

64. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

65. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

66. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

67. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

ANSWER TO AMENDED COMPLAINT
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68. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

69. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore. it is denied.

70. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

UNDUE DRUG COMPANY INFLUENCE OVER PRESCRIBING PRACTICES

71. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

72. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

73. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

74. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

75. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

PEDIATRIC PSYCHOTROPIC PRESCRIBING
19

76. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

20 of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

77. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

.,., of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

78. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

'" 79. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.
or, I

ANSWER TO AMENDED COMPLAINT
Law Project for Psychiatric Rights v. Stare ofAlaska, et al.

Page 90f22
Case No. 3AN-08-10115CI

S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 82



2

.' 80. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

5

6

7

s

10

II

12

13

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

81. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

82. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

83. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

84. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

85. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

86. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

15 87. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

10 of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

17
88. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

18

19

20

'I

2J

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

89. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

90. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

91. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

92. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.
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of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

94. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.
;

"

93.

95.

The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

7 of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

96. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

., of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

10
97. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

II

12

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

98. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

99. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

15

16

17

18

19
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:1

,._.,
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of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

100. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

101. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

102. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

103. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

ofthis paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

104. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

105. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.
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106. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

107. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

108. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

109. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

110. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

NEUROLEPTICS

Ill. The paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required.

112. The paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required.

113. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

114. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

115. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

116. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

117. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

118. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

119. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.
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120. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

121. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

122. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

123. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

124. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

125. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

126. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

127. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

128. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

129. This paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required.

130. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

131. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

132. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore. it is denied.

133. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.
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134. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

135. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

ofthi, paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

136. This paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required.

137. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

S of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.
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138. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

ANTIDEPRESSANTS

139. This paragraph is a statement oflaw to which no response is required.

140. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

141. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

142. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

143. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

144. The state is without sufficient information to admit ur deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

145. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

146. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

147. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.
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148. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

149. This paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required.

150. This paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required.

151. This paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required.

152. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

STIMULANTS

153. This paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required.

154. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; t therefore, it is denied.

ISS. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph~ therefore, it is denied.

156. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

157. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

158. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

159, The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

160. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

161. This is a statement of law to which no response is required.

162. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.
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163. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

164. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

165. This paragraph is a statement to which no response is required. The

reports and studies referenced in the paragraph speak for themselves.

ANTICONVULSANTS PROMOTED AS "MOOD STABILIZERS"

166. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

167. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

168. This paragraph is a statement of law to which no response is required.

169. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore. it is denied.

170. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

171. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

172. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore. it is denied.

173. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

174. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore. it is denied.

175. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.
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176. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

177. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

EVIDENCE BASED, LESS INTRUSIVE ALTERNATIVES: PSYCHOSOCIAL
INTERVENTIONS

178. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

179. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

180, The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

181. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

182. Admit that some children may experience loss and trauma because of

disrupted attachments to biological parents. The remainder of the paragraph is denied.

183. Admit that some children may experience emotional disruption. The

remainder of the paragraph is denied.

184. Admit that some children may benefit from secure attachments to

competent adults. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the

remainder of the paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

185. Admit that trauma, abuse, and neglect may disrupt some children's ability

to form secure attachments. The state is without sufficient information to admit or

deny the remainder of the paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

186. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.
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187. Admit that the statements contained in this paragraph may be true for

some children. The remainder of the paragraph is denied.

188. Admit that the statements contained in this paragraph may be true for

some children. The remainder of the paragraph is denied.

189. Admit that the elements described in this paragraph may playa role in

positive outcomes for some children in foster care. The state is without sufficient

infonnation to admit or deny the remainder of the paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

190. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

191. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

192. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

193. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

194. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

195. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

196. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

197. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

198. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

199. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.
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200. Admit that maltreatment may he linked to aggressive behavior in

children. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the remainder of

the paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

201. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

202. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

10

II

13

"

9 203. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

204. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

205. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

l~ 206. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance
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IS
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of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

207. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

208. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

209. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

210. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

211. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.
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"CRITICAL THINK Rx" SPECIFICATIONS

212. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

213. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

214. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

215. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

216. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

217. The state is without sufficient infonnation to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

DEFENDANTS' AUTHORIZING AND PAYING FOR THE
ADMINISTRATION OF PSYCHOTROPIC DRUGS TO CHILDREN AND

YOUT IS ILL-INFORMED AND EXTREMELY HARMFUL

218. Denied.

219. This paragraph contains a statement of law to which no response is

required. The remainder of the paragraph is denied.

220. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of this paragraph; therefore, it is denied.

221. Denied.

222. Denied.

223. Denied.

224. Denied.

225. Denied.

226. Denied.
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227. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of those paragraphs in the complaint referenced in this paragraph. Accordingly, this

paragraph is denied.

228. The state is without sufficient information to admit or deny the substance

of those paragraphs in the complaint referenced in this paragraph. Accordingly, this

paragraph is denied.

II

10

12

, 229. Admit the dates and figure described in this paragraph. The remainder of

the paragraph is denied.

230. Admit the dates and figure described in this paragraph. The remainder of

the paragraph is denied.

231. Admit the dates and figure described in this paragraph. The remainder of

the paragraph is denied.

232. Admit the dates and figure described in this paragraph. The remainder of

I~ the paragraph is denied.

~3 2.

'" granted.
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233. Admit the dates and figure described in this paragraph. The remainder of

the paragraph is denied.

234. Admit the dates and figure described in this paragraph. The remainder of

the paragraph is denied.

235. Admit the dates and figure described in this paragraph. The remainder of

the paragraph is denied.

AFFIRMATIVE DEFENSES

1. Plaintiff is prohibited from bringing this lawsuit by the XI Amendment of

the United States Constitution.

Plaintiff has failed to state a cause of action upon which relief can be

Plaintiffs complaint is barred by the doctrine of taches.

Plaintiffs complaint is barred by the doctrine of unclean hands.
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6.

7.

8.

9.

10.

II.

Plaintiffs complaint is resjudicatQ.

The state is entitled to official immunity.

The state is entitled to discretionary function immunity.

The state is entitled to qualified immunity.

Plaintiffs complaint is barred under the separation of powers doctrine.

Plaintiff lacks standing to bring this action.

The state reserves the right to assert additional defenses, which may be

9 revealed through discovery.

10
12. All other applicable defenses in law and in equity.

"
l.

WHEREFORE, the state requests the court order that:

The Plaintiffs Amended Complaint for Declaratory and Injunctive Relief

By:

TALIS J. COLBERG
ATTORNEY GENERAL

By: ~~
Elizabeth M. Bakalar
Assistant Attorney General
Alaska Bar No. 0606036

fie. """,4L_
£'f<­

Stacie L. Kraly
Chief Assistant Attorney General
Alaska Bar No. 9406040

Dated this 13" day of October, 2008, at Juneau, Alaska.

be dismissed in its entirety with prejudice;

The state be awarded reasonable attorneys fees and costs; and

For such other relief as the court deems appropriate.
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IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA
THIRD JUDICIAL DISTRICT

LAW PROJECT FOR PSYCHIATRIC
RIGHTS, Inc., an Alaskan non-profit
corporation,

Plaintiff,
vs.
STATE OF ALASKA, et aI.,

Defendants,
Case No. 3AN 08-1011SCI

)
)
)
)
)
)
)

MOTION TO AMEND PARAGRAPH 22
OF AMENDED COMPLAINT

COMES NOW, Plaintiff in the above captioned action, and hereby moves to amend

paragraph 22 of its amended complaint to read as follows:

22. It is unlawful to for the State to use Medicaid to pay for
outpatient drug prescriptions except when medically necessary and for
indications approved by the Food and Drug Administration (FDA) or
included in the following compendia:

(a) American Hospital Formulary Service Drug Information,

(b) United States Pharmacopeia-Drug Information (or its successor
publications), or

DATED: December 5, 2008.

(c) DRUGDEX Information System.

r Psychiatric Rights
~.

'lj.p;::;4
By: --j,i-:,L..--;:--:::- ------

.es B. Gottstein
ABA # 7811100

This motion is accompanied by a memorandum in support.
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IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA
THIRD JUDICIAL DISTRICT

LAW PROJECT FOR PSYCHIATRIC
RIGHTS, Inc., an Alaskan non-profit
corporation,

Plaintiff,
vs.
STATE OF ALASKA, el al.,

Defendants,
Case No. 3AN 08- I0 I ISCI

)
)
)
)
)
)
)

DEC 03 2aau

MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF
MOTION TO AMEND PARAGRAPH 22

OF AMENDED COMPLAINT

Plaintiff has moved to amend paragraph 22 of its amended complaint to read as

follows:

22. It is unlawful to for the State to use Medicaid to pay for
outpatient drug prescriptions except when medically necessary and for
indications approved by the Food and Drug Administration (FDA) or
included in the following compendia:

(a) American Hospital Formulary Service Drug Information,

(b) United States Pharmacopeia-Drug Information (or its successor
publications), or

(c) DRUGDEX Information System.

The amendment inserts "when medically necessary and" in the second line.

Pursuant to the October 23, 2008, Amended Routine Pretrial Order in this case,

which provides that Saturday, November 22,2008 was the deadline to amend pleadings

without motion, Plaintiff filed an Amendment to Paragraph 22 on November 24, 2008, the

S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 97



following Monday.' On November 25, 2008, however, the Clerk rejected the filing saying

it needed either a notice of errata or a motion to amend? Therefore, Plaintiff filed a

motion to amend.

For the foregoing reasons, Plaintiff respectfully requests the Court to grant his

motion to amend paragraph 22 of its Amended Complaint.

DATED: December 5, 2008.

Law Project for Psychiatric Rights

By: ~~~~~ _
a es B. Gottstein

A#7811100

, Exhibit A.
2 Exhibit B.

Memorandum in Support of Mation to
Amend Paragraph 22 of Amended Complaint Page 2
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IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA
THIRD JUDICIAL DISTRICT

STATE OF ALASKA, ef al.,

LAW PROJECT FOR PSYCHIATRIC
RIGHTS, Inc., an Alaskan non-profit
corporation,

COpy
0"01""1 Rec"",1Od

NOV 24 2UUU

Defendants,

PlaintifT,

vs.

)
)
))
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)

::-~---:-::-:-::::-:-:-:-:-:-:::;:------)
Case No. 3AN 08-IOJ ISCI

AMENDMENT TO PARAGRAPH 22 OF AMENDED COMPLAINT

COMES NOW, Plaintiff in the above captioned action, and hereby amends

paragraph 22 of its amended complaint (0 read as follows:

22. It is unlawful to for the State to use Medicaid to pay for
outpatient drug prescriptions except when medically necessary and for
indications approved by the Food and Drug Administration (FDA) or
included in the following compendia:

<a) American Hospital Fonnulary Service Drug lnfonnation,

(b) United States Phannacopeia-Drug Infonnation (or its successor
publications), or

(c) DRUGDEX Information System.

DATED: November 24, 2008.

Law Pro' ct for P~ychiatric Rights

~'1L==s~
By: i//

fames B. Gottstein
MA # 7811 100

Exhibit A
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FROM:
Alaska Court System
Nesbett Courthouse
625 W 4th Ave
Anchorage, AK 99501

NOTICE OF DEFICIENT FllING(S)

DATE: November 25, 2006

CASE NO: 3AN-06-10115CI

CASE Law Project for Psychiatric Rights
NAME: VS. State of Alaska et al

CLERK: SSugden
PHONE: 264-0441

TO:
JAMES B, GOTTSTEIN
406 'G' STREET, SUITE 206
ANCHORAGE, AK 99501

D Your documents are being returned to you.

The document(s) you submitted to the court is/are deficient. Please provide the following:

I:8J Other: The Amendment to Paragraph 22 of Amended Complaint filed on
11-24-2008 needs either a notice of errata or a motion to amend.

Deficiencies must be corrected within 20 calendar days from the date of this notice.
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NON-OPPOSITION TO PLAINTIFF'S MOTION TO AMEND

IN THE SUPERlOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA

THIRD JUDICIAL DISTRlCT AT ANCHORAGE

By: ~*,__",a,--"_

Elizabeth M. Bakalar
Assistant Attorney General
Alaska Bar No. 0606036

Defendants State of Alaska, et al. do not oppose Plaintiffs Motion to

Amend paragraph 22 of the amended complaint in the above-captioned matter.

Dated this 10'" day of December, 2008, at Juneau, Alaska.

TALIS J. COLBERG
ATTORNEY GENERAL

KE·
DEC I 5 2008

Case No. 3AN-08-101 15 CI

Plaintiff)

Defendants

vs.

STATE OF ALASKA, SARAH PALIN,

LAW PROJECT FOR PSYCHIATRlC
RlGHTS, an Alaskan non-profil corporation,

)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)

Governor of the State of Alaska, )
ALASKA DEPARTMETN OF HEALTH AND)
SOCIAL SERVICES, WILLIAM HOGAN, )
Commissioner, Department of Health and )
Social Services, TAMMY SANDOVAL, )
Director of the Office of Children's )
Services, STEVE McCOMB, Direclor of the )
Division of Juvenile Justice, MELISSA )
WITZLER STONE, Director ofthe Division of )
Behavioral Health, RON ADLER, )
Director/CEO of the Alaska Psychiatric )
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Commissioner and Director of the Division of )
Health Care Services, )
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By:

Certificate of Service
I hereby certify that on this llf!\day of December,
2008, a true and correct copy of the foregoing
OPPOSITION was mailed via U.S. mail, first
class, postage prepaid, to the following attorney
of record:

James B. Gottstein, Esq.
Law Project for Psychiatric Rights, me.
406 G Street, Suite 206
Anchorage, AK 9950 I

~A<k
H. Raven Haffner, Law Office Assistant II

~_d.- Rre--Stacie L. KIaly
Chief Assistant Attorney General
Alaska Bar No. 9406040

NON-OPPOSITION TO PLAINTIFF'S MOTION TO AMEND
Law Project/or Psychiatric Rights v. Stale ofAlaska, el 01.

Page 2 of2
Case No. 3AN·08-10115CI
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IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA
THIRD JUDICIAL DISTRICT

LAW PROJECT FOR PSYCHIATRIC
RIGHTS, Inc., an Alaskan non-profit
corporation,

Plaintiff,
vs.
STATE OF ALASKA, et al.,

Defendants,
Case No. 3AN 08-10 II SCI

)
)
)
)
)
)
)

KEI'/::./VED
DEC I e 2008

ORDER GRANTING
MOTION TO AMEND PARAGRAPH 22

OF AMENDED COMPLAINT

In consideration of Plaintiffs motion to amend paragraph 22 of its amended

complaint to read as follows:

22. It is unlawful to for the State to use Medicaid to pay for
outpatient drug prescriptions except when medically necessary and for
indications approved by the Food and Drug Administration (FDA) or
included in the following compendia:

(a) American Hospital Formulary Service Drug Information,

(b) United States Pharmacopeia-Drug Information (or its successor
publications), or

(c) DRUGDEX Information System,

and any response(s), it is hereby ORDERED, the Motion is GRANTED.

DATED:

By: ~7:;4L~::=:::::~~--
J W. Smith

uperior Court Judge
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Pursuant to Alaska Rule of Civil Procedure 77, defendants the Stale of

Department; Tammy Sandoval, in her official capacity as Director of the Office of

Alaska; Sarah Palin, Governor of the State of Alaska; the Department of Health and

Social Services; William Hogan, in his official capacity as Commissioner of the

REC'D MAR 16 2009

Case No. 3AN-08-IOIIS CI
Defendants

Plaintiff,

vs.

STATE OF ALASKA, SARAH PALIN,

LAW PROJECT FOR PSYCHIATRIC
RIGHS, an Alaskan non-profit corporation,

STATE OF ALASKA'S MOTION AND MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF
MOTION TO STAY DISCOVERY

Children's Services; Steve McComb, in his official capacity as Director of the Division

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA
THIRD JUDICIAL DISTRICT AT ANCHORAGE

)
)
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Governor oflhe Siale of Alaska, )
ALASKA DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND)
SOCIAL SERVICES, WILLIAM HOGAN, )
Commissioner, Departmenl of Health and )
Social Services, TAMMY SANDOVAL, )
Director of the Office of Children's )
Services, STEVE McCOMB, Director of the )
Division of Juvenile Justice, MELISSA )
WITZLER STONE, Director of Ihe Division of )
Behavioral Health, RON ADLER, )
Director/CEO of the Alaska Psychiatric )
Institute, WILLIAM STREUER, Deputy )
Commissioner and Director of the Division of )
Health Care Services, )
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of Juvenile Justice; Melissa Stone, in her official capacity as Director of the Division

of Behavioral Health; Ron Adler, in his official capacity as Director of Alaska

Psychiatric Institute; and William Streur, in his official capacity as Deputy

Commissioner of the Department of Health and Social Services (hereinafter

collectively "the Department"), hereby move to stay discovery in the above·captioned

matter. The plaintiff is currently seeking discovery in this case. However, the

Department has filed contemporaneous to the instant motion a dispositive Motion for

Judgment on Ihe Pleadings pursuant to Alaska Rule of Civil Procedure 12(c). For the

following reasons, the Department asks the court to stay discovery pending resolution

of the Department's Civil Rule 12(c) motion.

A stay of discovery in litigation is within the discretion of the trial court

and appropriate pending the court's decision on a dispositive motion.! This is

particularly true where-as here-such a motion raises pure questions of law which

discovery is not needed to resolve. 2 In such cases, and particularly where-also as

here-the pending motion would dispose of the entire case, staying discovery "is an

eminently logical means to prevent wasting the time and effort of all concerned, and to

See, e.g., Karen L. v. State Dept. ofHealth and Social Services, Div. of
Family and Youth Services, 953 P.2d 871, 880 (Alaska 1998).

2 Brazos Valley Coalition for Life, Inc. v. City ofBlyan, Tex., 421 F.3d
314,328 (5'" Cir. 2005).

STATE'S MOTION & MEMO IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO STAY DISCOVERY Page 2 of4
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2

3 make the most efficient use ofjudicial resources.") Courts have granted government

4 defendants' requests to stay discovery, specifically where "the burden and expense of

5 the subject discovery o~tweighed its likely benefit.,,4 Such motions have been resolved

6
in favor of the government movant on threshold issues, based on the reasoning that

7

8
unfettered discovery in such a context may impose "an undue burden on public

9
officials and government agencies.,,5

3

court's already-stretched resources. On February 24, 2009, the undersigned contacted

while the Department's dispositive motion is pending is a waste of the parties' and the

In this case, a stay of discovery is appropriate because if the court grants

the regular course of discovery can resume at that point. But continued discovery

The Department's Rule 12(c) Motion seeks dismissal of the Complaint on
the grounds that plaintiff has not presented the court with a justiciable case or
controversy and lacks standing to sue.

See Chavous v. District ofColumbia Financial Responsibility and
Management Assistance, 201 F.RD. 1,2 (DD.C., 2001) (citing Coastal States Gas
Corp. v. Department ofEnergy, 84 F.R.D. 278, 282 (D. DeI.1979)).

4 See, e.g, Schism v. u.s., 316 F.3d 1259, 130 I (Fed. Cir. 2002). See also
James Madison Ltd by Hecht v. Ludwig, 82 F.3d 1085, 1091 (D.C. Cir. 1986).

5 Williamson v. u.s. Dept. ofAgriculture, 815 F.2d 368 (5'h Cir 1987)
(citing Halperin v. Kissinger, 606 F.2d 1192 (D.C.Cir.1979), afrd in pertinent part, 452
U.S. 713 (1981)) (Court properly stayed discovery pending resolution of threshold
governmental immunity issues).

6

plaintiff to see if the parties could agree to stay discovery pending the outcome of any

the Department's Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings, further discovery as it relates

to the Complaint in this ~atter will be moot. 6 If the Department's motion is denied,
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dispositive motions. Plaintiff agreed to postpone one pending deposition by a few

weeks but declined to stipulate to the Department's proposed slay.

For the foregoing reasons, the Department requests that the court stay

discovery pending the court's decision on the Department's contemporaneous Motion

for Judgment on the Pleadings.

Iz. .J;-
DATED this _'----__day of March, 2009, at Juneau, Alaska.

RlCHARD A. SVOBODNY
ACTING ATTORNEY GENERAL

By: ~.h--
Elizabeth M. Bakalar
Assistant Attorney General
Alaska Bar No. 0606036

By: St~~l~~
Chief Assistant Attorney General
Alaska Bar No. 9406040
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MOTION FOR EXPEDITED CONSIDERATION

and the remaining above-named defendants (hereinafter "the Department"), hereby

Pursuant to Alaska Rule of Civil Procedure 77(g), the State of Alaska

contemporaneously herewith. This motion is supported by the attached affidavit of

RECTI MAR 16 2009

Case No. 3AN-08-IOIIS CI

Plaintiff,

Defendants

LA W PROJECT FOR PSYCHIATRIC
RIGHS, an Alaskan non-profit corporation,

vs.

STATE OF ALASKA, SARAH PALIN,

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA
THIRD JUDICIAL DISTRICT AT ANCHORAGE

move for expedited consideration of the Department's Motion to Stay Discovery, filed

counsel setting forth the facts that justify expedited consideration. A decision on this

)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)

Governor of the State of Alaska, )
ALASKA DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND)
SOCIAL SERVICES, WILLIAM HOGAN, )
Commissioner, Department of Health and )
Social Services, TAMMY SANDOVAL, )
Director of the Office of Children's )
Services, STEVE McCOMB, Director of the )
Division of Juvenile Justice, MELISSA )
WITZLER STONE, Director of the Division of)
Behavioral Health, RON ADLER, )
Director/CEO of the Alaska Psychiatric )
Institute, WILLIAM STREUER, Deputy )
Commissioner and Director of the Division of )
Health Care Services, )

)
)

11------------ )

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

II

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

;:i 19
U>

:3 :;
20" •

u. •
o ~ww.

21""~~g
,¢O<l:",
I-' i= :i '?
(/)Cl:c(1l'I

22.i~~':9
o:(8~~
a: c - 0

23WZ8J:
~gg~
C)c;:::
> • 240w •z 6a:
0 • 25

~
26

MOTION FOR EXPEDITED CONSlDERATION
Law Project for Psychiarric Rights v. Stale, et af.

Page 1 of:?:
Case No. JAN-OB-l0115CI

S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 108



2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

;:l 19

'"«-' "« • 20
u. •
o ~
w· oo

211-~~8
<1: 0 <1: ...
I-::l:;:i,?
cn!i:...:U\ 22~::J~:c:(°::>wa:u-,z
w ri! go 23zo..,::C
W:=;;cG.
"5:::
> x 240w •z 0II:
0 • 25

~
26

motion is requested by March 19,2009, the date presently noticed for the first

deposition in this case.

!2S
DATED this ----' day of March, 2009.

RICHARD A. SVOBODNY
ACTING ATTORNEY GENERAL

By: ~.18­
Elizabeth M. Bakalar
Assistant Attorney General
Alaska Bar No. 0606036

By St~~~y~
Chief Assistant Attorney General
Alaska Bar No. 9406040

MOTION FOR EXPEDITED CONSIDERATION Page 2 of2
Law Project/or PsychiOlr;c Rights v. Slatf!, et al. Case No. 3AN-OS-IO IISel

S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 109



2

3 IN THE SUPERlOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA
THIRD JUDICIAL DISTRlCT AT ANCHORAGE

4

I, Elizabeth M. Bakalar, being first duly sworn upon oath, depose and

AFFIDAVIT OF COUNSEL IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR
EXPEDITED CONSIDERATION

say:

Case No. 3AN-08-IOllS CI

Plaintiff,

Defendants

LAW PROJECT FOR PSYCHIATRlC
RlGHS, an Alaskan non-profit corporation,

STATE OF ALASKA, SARAH PALIN,

vs:

STATE OF ALASKA )
) ss.

THIRD JUDICIAL DISTRlCT )

)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)

Governor of the State of Alaska, )
ALASKA DEPARTMETN OF HEALTH AND)
SOCIAL SERVICES, WILLIAM HOGAN, )
Commissioner, Department of Health and )
Social Services, TAMMY SANDOVAL, )
Director of the Office of Children's )
Services, STEVE McCOMB, Director of the )
Division of Juvenile Justice, MELISSA )
WITZLER STONE, Director of the Division of )
Behavioral Health, RON ADLER, )
Director/CEO of the Alaska Psychiatric )
Institute, WILLIAM STREUER, Deputy )
Commissioner and Director of the Division of )
Health Care Services, )

)
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,
3 I. I am one of the Assistant Attorneys General assigned to represent

4

5

6

7

the above-named defendants ("the Department") in this matter.

2. Initially, plaintiff noticed the deposition of David Campana, state

pharmacist, for the afternoon of February 26, 2009, and the Department had begun to

prepare for that deposition and gather materials responsive to the accompanying

subpoena duces tecum.

8 3. However, In preparing for Mr. Campana's deposition, counsel

9

10

began to review the underlying Complaint more extensively and developed concerns

about engaging in further discovery at that time.

II
4. Accordingly, on February 24, 2009, the undersigned contacted

12

13

plaintiff bye-mail to convey this information and attempted to secure counsel's

stipulation to stay discovery pending resolution of a dispositive motion to be filed by

the Department.

14 s. Plaintiff agreed to postpone Mr. Campana's deposition for a few

15 weeks, but declined to stipulate to a stay of discovery under the aforementioned terms.

16 6. Plaintiff has re~noticed Mr. Campana's deposition for March 19,

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

2009 at 1:00 p.m.

7. Plaintiff also filed its First Requests for Production on March 2,

2009, a response to which, absent a stay, is due April 2, 2009.

8. Contemporaneous to this Motion for Expedited Consideration and

underlying Motion to Stay Discovery, the Department has filed a Motion for Judgment

on the Pleadings pursuant to Alaska Rule of Civil Procedure 12(c), in which the

Department argues that the plaintiff has failed to present a case or controversy under

the Declaratory Judgment Act and lacks standing to bring this lawsuit.

9. The Department therefore would be prejudiced by having to

engage in discovery when there is a pending dispositive motion that would moot the

need for all discovery in the case.

AFFIOA VIT OF COUNSEL
Law Project/or Psychiatric Rights v. Stale, elol.

Page 2 of3
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3 10. Based on the foregoing, and the impending discovery deadlines in

4

5

6

this matter, the Department requests the court's expedited consideration of its Motion

10 Stay Discovery.

DATED: --'-M--'-W1_U1.----"'12=:,1e-'2-"'-'~_=_1_=____

, IL·cotikv=r1

Izabeth M. Bakalar

SUBSCRlBED AND SWORN to before me this~ day of March,

2009'ITm~-;:;-;:::::-:-:~-.
I ST':,';,~rg~L~~~~KA•.::

HEIDI HAFFNER .. ,.:.;.....
NOTARY PUBLIC -"

My Commission Expires With OffIce

7

8

9

10

II

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

;l 19
<Il

"... ;;; 20" ~u.o :
1IJ~5 21
~ 5 cd!:
I- J: "'"
(I)~~J: 22.oJ;:) ~ ~< 0;:) .•
a:(J .... ~
w ~ gO 23zo ... J:
w::!!Q~

''is=
> " 240w •z 0a:
0 " 25
~

26

AFFIDAVIT OF COUNSEL
Law ProjeclfoJ' Psychiatric Rights \P. Stale. ef of.

Page 3 of3
Case No. 3AN-08·\OI15Cl

S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 112



I
<

STATE OF ALASKA'S MOTION FOR JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS

the Department; Tammy Sandoval, in her official capacity as Director of the Office of

Pursuant to Alaska Rules of Civil Procedure l2(b)(6) and 77, defendants

the State of Alaska; Sarah Palin, Governor of the Slate of Alaska; the Department of

REC'D MAR 16 2009

Case No. 3AN-08-101IS CI

Plaintiff,

Defendants.

LAW PROJECT FOR PSYCHIATRIC
RIGHTS, an Alaskan non-profit corporation,

vs.

STATE OF ALASKA, SARAH PALIN,

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA
THIRD JUDICIAL DISTRICT AT ANCHORAGE

Health and Social Services; William Hogan, in his official capacity as Commissioner of

Children's Services; Steve McComb, in his official capacity as Director of the Division
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Governor of the State of Alaska, )
ALASKA DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND)
SOCIAL SERVICES, WILLIAM HOGAN, )
Commissioner, Department of Health and )
Social Services, TAMMY SANDOVAL, )
Director of the Office of Children's )
Services, STEVE McCOMB, Director of the )
Division of Juvenile Justice, MELISSA )
WITZLER STONE, Director of the Division of)
Behavioral Health, RON ADLER, )
Director/CEO of the Alaska Psychiatric )
Institute, WILLIAM STREUER, Deputy )
Commissioner, and Director of the Division of )
Health Care Services, )
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of Juvenile Justice; Melissa Stone, in her official capacity as Director of the Division of

Behavioral Health; Ron Adler, in his official capacity as Director of Alaska Psychiatric

Institute; and William Streur, in his official capacity as Deputy Commissioner of the

Department of Health and Social Services and Director of the Division of Health Care

Services (hereinafter collectively "the Department"), hereby move for judgment on the

pleadings in the above-captioned maller on the grounds that plaintiff has failed to

present an actual case or controversy under the Declaratory Judgment Act and lacks

standing to bring this action. This motion is supported by the attached Memorandum

of Law.

12 ~DATED this day of March, 2009.

RlCHARD A. SVOBODNY
ACTING ATTORNEY GENERAL

By: ~4..-.
Elizabelh M. Bakalar
Assistant Allomey General
Alaska Bar No. 0606036

By: ~I~~
Slacie L. Kraly
Chief Assislant Allomey General
Alaska Bar No. 9406040
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the Department; Tammy Sandoval, in her official capacity as Director of the Office of

the State of Alaska; Sarah Palin, Governor of the State of Alaska; the Department of

Health and Social Services; William Hogan, in his official capacity as Commissioner of

IN THE SUPERJOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA
THIRD JUDICIAL D1STRJCT AT ANCHORAGE

Case No. 3AN-08-IOllS CI

Plaintiff,

Defendants

LAW PROJECT FOR PSYCHIATRJC
RJGHTS, an Alaskan non-profit corporation,

vs.

STATE OF ALASKA, SARAH PALIN,

INTRODUCTION

Pursuant to Alaska Rules of Civil Procedure 12(b)(6) and 77, defendants

STATE OF ALASKA'S MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR
JUDGMENT ON THE PLEADINGS
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Governor of the State of Alaska, )
ALASKA DEPARTMENTOF HEALTH AND )
SOCIAL SERVICES, WILLIAM HOGAN, )
Commissioner, Department of Health and )
Social Services, TAMMY SANDOVAL, )
Director of the Office of Children's )
Services, STEVE McCOMB, Director of the )
Division of Juvenile Justice, MELISSA )
WITZLER STONE, Director of the Division of)
Behavioral Health, RON ADLER, )
Director/CEO of the Alaska Psychiatric )
Institute, and WILLIAM STREUER, Deputy )
Commissioner and Director of the Division of )
Health Care Services, )
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Children's Services; Steve McComb, in his official capacity as Director of the Division

of Juvenile Justice; Melissa Stone, in her official capacity as Director of the Division of

Behavioral Heallh; Ron Adler, in his official capacity as Director of Alaska Psychiatric

Institute; and William Steeue, in his official capacity as Deputy Commissioner of the

Department of Health and Social Services and Director of the Division of Health Care

Services (hereinafter collectively "the Department"), move for judgment on the

pleadings in the above-captioned matter.

Plaintiff has filed an Amended Complaint for Declaratory and Injunctive

Relief ("Complaint") on behalf of a nonprofit advocacy group, against a number of

state defendants in their official capacities. The Complaint does not identify a single

individual who has been harmed by the alleged violations in the Complaint, but makes

abstract accusations and assertions regarding the administration of and payment for

psychotropic medication for children in Alaska. A reading of the Complaint makes

obvious that the true subject of plaintiffs grievances is not the Department, but

prescribers of psychotropic pharmaceuticals, the pharmaceutical companies which

produce and market them, and the overall culture of pediatric psychiatry. The

implication that the Department possesses meaningful authority and control over these

matters-or is in any realistic position to administer the relief requested even if the

court were to order it-is a fiction.

STATE'S MEMO IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR JUDGMENT
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The Department therefore asks the court to decide one straightforward

and dispositive legal question: has plaintiff demonstrated a case or controversy under

Alaska's Declaratory Judgment Act and the requisite standing to bring this action? For

the following reasons, the court should answer that question in the negative and dismiss

the case.

FACTUAL AND PROCEDURAL BACKGROUND

I. The Department's Administration of an~ Payment for Psychotropic
Medication to Minors in State Custody

To better frame the legal issue of standing as it relates to the plaintiff in

this case, the Department provides the following factual and procedural background.

A. Administration of Psychotropic Medication to Minors in State
Custody

Minors may come into state custody in one of three ways:

1. Under AS 47.10.080, the Office of Children's Services ("OCS") takes

into Department custody children who have been adjudicated children in need of aid;

2. Under AS 47.12.120, the Division ofJuvenile Justice ("DJJ") takes into

Department cuslody children who have been adjudicated delinquent by a court; or

3. A minor may be ordered held at Alaska Psychiatric Institute ("API")

pending evalu~tion and treatment pursuant to AS 47.30.

Under any of the above scenarios, any psychotropic medication

prescribed to a child in Department custody is administered on an individual, case-by-

case basis either through a court order or upon a release executed by the child's parent

STATE'S MEMO IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR JUDGMENT
Law Project for Psychiatric Rights v. State, et al.
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2

3 or guardian.' Employees of the Department do not have the authority to consent to the

4 administration of psychotropic medications. The only exception to the above would be

5 if emergency medication was warranted while the child was at API, and such situations

6
are specifically governed by AS 47.30.

7
Plaintiffs Complaint also names Melissa Stone, Director" of the Division

children are not placed in the custody ofDBH. Rather, children are placed in

and payment for psychotropic medication given to children in state custody_ But

of Behavioral Health CDBH") as a defendant with respect to the administration

children, and specifically provide that parents have residual rights that include the

See AS 47.10.084: AS 47.12.1 SO; AS 47.30.

Id.2

DBH-administered facilities and programs by their parents or guardians, or by DJ] or

OCS after a court orders those respective agencies to take custody of a child. When a

individual, case-by~case basis either through a court order or upon a release executed

child is in a DBH-administered placement, the same analysis applies as to the

prescribing and administration of psychotropic drugs. Such decisions are made on an

by the child's parent or guardian' In fact, as to children in oes and DJJ custody,

AS 47.10.084 and AS 47.12.1 SO govern the rights of parents and guardians as to their

8
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2

3 power to make decisions regarding "major medical treatment," which in tum explicitly

4 includes the administration of medication used to treat a mental health disorder.3

5 In short, the administration of psychotropic medication to children in

6
Alaska is a decision left to the parent or legal guardian of the child, or to the superior

7

8
court. None of the named defendants is permitted to prescribe, authorize, or administer

9
psychotropic medication to any child in the state absent consent from that child's

10 parent, legal guardian, a superior cQllrtjudge, or, in some circumstances, the child

II himself or herself. The named defendants simply do not administer psychotropic

12 medication to children in custody in the manner portrayed by plaintiffs Complaint.

13
Rather, there exist well-established statutory schemes-none of which is referenced in

14
the Complaint-to seek individual approval to make such decisions.

15

16
B. Medicaid Payment for Psychotropic Medication to Minors in State

Custody

17
Medicaid is a joint federal and state program run by the individual states

federal financial contributions.4

state must operate the program in compliance with federal law in order to receive

that provides medical services, including prescription drugs, to certain eligible

See AS 47.07.

3

4

individuals. The program is elective. If a state opts to participate-as Alaska has-the

Under AS 25.20.025, children themselves also may consent to medical
treatment under certain circumstances.

18

19

23

21

20

24

26

25
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3 With respect to Medicaid-covered pharmaceuticals of any kind prescribed

4 to Medicaid recipients, including children in Department custody, the drug use review

5 process stated in 7 AAC 43.593 works like authorizations under any other type of

6
third-party insurance program. The recipient or the recipient's parent or legal guardian

7

8
sees the provider, the provider determines what (if any) medication the recipient needs,

9
the recipient takes the prescription to a pharmacy, and the pharmacy records relevant

10 insurance and demographic infonnation from the recipient, inputs the prescription into

II the computer, retrieves relevant drug information, and transmits this information to a

12 claims processor. At this point, the prescription undergoes a clinical and eligibility

13
review to confirm the recipient's Medicaid eligibility and determine such facts as

14
whether the recipient has previously received the drug, the correct dosage for the

15

16
recipient, the recipient's medical history, and drug interactions to determine coverage

17
by Medicaid.S Again, the Department does not consent to the administration of

18 psychotropic medications unless prescribed by a licensed provider, and there is

II. Plaintiff's Complaint

appropriate authorization in place from a parent, a legal guardian, or a court order.

Plaintiff avers that it is an "Alaska non-profit corporation" and a "public interest law

See 7 AAC 43.593.
,

On September 29, 2008, plaintiff, the Law Project for Psychiatric Rights

("Psych Rights), filed the 54-page Complaint that is the subject of the instant motion.

19

23

21

20

24

26

25
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3 finn whose mission is to mount a strategic litigation campaign against forced

4 psychiatric drugging and electroshock.'" Plaintiffs website supplies further

5 information regarding the origins of this action, stating: "due to massive growth in

6
psychiatric drugging of children and youth and the current targeting of them for even

7

8
more psychiatric drugging, PsychRights has made attacking this problem a priority.

9
Children are virtually always forced to take these drugs because it is the adults in their

10 lives who are making the decision. This is an unfolding national tragedy of immense

J1 proportions."7

12 The Complaint seeks a declaratory judgment that "Alaskan children and

13 youth" not be administered psychotropic drugs "unless and until" the Department has

14
engaged in a series of general actions and analyses. specifically '''(i) evidence-based

15

16
psychosocial interventions have been exhausted; (ii) rationally anticipated benefits of

17
psychotropic drug treatment outweigh the risks; (iii) the person or entity authorizing

18 administration of the drug(s) is fully informed of the risks and potential benefits; and

(iv) close monitoring of, and appropriate means of responding to, treatment emergent

effects are in place.,,8

See http://psychrights.orglindex.htm (last visited March 10,2009).

Complaint at p. 3.8

,
Complaint at ~ 4. For purposes of this motion, the Department accepts

that plaintiff is a nonprofit corporation registered with the State of Alaska.
7

t9

21

20

22

23

26

24

25

STATE'S MEMO IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR JUDGMENT
Lm1' Projeclfor Psychiatric Rights v. Stale, et al.

Page 7 of20
Case No. 3AN·08+101 [SCI

S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 121



2

3 The Complaint further seeks a permanent injunction prohibiting 'lthe

4 defendants and their successors from authorizing or paying for the administration of

5 psychotropic drugs to Alaskan children and youth without conformance" to the

6
foregoing prerequisites.9 Finally, the Complaint seeks an order requiring an

7

8
"independent reassessment of each Alaskan child or youth to whom defendants have

9
authorized the administration or payment of psychotropic drugs," in conformance with

10 plaintiffs demands, and "for: each child for whom it is found the administration of or

II payment for psychotropic drugs is taking place" out of conformity with said demands,

12 order "that immediate remedial action be commenced to prudently eliminate or reduce

13 such administration of or payment for psychotropic drugs and diligently pursued to

14
completion."lo

15

Plaintiff's lengthy Complaint goes on to make certain assertions

detail the FDA approval process for certain categories of pharmaceuticals, criticize

regarding the constitutionality of psychotropic medication use, aver when such use is

marketing and prescribing practices for such drugs, and describe plaintiff's suggested

and the contents of a particular online curriculum critical of psychotropic medication,

Page 8 of20
Case No. 3AN-08-IOlI5CI

Id.

II

10

9

interventions to address these issues. 11 Notwithstanding all of the above, the only

appropriately paid for by Medicaid, describe plaintiffs efforts to engage Ihe legislature

/d. at pp. 3-4.

Id. at pp. 5-54.
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2

3 specific allegations directed at the Department are contained at pages 50-52 of the

4 Complaint, in which plaintiff claims that the Department inappropriately administered

5 and paid for psychotropic drugs." Notably, and as further discussed below, neither the

6
Complaint nor plaintiffs website specifies whose interest plaintiff claims to represent,

7
and on what basis.

8

9
STANDARD OF REVIEW

arc closed but within such time as not to delay the trial, any party may move for

disposing of cases when the material facts are not in dispute and a judgment on the

merits can be achieved by focusing on the content of the pleadings and any facts of

Alaska Rule of Civil Procedure 12(c) provides that "after the pleadings

Complaint at ~~ 218-228.

Hebert v. Honest Bingo, 18 P.3d 43, 46 (Alaska 2001).

Id.

See, e.g, Fomby v. Whisenhunt, 680 P.2d 787, 789 (Alaska 1984).

12

13

14

"

resolving dispositive questions of law. 14 As with a motion brought under Civil

Rule 12(b)(6), the court can dismiss a complaint pursuant to a Rule 12(c) motion."

which the court will take judicial notice."13 Rule 12(c) motions are a useful means for

judgment on the pleadings." A Rule 12(c) motion provides the court with a "means of

10

11
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2

3 ARGUMENT

4 I.

5

Plaintiff Lacks the Required Case or Controversy to Bring this Action
under the Declaratory Judgment Act

6
AS 22.10.020(g) confers upon the superior court the following

7 jurisdiction over actions for declaratory and injunctive relief:

8

9

10

II

12

13

In case of an actual controversy in the state, the superior
court, upon the filing of an appropriate pleading, may declare the
rights and legal relations of an interested party seeking the
declaration, whether or not further relief is or could be sought.
The declaration has the force and effect of a final judgment or
decree and is reviewable as such. Further necessary or proper
relief based on a declaratory judgment or decree may be granted,
after reasonable notice and hearing, against an adverse party
whose rights have been determined by the judgment."

14 The statute explicitly requires the presence of an "actual controversy" before the court

15 may issue declaratory relief. The Alaska Supreme Court has held that this actual

16 controversy requirement encompasses a number of grounds upon which the court may

17
decline to exercise jurisdiction under the Declaratory.Judgment Act, including

plaintiff lacks standing to sue. Therefore, the court should dismiss the Complaint.

meet the actual controversy requirement of the Declaratory Judgment Act because the

mootness, standing, and lack of ripeness. 17 As discussed below, this matter does not

AS 22.1 0.020(g) (emphasis added).

Brause v. State ofAlaska et al., 21 PJd 357, 358 (Alaska 2001).17

"

19

24

18

21

23

25

26

22

20
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2

3

4

II. Plaintiff Lacks Standing to Bring this Lawsuit

Plaintiffs Complaint asserts this court's jurisdiction under

5 AS 22.10.020. 18 However, the court may decline to exercise its jurisdiction under that

6 statute where a party lacks standing to sue. 19 Alaska jurisprudence interprets broadly

7 the concept of standing to promote liberal access to the courts. 20 Indeed, a complaint

8
seeking declaratory relief requires only "a simple statement of facts demonstrating that

9

10
the superior court has jurisdiction and that an actual justiciable case or controversy is

11
presented.,,21 But standing in Alaska courts is not limitless. To the contrary, standing

12 constitutes "'a rule ofjudicial self-restraint based on the principle that courts should not

13 resolve abstract questions or issue advisory opinions. ,,22 As noted above, the "case or

14 controversy" requirement of the Declaratory Judgment Act includes lack of standing as

15

16

17

18

Lowell v. Hayes, 117 P.3d 745, 757 (Alaska 2005).

Jd

IS

20

22

Complaint at ~ 2. Tbe Department admitted in its Answer tbat tbe
superior court has jurisdiction under AS 22.10.020. Answer at '2. However, the
Department also specifically raised the affirmative defense of lack of standing as a
reason for the court to decline to exercise that jurisdiction. Answer at p. 22, ~ IO.

19

North Kenai Peninsula Road Maintenance Service Area v. Kenai
Peninsula Borough, 850 P.2d 636 (Alaska 1993) (citing Moore v. State, 553 P.2d 8,23
(Alaska 1976); TrusteesJor Alaska v. State, 736 P.2d 324, 330 (Alaska 1987».

11 Ruckle v. Anchorage School District, 85 P.3d 1030, 1034 (Alaska 2004)
(citing Jeffersoll v. Asplund, 458 P.2d 995, 999 (Alaska 1969).

19

21

22

20

23

24

26
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citizen-taxpayer standing are well-articulated, and plaintiff fails to meet them. Even

Therefore, the Department is entitled to judgment on the pleadings.

standing, the plaintiff must meet certain criteria which, while liberally construed, are by

under Alaska's liberal requirements, plaintiff satisfies neither type of standing.

Id.. at n. 5.

Trustees/or Alaska v. State, 736 P.2d 324, 329 (Alaska 1987).

24

2J

26

"

28

Id. (citing Bowers Office Prod.s., Inc. v. Univ. a/Alaska, 755 P.2d 1095,
1096 (Alaska 1988)).

Department urges the court to do so here.

Alaska courts recognize two Fonus of standing: "interest-injury" standing and "citizen-

interest adversely affected by the conduct complained 0[.',27 To have citizen-taxpayer

The basic requirement for standing in Alaska is adversity. 24 Questions of

taxpayer" standing?6 To have interest-injury standing, the plaintiff "must have an

no means an entitlement.28 As discussed infra, plaintiff fails to show "an interest

of a particular issue and not whether the issue itself is justiciable.,,25 To this end,

Gilbert v. State, 139 P.3d 581, 587 (Alaska 2006) (citing Moore v, State,
553 P.2d 8 (Alaska 1976) (internal quotations omitted).

adversely affected" by the state's alleged conduct. In addition, the criteria required for

standing are limited to whether the litigant is a "proper party to request an adjudication

a ground upon which the court can decline to exercise its jurisdiction/3 and the

850 P.2d 636 at 639-640, citing Trustees/or Alaska v. Slate, 736 P,2d
324,327 (Alaska 1987).

850 P.2d 636. "Citizen-taxpayer" standing is also intermittently teferred
to as "taxpayer-citizen" standing throughout the case law.

27
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supreme court discourages third-person representation and has "never held that

the plaintiff must have "a sufficient personal stake in the outcome of the

a dependent child's grandfather lacked standing to appeal the termination of the

mother's (his daughter's) parental rights to her own minor daughter. The court

Page 13 of20
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Jd.
30

29

32

35

"

adversely affected by the conduct complained 0[,,29 To ensure this requisite adversity,

standing can be created by wagering on whether someone else's injury will ultimately

A. Plaintiff Lacks Interest-Injnry Standing

To establish interest-injury standing, a plaintiff must have "an interest

In Gilbert M v. State," the court aired fully for the first time the

be vindicated.,,31 Only in "rare cases" will the interest-injury test be read to allow

controversy."" Although the extent of the alleged injury "need not be great," our

standing "to protect the rights of third parties by acting in a representative capacity. ,,32

circumstances under which a party may raise the rights of a third person.34 In that case,

The court further observed that a "special relationship between the plaintiff and the

observed that generally, a third person may not assert another's constitutional rights. 35

Broeeke! v. State, Dept. a/Corrections, 941 P.2d 893 (Alaska 1997)
(internal quotations omitted).

31 Foster v. State, 752 P.2d 459, 466 (Alaska 1988) (emphasis in original).

Jd.

139 P.3d 581 (Alaska 2006).

Jd. at 587.

Jd.; Complaint at ~~ 14-18.
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2

3 third party" must exist before standing can be established." In Gilbert M., the court

found no such legal relationship and the plaintiff was denied standing.37

5 Here. plaintiff does not assert interest-injury standing or claim an adverse

6
interest, nor does plaintiff claim any sort of relationship at all to any relevant

7

8
individual. Plaintiff states only that it is "an Alaskan non-profit corporation" and H a

9
public interest law firm whose mission is to mount a strategic litigation campaign

10 against forced psychiatric drugging and electroshock. ,,38 This statement is prima facie

11 insufficient to establish adversity. The Department cannot infer from this or anything

J2 else in the Complaint whose actual interest plaintiff purports to represent, and therefore

13
how such an interest might be adversely affected. This deficiency is not ministerial: it

14
makes resolution of the case-through settlement or otherwise-virtually impossible.

15

16
The Department is forced to fumble about and engage in shadow boxing with a faceless

17
litigant, and the court'-s task of adjudicating the parties' respective interests is

18 frustrated.

To the extent plaintiff purports to represent the general public interest of

children in state custody or other state interests, representation of those interests rests

139 P.3d 581 at 587.
37

36

!d. See also Zoerb v. Chugach E/ec. Ass'n, Inc., 798 P.2d 1258, 1261
(Alaska 1990) (plaintiff, an emplayee of an electric company, lacked standing 10 sue
with respect to interests afforded members of the organization, based on plaintiffs lack
ofa legally proteclable interest) (emphasis in original).

3. Complaint at ~ 4.

23

21

19
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with the Attorney General for the State of Alaska, the Department, and/or the parents

and guardians of individual children in state custody or the children themselves-not

plaintiffs law firm. 39 To the extent plaintiff purports to represent a certain class of

individuals, no class action has been brought, much less certified. To the extent

plaintiff purports to represent a particular individual or individuals who have allegedly

been harmed by state action, no such individual has been named, and no specific harm

has been alleged.

In sum, plaintiff has not asserted standing under the interest-injury

doctrine, nor can the Complaint be read to infer it. Therefore, plaintiff lacks interest-

injury standing.

B. Plaintiff Lacks Citizen-Taxpayer Standing

The Alaska Supreme Court has clearly articulated the requirements of

citizen-taxpayer standing:

[A] taxpayer or citizen need only show that the case in question is
one of public significance and the plaintiff is appropriate in several
respects. This appropriateness has three main facets: the plaintiff
must not be a sham plaintiff with na trlle adversity a/interest; he

See generally AS 44.23.020; AS 47.10.084 (the Department's legal
custody of a child "imposes on the department and its authorized agents or ihe parents,
guardian. or other suitable person the responsibility of physical care and control of the
child, the determination of where and with whom the child shall live. the right and duty
to protect, nurture, train and discipline the child, the duty of providing the child with
food, shelter, education, and medical care, and the right and responsibility to make
decisions of financial significance concerning the child. These obligations are subject
to any residual parental rights and responsibilities and rights and responsibilities of a
guardian if one has been appointed.").
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2

3

4

5

or she must be capable of competently advocating his or her
position; and he or she may still be denied standing if there is a
plaintiffmore directly affected by the challenged conduct in
question who has or is likely [0 bring suit.40

6
Plaintiff does not claim citizen-taxpayer standing to bring this case, nor is

7 plaintiff entitled to an inference of such standing as a matter ofright.°n Regardless, the

8 Department does not dispute that plaintiffs nonprofit corporation/law firm is a

9 legitimate advocacy organization or that the Complaint raises-at least in theory if not

10
in fact-issues of public significance. The Department does dispute, however, that

II

12
plaintiff is an appropriate party to bring this case. While the criteria for citizen-

13
taxpayer standing in Alaska are liberal by any measure, plaintiff has shown no true

14 adversity of interest, and there clearly exist parties more affected by the challenged

15 conduct. Therefore, plaintiff is an inappropriate party.

16 The leading case in Alaska on citizen-taxpayer standing is Trustees for

17
Alaska v. State. 42 In that case, a coalition of environmental, Native, and fishing groups

brought a declaratory judgment action to enjoin the state from enforcing its mineral

citizen-taxpayer analysis, finding in relevant part that plaintiffs were appropriate

leasing system.43 The court permitted the plaintiffs to maintain their case under the

Trustees/or Alaska v. State, 736 P.2d 324. 329 (Alaska 1987).

736 P.2d 324 (Alaska 1987).

!d.43

"
42

Ruckle v. Anchorage School District, 85 PJd 1030, 1034 (Alaska 2004)
(emphasis added).
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16

17

18

19
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because of their status as consumers of Alaska's natural resources, their adverse

interest with respect to affected mining claims, and the fact that the U.S, Attorney

General-the party whom the state alleged was a more appropriate plaintiff-was not

likely to sue and had an entirely different interest than existing plaintiffs in any event. 44

Trustees/or Alaska is easily distinguishable from the instant case. As

discussed above, plaintiff has not demonstrated an adverse interest. Unlike the

consumers of the natural resource at issue in Trustees/or Alaska, plaintiff here does not

allege to be-nor does plaintiff claim to represent or in any way be connected with-a

minor Medicaid recipient or child in state custody who has been prescribed or is taking

psychotropic medication. Thus, plaintiff can show no interest adverse to the conduct

alleged. The above-described persons or their designees would likely be the

appropriate plaintiffs in a case regarding the administration of psychotropic medication

to children in state custody.45 Their interest in the outcome of such a case would be

identical to the stated interest of the existing corporate plaintiff and there is no reason

[d. at 330.

Arguably, legislation, as opposed to litigation, is the most appropriate
way to deal with such issues.
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2

3 to presume that such persons, aggrieved by some specific action, would not sue to

4 redress it. 46

5 Here, plaintiff broadly alleges that Alaska's "children and youth" (not

6
defined in the Complaint) have the right not to be administered psychotropic drugs

7

8
unless the Department complies with various requirements that plaintiff believes the

9
Department should adopt.47 As stated above, the only specific allegations directed at

10 the Department are found at pages 50-52 of the Complaint, where plaintiff claims that

II the Department inappropriately administered and paid for psychotropic drugs to

12 Alaska's children and youth,48 The basis for this claim, explained only in these II

13 paragraphs of the Complaint, can be simply summarized as follows: the Department's

14
administration of and payment for these drugs exceeds evidence of safety and efficacy

15

16
and is not based on competent, knowledgeable decision-making and infonned

17
consent.49 Plainti ff makes no reference to any specific statutory violation in these

18 paragraphs. The only reference to any potential statutory violation is found at

Complaint at , 1.

fd. at" 218-228.

fd.

48

49

Citizen-taxpayer standing has been denied for less. See, e.g.. Kleven v.
Yukon-Koyukuk School Disl., 853 P.2d 518, 526 (Alaska 1993) (former school district
employee was denied citizen-taxpayer standing to air grievances against the school
district on the grounds that the district's current employees were more suitable
advocates better poised to raise the same grievances and there was no reason for the
court to believe such individuals would not do so).

"

19

24
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20 11---------­
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alleged state actions perpetrated on no one in particular do not constitute the "true

statutory duty to care for children in state custody.

where "no one seemed to be in a better position than the plaintiffs to complain of the

paragraphs 19-21 of the Complaint, where plaintiffsimply recites the Department's

Ruckle v. Anchorage School District, 85 P.3d 1030, 1037 (Alaska 2004).

736 P.2d at 328 (citing State v. Lewis, 559 P.2d 630 (Alaska 1977).52

The Complaint contains several pages on plaintiffs efforts to alert the
legislature to its concerns.

51

adversity of interest" required to maintain citizen-taxpayer standing. Surely there are

illegality" of the conduct in question.52 A policy agenda and a sweeping critique of

to citizen-taxpayer standing on a case-by-case basis.sl Such standing has been found

Courts should evaluate the propriety of individual plaintiffs with respect

represents. This campaign is appropriately directed to the legislature.50

without any alleged harm inflicted by the Department on plaintiff or anyone plaintiff

can be inferred--demonstrating plaintiffs required adversity of interest for purposes of

campaign to change the manner and procedure under which the Department operates

of children subject to the Department's duty of care. Instead, plaintiff is engaged in a

allege guardianship of such a child, and has not purported to represent a child or class

establishing citizen-taxpayer standing. Plaintiff is not a child in need of aid, does not

Accordingly, there is no provision in plaintiffs Complaint-and none

2
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more appropriate plaintiffs to raise such issues and, because of their true adversity.

would presumably be able to do so in a more concrete manner.

CONCLUSION

Plaintiffs Complaint is brought on behalf of no specific individual and

names Department employees who have no meaningful ability to remedy the conduct

alleged or administer the relief requested. Statutory mechanisms are already in place to

ensure that psychotropic medications are administered to children in Alaska in a

methodical, individualized, and constitutional manner. Insofar as plaintiff takes issue

with the adequacy of these existing legal mechanisms, such a grievance is more

appropriately directed to the legislature, not the executive branch or the judiciary.

Insofar as plaintiff disagrees with the practice of pediatric psychiatry and the culture of

pharmaceutical marketing and prescribing practices related to psychotropic medication,

those matters are not within the Department's meaningful control.

Plaintiff asserts no injury by the conduct complained of and therefore

fails the threshold requirement for interest-injury standing. Likewise, plaintiff is a

wholly inappropriate party under the citizen-taxpayer standing analysis. The court

should decline to exercise jurisdiction over an abstract complaint where even minimum

requirements for standing are not met.

For the foregoing reasons, plaintiff has failed to present a justiciable case

or controversy and demonstrate the threshold showing of standing required to bring
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and maintain this action. The Department is entitled to judgment on the pleadings as a

matter of law and the Complaint should be dismissed accordingly.

pI';
DATED this day of March, 2009.

RICHARD A. SVOBODNY
ACTING ATTORNEY GENERAL

By: u#tfL-
Elizabeth M. Bakalar
Assistant Attorney General
Alaska Bar No. 0606036

By: Stb;,
Chief Assistant Attorney General
Alaska Bar No. 9406040
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IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA
THIRD JUDICIAL DISTRICT

LAW PROJECT FOR PSYCHIATRIC
RIGHTS, Inc., an Alaskan non-profit
corporation,

Plaintiff,
vs.
STATE OF ALASKA, et al.,

Defendants.
Case No. 3AN 08-10 I ISCI

)
)
)
)
)
)
)

COpy
Origin., R_lYed

MAR 17 2009

OPPOSITION TO MOTION FOR EXPEDITED CONSIDERATION

Plaintiff, the Law Project for Psychiatric Rights (PsychRights"), opposes expedited

consideration of the Motion to Stay Discovery, especially on the schedule proposed by the

defendants, State of Alaska, et al (State). The Motion for Expedited Consideration

(Motion) is misleading about the necessity ofa decision by March 19,2009,' and about

PsychRights' position on the stay, as shown by the e-mail exchanges attached hereto as

Exhibits I and 2.

The following e-mail exchange occurred on February 24, 2009 between Ms.

Bakalar, counsel for the State, and Mr. Gottstein of PsychRights:

Jim,

In preparing for Dave Campana's upcoming deposition, Stacie and I have
taken a more extensive look at the complaint and we have concerns about
engaging in discovery at this point. As a result of our review we are
preparing a dispositive motion that we hope to file in the next two weeks.
Therefore we would request that you agree to postpone Dave's deposition
until after the court has ruled on our motion. Ifyoll are unable to agree to

I Also, instead of faxing or e-mailing a copy of the Motion, it put the Motion in the mail to
PsychRights on Thursday, March 12,2009, which was not received until the afternoon of
Monday, March 16,2009. This shortened the effective amount of time available by 4
days.
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that postponement, we'll file an expedited motion to quash the deposition on
similar grounds. We apologize for the late notice but we need to know by
COB today if you can agree to this plan.

Libby'

PsychRights replied:

Hi Libby,

I will agree to postpone it for two weeks or maybe a bit more, but I don't
think I can agree to anything that open-ended]

The State responded:

Good enough Jim, we understand that concern. Thanks for your
understanding and courtesy on this point and we will be in touch.
Procedurally, will you be issuing a notice that cancels Thursday's
deposition?4

PsychRights responded:

Hi Libby,

I will serve you with a re-notice of deposition for say three weeks out, which
when we get closer we will presumably have another discussion about,5

The State responded to this as follows:

That's fine, with the understanding that we're not agreeing to a date certain at
this point and re-notice will be subject to further discussions and/or motion
practice as we get closer to the time. So I believe we're on the same page
with how to proceed.6

, Exhibit I.
3 Exhibit I.
4 Exhibit I.
5 Exhibit I.
6 Exhibit I.

Opposition to Expedited Consideration Page 2
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On Sunday, March 15, 2009, not having heard anything from the State, including

not having been served with or given any notice of the State's Motion for Expedited

Consideration, PsychRights e-mailed the State as follows:

Hi Libby and Stacie

I figure we should reset Mr. Campana's deposition for at least a few days
after the response to OUf First Requests for Production are due. Do you
agree? Without waiving whatever right you have to object to the deposition,
do you have a preferred date and time?'

The next day, Monday, March 16,2009, as PsychRights had indicated to the State it

was willing to do, it has further extended the date for the deposition until April 9, 2009'

Thus, the necessity of deciding the Motion to Stay Discovery by March 19,2009

has been obviated.' However, it probably should be decided by April 9,2009.

DATED: March 17,2009.

Law Project for Psychiatric Rights

By:
J mes B. Gottstein
&A#7811100

'Exhibit 2.
8 Exhibit 3.
9 With an "n" of two, the State seems to have established a pattern of waiting until the last
minute in order to manufacture an exigency. As set forth above, the State waited until only
two days before the February 26, 2009 date that had been set for Mr. Campana's deposition
(to which the state had agreed) to ask for a delay and now waited so long that it is trying to
force PsychRights to respond to an extremely significant motion in less than three days.

Opposition to Expedited Consideration Page 3
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RE: Discovery in Psych Righls

Subject: RE: Discovery in Psych Rights
From: "Bakalar, Elizabeth M (LAW)" <libby.bakalar@alaska.gov>
Date: Tue, 24 Feb 2009 16:51: 10 ·0900

To: Jim Gottstein <jim.gonstein@psychrights.org>
CC: "Kraly, Stacie L (LAW)" <stacie.kraly@alaska.gov>

That's fine, with the understanding that we're not agreeing to a date certain at this point and re-notice will be sUbject to
further discussions andlor motion practice as we get closer to the lime. So I believe we're on the same page with how
to proceed.

libby Bakalar
Assistant Attorney General
Office of the Attorney General
P.O. Box 110300
Juneau, Alaska 99801-0300
(907) 465-4135 (direct)
(907) 465·3600 (main)
(907) 465-2539 (fax)

From: Jim Gottstein [mailto:jim.gottstein@psychrights.org]
Sent: Tuesday, February 24, 20094:17 PM
To: Bakalar, Elizabeth M (LAW)
Cc: Kraly, Stacie L (LAW); Usa Smith
Subject: Re: Discovery in Psych Rights

Hi Libby,

I will serve you with a re-notice of deposition for say three weeks out, which when we get closer we
will presumably have another discussion about.

Bakalar, Elizabetb M (LAW) wrote:
Good enough Jim, we understand that concern. Thanks for your understanding and courtesy on this point and we will
be in touch. Procedurally, will you be issuing a notice that cancels Thursday's deposition?

Libby Bakalar
Assistant Attorney General
Office of the Attorney General

P.O. Box 110300
Juneau, Alaska 99801-0300
(907) 465-4135 (direct)
(907) 465-3600 (main)
(907) 465-2539 (fax)

From: Jim Gottstein [mailto:iim.qottstein@psychrights.org]
Sent: Tuesday, February 24, 2009 3:51 PM
To: Bakalar, Elizabeth M (LAW)
Cc: Kraly, Stade L (LAW); Usa Smith
Subject: Re: Discovery in Psych Rights

Hi Libby,

I will agree to postpone it for two weeks or maybe a bit more, but I don't think Tcan agree to
anything tbat open-ended.

Exhibit 1, page 1 of 2
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RE: Discovery in Psych Rights

Bakalar, Elizabeth M (LAW) wrote:
Jim,

In preparing for Dave Campana's upcoming deposition, Stacie and I have taken a more extensive look at the complaint
and we have concerns about engaging in discovery at this point. As a result of our review we are preparing a
dispositive motion that we hope to file in the next two weeks. Therefore we would request that you agree to postpone
Dave's deposition until atter the court has ruled on our motion. If you are unable to agree to that postponement, we'll
file an expedited motion 10 quash the deposition on similar grounds. We apologize for the late notice but we need to
know by COB today if you can agree to this plan.

libby

Libby Bakalar
Assistant Attorney General
Office of the Attorney General

P.O. Box 110300
Juneau, Alaska 99801-0300
(907) 465-4135 (direct)
(907) 465-3600 (main)
(907) 465-2539 (fa,)

James B. (Jim) Gottstein. Esq.
President/CEO

Law Project for Psychiatric Rights
406 G Street, Suite 206

Anchorage, Alaska 99S0 I
USA
Phone: (907) 274-7686) Fax: (907) 274-9493
jim.gottstein[[at]]psychrights.org
htlp:l/psychrights.orgl

PsychRights.
Law Project for

Psychiatric Rights

The Law Project for Psychiatric Rights is a public interest law firm devoted to the defense of people facing
the horrors of forced psychiatric drugging. We are further dedicated to exposing the truth about these drugs
and the courts being misled into ordering people to be drugged and subjected to other brain and body
damaging interventions against their will. Extensive information about this is available on our web site,
http://psychrights.org/. Please donate generously. Our work is fueled with your IRS SOI(c) tax deductible
donations. Thank you for your ongoing help and support.

James B. (Jim) Gottstein, Esq.

Exhibit 1, page 2 of 2
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David Campana Deposition

Subject: David Campana Deposition
From: Jim Gottstein <jim.gottstein@psychrights.org>
Date: Sun, 15 Mar 2009 15:09:30 -0800
To: "Bakalar, Elizabeth M (LA W)" <libby.bakalar@alaska.gov>,Stacie Kraly <stacie.kraly@a(aska.gov>
CC: @psychrights.org, Lisa Smith <Lisa@psychrights.org>

Hi Libby and Stacie

I figure we should reset Mr. Campana's deposition for at least a few days after the response to our First Requests for
Production are due. Do you agree? Without waiving whatever right you have to object to the deposition, do you
have a preferred date and time?

James B. (Jim) Gottstein, Esq.
President/CEO

Law Project for Psychiatric Rights
406 G Street, Suite 206
Anchorage, Alaska 9950 I
USA
Phone: (907) 274-7686) Fax: (907) 274-9493
jim.gottstein[[at]]psychrights.org
http://psychrights.ond

PsychRights,.
Law Project for

Psychiatric Rights

The Law Project for Psychiatric Rights is a public interest law finn devoted to the defense ofpeople facing the
horrors of forced psychiatric drugging. We are further dedicated to exposing the truth about these drugs and the
courts being misled into ordering people to be drugged and subjected to other brain and body damaging interventions
against their will. Extensive infonnation about this is available on our web site, http://psychriehts.orgj.Pleasedonate
generously. Our work is fueled with your IRS 501Cc) tax deductible donations. Thank you for your ongoing help
and support.

Exhibit 2
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IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA
AT ANCI-IORGE

Law Project for Psychiatric Rights, Inc.,
Plaintiff(s)

Defendant(s)

vs.

State of Alaska, et aI.,

)
) RE-NOTICE OF TAKING
) DEPOSIT/ON DAVID CAMPANA
)
)
)

r;---,-;----;;-;-,-;-;;-;;-;c,-;-;-;c=----)
Case No. 3AN 08-10115 CI

TO:

Elizabeth M. Bakalar/Stacie L. Kraly
Attomey General's Office
P.O. Box 110300
Juneau, AK 998 J 1-0300

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that on behalf of Law Project for Psychiatric Rights,

Plaintiff, the deposition of David Campana has been changed to I:00 PM on the 9th

day of April, 2009, at the offices of the Law Project for Psychiatric Rights, 406 G

Street, Suite 206, Anchorage, Alaska 99501, before a court reporter. The designation of

materials to be produced is attached and yOll are invited to attend.

DATED: March 16,2009.
Law Project for Psychiatric Rights Inc.

i,! ,7
C':....' .j

By: c:+--=--=--.,--::----­
~11es B. Gottstein, Esq.

ABA # 7811100

Exhibit 3, page 1 of 2
S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 142



Attachment to David Campana Subpoena Duces Tecum

All documentation of computerized records relating lo payment (or reimbursement) by
Medicaid for psychotropic drugs prescribed to children and youth who have or had
claims for payment (or reimbursement) for psychotropic drugs from January I, 1999, to
date, including but not limited to:

(I) Manuals,
(2) File formal,
(3) File structure,
(4) The identity and meaning (including codes and/or lookup tables, etc,) of all

fields contained in such computerized records, and
(5) Examples of all report types.

Exhibit 3, page 2 of 2
S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 143



I .

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA
THIRD JUDICIAL DISTRICT AT ANCHORAGE

STATE OF ALASKA, SARAH PALIN,

LAW PROJECT FOR PSYCHIATRIC
RIGHS, an Alaskan non-profit corporation,

RECTI MAR 19 2009

Case No. 3AN-08-10115 CI

Defendants

Plaintiff,

vs.

)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)

Governor of the State of Alaska, )
ALASKA DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND)
SOCIAL SERVICES, WTLLIAM HOGAN, )
Commissioner, Department of Health and )
Social Services, TAMMY SANDOVAL, )
Director of the Office of Children's )
Services, STEVE McCOMB, Director of the )
Division of Juvenile Justice, MELISSA )
WITZLER STONE, Director of the Division of)
Behavioral Health, RON ADLER, )
Director/CEO of the Alaska Psychiatric )
Institute, WTLLIAM STREUER, Deputy )
Commissioner and Director of the Division of )
Health Care Services, )

)
)

------------ )

ORDER GRANTING STATE OF ALASKA'S MOTION FOR
EXPEDITED CONSIDERATION

Having reviewed the State of Alaska's Motion for Expedited

Consideration of its underlying Motion to Stay Discovery,.iRd aay resi30nsell thereto, _

ITIS~RED: L>A.O-,~'i~~a-.J)~
m Exp:.Jt~ration of said motion is GRANTED. 'I<

DATED this I~Vc day of ~, 2009.
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IN THE SUPERlOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA
THIRD JUDICIAL DISTRlCT

LAW PROJECT FOR PSYCHIATRlC
RlGHTS, Inc., an Alaskan non-profit
corporation,

Plaintiff,
vs.
STATE OF ALASKA, ef al.,

Defendants,
Case No. 3AN 08-10 I ISCI

)
)
)
)
)
)
)

COPy
Origins. Rl8Ce'Ved

MM ~ 1 2llD9

Clerk Of the! Trial Courts

OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO STAY DISCOVERY

Plaintiff, the Law Project for Psychiatric Rights (PsychRights'"), opposes the

Motion to Stay Discovery (Motion for Stay) filed by defendants State of Alaska, el al.,

(State). The Motion for Stay seeks a stay of all discovery pending determination of the

State's contemporaneously filed Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings.

The State's Motion for Stay is fundamentally flawed in two respects. First, the

burden and expense of the subject discovery does not outweigh its immense benefit to

Alaskan children and youth. The evidence is overwhelming that current pediatric

prescribing practices are improvident, largely ineffective, extremely harmful, and 000-

pharmacological approaches are far better. The evidence sought to be obtained regards the

actual practice of pediatric psychopharmacology to Alaskan children and youth in State

custody and through Medicaid, and the extent of the harm being done. The planned

discovery is anticipated to produce evidence entitling PsychRights to one or more

preliminary injunctions and at least partial summary judgment as to declaratory relief. The

harm being done to Alaskan children and youth should not be extended because of a stay

of discovery. Contrary to the State's abdication of responsibility in its Motion for

S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 145



Judgment on the Pleadings, it has the affirmative duty to protect the safety of children and

youth in its custody. The fulfillment of this duty should not be further delayed.

Second, contrary to the Statels assertion, the pending Motion for Judgment on the

Pleadings is not likely to dispose of the entire case. The sole legal basis asserted is lack of

standing, which is in itself unmeritorious and in any event, can be addressed by naming

additional plaintiffs. In addition, the Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings complains

about a lack of specificity in the Amended Complaint and goes outside the pleadings.

Under such circumstances discovery must be allowed to proceed.

I. The Standards for Staying Discovery

In support of its Motion for Stay the State argues that a stay of discovery is within

the discretion of the Court and appropriate pending determination of a dispositive motion,

citing to the Alaska case of Karen L. v. State Dept. ofHealth and Social Services, Div. of

Family and Youth Services, I and some federal cases.

However, Karen L. is completely inapplicable because it involves the situation

where government officials were sued personally and not, as here, in their official capacity.

In Karen L., the question was whether discovery could be stayed pending a determination

of official immunity. PsychRights found no other Alaska cases concerning when or under

what circumstances a stay of discovery might be warranted and the State cited none in

their motion. However, the federal cases cited by the State do not support its position that

discovery should be stayed here.

I 953 P.2d 871, 879 (Alaska 1998).

Opposition to Motion to Stay Discovery Page 2
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In Chavous v. District ofColumbia Financial Responsibility and Management

Assistance,2 the district court held:

A trial court "ordinarily should not stay discovery which is necessary to
gather facts in order to defend against [aJ motion [to dismiss]." ("discovery
should precede consideration ofdispositive motions when the facts sought to
be discovered are relevant to consideration of the particular motion at
hand.").'

In Williamson v. Us. Dept. ofAgriculture,' also cited by the State, the Fifth Circuit

held "if discovery could uncover one or more substantial fact issues, appellant was entitled

to reasonable discovery to do so," and that in such circumstances a stay ofdiscovery would

be an abuse of discretion.

The cases cited by the State have reviewed and considered the specific discovery

requests and determined there was no prejudice in staying discovery.5 Here, the State

seeks a blanket stay of discovery without showing any of the discovery is in any way

unwarranted, or even burdensome, let alone that it would not lead to evidence that might

be relevant to the Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings' As will be shown below, the

2201 F.R.O. 1,3 (OD.C., 2001).
3 Citation omitted.
4 815 F.2d 368, 373 (CAS 1987).
5 Karen L. v. State Dept. ofHealth and Social Services, Div. ofFamily and Youth Services,
953 P.2d 871, 879 (Alaska 1998); Schism v. US., 316 F.3d 1259, 1300 (C.A.Fed.2002);
Brazos Valley Coalition for Life, Inc. v. City ofBryan, 421 F.3d 314, 327 (CAS 2005);
James Madison Ltd. by Hecht v. Ludwig, 82 F.3d 1085, 1096 (C.A.D.C. 1996); Chavous v.
District ofColumbia Financial Responsibility, 201 F.R.D. I (DD.C. 2001).
6 Since the dispositive motion is one for judgment on the pleadings pursuant to Civil Rule
12(c), the presumption is that discovery would not be relevant. However, the State's
Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings goes outside the pleadings. In addition, the Motion
for Judgment on Pleadings complains about a lack of specificity in the Amended
Complaint and the discovery PsychRights will be seeking can supply such specificity.

Opposition to Motion to Stay Discovery Page 3
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discovery requested to date is extremely modest and PsychRights has fashioned a focused

discovery plan proceeding in a logical order. Delaying discovery will lengthen the time

that Alaskan children and youth will not have the opportunity to have a motion for

preliminary injunction filed on their behalf and a delay of much time could be very

counterproductive by necessitating broader, less focused and less ordered discovery

requests in order to get it done before the trial date.

Ultimately, as the district court in Chavous noted:

In the determination of whether to stay discovery while pending dispositive
motions are decided, the trial court Uinevitably must balance the harm
produced by a delay in discovery against the possibility that [a dispositive]
motion will be granted and entirely eliminate the need for such discovery."?

This seems right and to the extent the Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings is decided

soon, the prejudice will be lessened. But what if the State files a series of motions it

characterizes as "dispositive?"

The Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings, while it includes inaccurate and

extraneous statements of counsel regarding factual matters, is legally grounded entirely on

the extremely dubious contention that PsychRights lacks standing under Alaska's liberal

standing requirements. This seems clearly rejected under Trustees for Alaska v. Slale of

Alaska' and its progeny.

However, PsychRights can not safely ignore the unsupported assertions of counsel

contained in the Motion for Judgment on the pleadings, and thus under the authority cited

7 Id.

, 736 P.2d 324 (Alaska 1987).

Opposition to Motion to Stay Discovery Page 4
S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 148



by the State, as set forth above, it is necessary to discuss the merits and the evidence

PsychRights seeks in discovery.

II. The Merits

In this action, PsychRights seeks declaratory and injunctive relief that Alaskan

children and youth have the right to prevent defendants from authorizing the

administration of or paying for the administration of psychotropic drugs to them unless and

until:

(i) evidence-based psychosocial interventions have been exhausted,

(ii) ratinnally anticipated benefits of psychotropic drug treatment outweigh
the risks,

(iii) the person or entity authorizing administration oflhe drug(s) is fully
informed of the risks and potential benefits, and

(iv) close monitoring of, and appropriate means of responding to, treatment
emergent effects are in place.9

The State's defense is revealed in its Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings, and

consists of the complete abdication of responsibility:

[The defendants] have no meaningful ability to remedy the conduct alleged or
administer the relief requested". 10

Without getting far into the legal analysis here, the State's position is untenable. At a

minimum, once the State has taken custody of a child or youth, the United States Supreme

Court has held if the State,

9 See, ~l of Amended Complaint and §A of PsychRights' Prayer for Relief.
10 Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings, page 20.
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fails to provide for his basic human needs-e.g., food, clothing, shelter, medical care,
and reasonable safety-it transgresses the substantive limits on state action set by the
Eighth Amendment and the Due Process Clause. JJ

Thus, the State may not divest itself of at least these Constitutional responsibilities by what

is uniformly a process whereby parents (and the courts) are provided false infonnation

about the psychotropic drugs and parents regularly coerced into giving consent.

In its Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings the State goes on to state:

Insofar as plaintiff disagrees with the practice of pediatric psychiatry and the culture
of phannaceuticaI marketing and prescribing practices related to psychotropic
medication, those matters are not within the Department's meaningful control. 12

Here, the State admits court intervention is required to protect the children and youth of

whom it has taken custody. If the State is incapable of protecting the children and youth in

its custody from harmful psychiatric drugging, this Court must step in and do so. It is their

right. Of course, this depends on PsychRights proving the current "culture of

pharmaceutical marketing ll and pediatric psychopharmacology is indeed harming the

children and youth of whom the state has seized custody. PsychRights is refraining from

loading up this opposition to the State's Motion to Stay Discovery with the piles of

evidence on this, but has no doubt it will establish this. In fact, the State does not truly

dispute this 13 and PsychRights is not seeking discovery from the State on this issue.

JJ DeShaney v. Winnebaga Caunty Department afSacial Services, 489 U.S. 189,200, 109
S.Ct. 998,1005 (1989).
J2 Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings, page 20.
13 In its Answer, the state responds that it !lis without sufficient information to admit or
deny the substance" of PsychRights' allegations regarding the lack of scientific support for
the bulk of pediatric psychopharmacology, the great harm it causes, and the far better
results achieved if non pharmacological approaches. It is the State's responsibility to
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However, there are issues raised in the State's Motion for Judgment on the

Pleadings for which PsychRights does seek discovery from the State. The first is to rebut

the unsupported and untrue assertion made by the State in its Motion for Judgment on the

Pleadings that the State has nothing to do with authorizing and administering psychotropic

drugs to children and youth whom it has taken away from their parent(s).14 The second is

to supply the lack of specificity regarding the State's inappropriate payment for and

administration of psychotropic drugs to Alaskan children and youth. IS

Ill. Discovery Plan

PsychRights has a very focused discovery plan designed to develop evidence in a

logical order and minimize the burden on both sides. 16 The first step is to obtain

information on the State's computerized records to enable PsychRights to fashion a

focused discovery request to extract relevant information. The second step is to obtain

evidence regarding how pediatric psychopharmacology is actually practiced on Alaskan

children and youth in State custody and through Medicaid. This involves information from

both the State and other parties, such as psychiatrists. In addition PsychRights intends to

seek negative data about the drugs that have heretofore been hidden by pharmaceutical

know. Moreover, PsychRights specifically provided the scientific analysis, including
references even prior to bringing suit. See, Exhibit G. to Amended Complaint.
14 Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings, p. 5 ("In short, the administration of
psychotropic medication to children in Alaska is a decision left to the parent or legal
~uardian of the child, or to the superior court.").
, Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings, pp 8-9, 18.

16 For example, PsychRights was originally going to notice a Civil Rule 30(b)(6)
deposition covering a large number of topics, but has been working to refine its discovery
so as to minimize the burden on all concerned.
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companies as well as the improper promotion of pediatric psychopharmacology by

pharmaceutical companies.

IV. Currently Requested Discovery

Attached hereto as Exhibits A & B. respectively, are the Notice of Deposition for

Mr. David Campana and PsychRights' First Requests for Production. 17 The only items

sought are (1) information about the State's computerized records so that PsychRights can

fashion requests for production informed by knowledge of what data is available and how

it is organized, and (2) the records of seven specific individuals who are or have been in

the custody of the State and who have authorized and directed the State to provide such

infonnation. 18

A. The David Campana Deposition

On January 29, 2009, PsychRights e-mailed the State as follows:

Can we meet informally with David Campana in the near future to fonnulate a
request for production of computerized Medicaid records rather than take his
deposition. What I'd like to do is meet with him with our computer person to
formulate the request for production. I am not asking that you waive any rights to

b· cd' 19o ~ect to a request lor pro uctlOn.

The State responded that it would prefer to conduct a formal deposition" and the parties

agreed to conduct the deposition on February 26, 2009'\ However, two days before the

scheduled deposition, the State e-mailed:

17 The First Requests for Production includes identifying information which has been
redacted from the copy attached hereto.
\8 See, Exhibit B, pages 8-14.
\9 Exhibit C, page 2.
" Exhibit C, page I.
2\ See, Exhibit D.
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In preparing for Dave Campana's upcoming deposition, Stacie and I have
taken a more extensive look at the complaint and we have concerns about
engaging in discovery at this point. As a result of our review we are
preparing a dispositive motion that we hope to file in the next two weeks.
Therefore we would request that you agree to postpone Dave's deposition
until after the court has ruled on our motion. Ifyou are unable to agree to
that postponement, we'll file an expedited motion to quash the deposition on
similar grounds. We apologize for the late notice but we need to know by
COB today if you can agree to this plan."

PsychRights replied:

I will agree to postpone it for two weeks or marbe a bit more, but I don't
think I can agree to anything that open-ended.'

The State responded:

Good enough Jim, we understand that concern. Thanks for your
understanding and courtesy on this point and we will be in touch.
Procedurallr" will you be issuing a notice that cancels Thursday's
deposition? 4

PsychRights responded:

I will serve you with a re-notice of deposition for say three weeks out, which
when we get closer we will presumably have another discussion about,2s

The State responded to this as follows:

That's fine, with the understanding that we're not agreeing to a date certain at
this point and re-notice will be subject to further discussions and/or motion
practice as we get closer to the time. So I believe we're on the same page
with how to proceed.26

Instead of further discussion, the State filed the instant Motion to Stay Discovery.

22 Exhibit E, page 2.
23 Exhibit E, page I.
24 ld.

" ld.
26 Jd.
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As mentioned above, the primary purpose of the Campana Deposition is simply to

learn about the State's computerized Medicaid records in order to fashion requests for

production pertaining thereto. This should be easy for the State to do, especially since it

has already assembled this information in connection with Alaska v. Eli Lilly & Ca., 3AN

06-05630 CI.27

B. First Requests for Production

(1) Descriptions of Computerized Records

Mr. Campana's deposition was noticed under the concept that conducting it would

serve as a template for obtaining infonnation about the other relevant computerized

records of the State. However, due to the State's delaying the deposition for an extended

period of time, PsychRights determined it had to at least get the ball rolling on acquiring

the information on all of the State's computer systems relevant to the authorization and

administration of psychotropic drugs to children and youth in order to fashion specific

requests for production of reIevant computerized records. Thus, on March 3, 2009,

PsychRights served its First Requests for Production, requesting infonnation on the

structure of the computerized records for not only the Medicaid database, but those by the

other agencies involved, to wit: the Office of Children's Services, the Division of Juvenile

Justice, the Alaska Psychiatric Institute and the Division of Behavioral health. These

requests for production asked for the following information:

1. Software utilized,
2. Manuals,
3. File format,

27 Exhibit F.
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4. File structure,
5. The identity and meaning (including codes andlor lookup tables, etc.) of all

fields contained in such com~~terized records, and
6. Examples of all report types.

Again, the purpose of these requests is to enable PsychRights to fashion focused

requests for production of relevant computerized records. It is PsychRights' expectation

that this will obviate the need for broad requests for production of individual paper case

files. However, to the extent PsychRights is left with insufficient time to first obtain the

information on the data structure of the computerized records. then obtain the relevant

computerized records, and then obtain focused and/or randomly generated case files. it

may be forced to serve requests for production of all the case files.

While at first blush it seems there is plenty of time, by all indications the State is

going to object every step of the way and time will be used up at each step. IfPsychRights

is left without sufficient time to go through the steps that will allow it to fashion focused

discovery requests, it will be forced to seek broader discovery.

(2) Seven Specific Case Files

The only other discovery requested to date are the case files of seven Alaskan youth

who are or have been in State custody and who have, to the extent oftheir authority.

authorized and directed the State to provide PsychRights with the requested information."

28 Exhibit B, pages 4-6.
"See, Exhibit B, pages 7-14. Again, the identifying information has been redacted
because it does not appear there is any reason why it should be included in this public
filing and it is not believed the identity of the specific persons involved is relevant to the
Court's consideration.
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If the State has objections to providing these records, it should make such objections

known now so they can be considered in an orderly manner.

V. Contemplated Discovery

A. Psychiatrists, the Public and the State Have Been Duped Into
Giving Children and Youth Ineffective and Dangerous Drugs

One of the key questions in this case is why psychiatrists are prescribing and

custodians are authorizing the administration of extremely improvident and harmful

psychiatric drugs to children and youth. The answer is that the pharmaceutical companies

have been very effectively illegally promoting their use, especially the neuroleptics, such

as Risperdal, Seroquel, Zyprexa, Abilify and Geodon.

Grace E. Jackson, MD, who has been qualified as an expert witness in a number of

PsychRights' adult forced psychiatric drugging cases," testified in May of2008, about

how psychiatrists are being misled by the drug companies into improvident prescribing.

So essentially what happened in the 1990s is that the journals, more than ever
before in history, became a tool of marketing, a marketing arm for the drug
companies. And drug companies shifted in terms of previous research in the
United States.

Most of the research had previously been funded by the government and
conducted in academic centers. In the 1990s, that was pretty much over, and
most of the funding is now coming from the pharmaceutical industry. So
that's really in a nutshell what happened in the 1990s when I was training.

Now, where are we now? What that means is that the journals that most
doctors are relying upon for their continuing information continued to be
dominated by pharmaceutical industry funded studies and by papers which

30 See, e.g., Exhibit L, page 3 (Transcript page III, lines 12-18).
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are being written, ifnot entirely by the drug companies, then by authors who
have part of their finances paid for by the drug companies. 31

In a 2007 article, Pediatric Bipolar Disorder: An Object Study in the Creation of an

IIIness,12 the Scottish psychopharmacology expert, David Healy, MD, describes, among

other things, how academics have become marketing arms of the phannaceutical

companies instead of objective researchers. This has recently been further buttressed

through documents obtained in discovery and recently made public from various lawsuits.

(1) RisperdallJoseph Biederman, MDlHarvard's Mass General Hospital
and the Johnson & Johnson Cetner for Pediatric Psychopathology

On November 25, 2008, the New York Times ran a story titled, Research Center

Tied to Drug Company,33 about Joseph Biederman, MD, and his undisclosed payments by

Johnson & Johnson to produce "academic" research in support of prescribing Risperdal to

children and youth as young as four. 34 The article describes the vast influence Dr.

Biederman has had in the explosion of prescribing the dangerous neuroleptics,3S

Dr. Biederman's work helped to fuel a 40-fold increase from 1994 to 2003 in
the diagnosis of pediatric bipolar disorder and a rapid rise in the use of
powerful, risky and expensive antipsychotic medicines in children. Although
many of his studies are small and often financed by drug makers, Dr.
Biederman has had a vast influence on the field largely because of his
position at one of the most prestigious medical institutions in the world.

In his recent deposition Dr. Biederman testified as follows:

J] Exhibit L, page 5 (Transcript page 119).
32 Exhibit H.
33 Exhibit L
34 Exhibit K, p.2, 4.
3S This class of drugs is also often referred to by the misnomer, "antipsychotic." See, e.g.,
Sutherland v. Estate ofRitter, 959 So. 2d 1004, 1006 oj (Miss. 2007)
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Q. And do you agree that you are one of the most forceful advocates of the
aggressive [psychiatric drug] treatment of preschoolers? ...

36A. I am.

Later in his deposition, Dr. Biederman admitted that he promoted the use of

Risperdal in children as young as pre-schoolers (ages four to six37
), even though no one

knows what Risperdal does to the brain and there are no long term studies.38

One of the recently unsealed documents includes an e-mail exchange about the

Johnson & Johnson Center for Pediatric Psychopathology (J&J Center), in which Dr.

Biederman, the Center's leader is recognized as "the pioneer in the area of [Child &

Adolescent] Bipolar Disorders",39 and that

He approached Janssen multiple times to propose the creation ofa Janssen­
MGH center for [Child & Adolescent] Bipolar disorders. The rationale of this
center is to generate and disseminate data supporting the use of risperidone in
this patient population.4o

Johnson & Johnson funded the center and the 2002 Annual Report states:

The mission of the Center is to create a common ground for a strategic
collaboration between Johnson & Johnson (J&J) and the Pediatric
Psychopharmacology Research Program an[d] at the Massachusetts General
Hospital (MGH).... An essential feature of the Center is ... it will move
forward the commercial goals ofJ&J....

Equally important ... is the demonstration of the validity of [child
psychiatric] disorders. ... Without such data, many clinicians question the
wisdom of aggressively treating children with medication, especially those

36 Exhibit K, p. 4 from February 27, 2009, deposition transcript of Joseph Biederman
37 Exhibit K, p. 2.
38 Exhibit K, p. 5.
39 In his deposition, Dr. Biederman agreed that he was one of the leaders and that he is
considered a "world-renowned child psychiatrist. 1t Exhibit K, p. 3.
"Exhibit J, emphasis added.
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like the neuroleptics, which expose children to potentially serious adverse
events." . ..

We will generate and publish data on the efficacy and safety of medications
for ... child psychopathology. This work is an essential precursor to the . ..
widespread use of medications given that most must be used off-labeL. ..

Many children with psychopathology never receive medical treatment due to
controversies in the media and debates among professionals about the
validity of psychiatric diagnoses in children.41

...

To have an impact on clinical practice, research results from the Center must
be disseminated through scientific publications, presentations and national
and international meetings and continuing education programs. Our program

fd ' ... 'II 42o Issemmatlon IS as 10 ows: ...

In 2002, we made progress in the following areas: ...

• We disseminated the results of our work [at] national and international
meetings.

• We prepared initial manuscripts for publication. ...
• We developed and maintained a schedule of regular communication

with 1&1 staff to facilitate collaborative efforts.
• We initiated Yearly Meetings of Experts in Bipolar Disorder43

To address the controversy about pediatric bipolar disorder, we initiated a
multi-year conference series which seeks to establish a forum for researchers
and clinicians to improve dialogue and foster collaborative studies about
children who present with extreme temper tantrums and dysregulated
mood. 44

Then Dr. Biederman states that the Center's plans for the future include establishing the

efficacy of Risperdal for (the controversial diagnosis or") pediatric Bipolar Disorder

(BPD) and Obsessive Compulsive Disorder (OCD)."

41 Exhibit S, p. 3-4, emphasis added.
42 Exhibit S, p. 6.
43 Exhibit S, p. 7.
44 Exhbit S, p. 16.
" See, Exhibit S, p. 4.
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The 2003 Business Plan for the J&J Center shows Dr. Biederman's plans to use the

J&J Center as a front to (1) "re-analyze" the safety database," and (2) deal with the

problem that Risperdal is not approved for any indication for pediatric use." The 2003

Business Plan presentation also discusses the opportunities for partnerships with advocacy

groups, which means funding of groups such as the National Alliance for the Mentally 111

to promote its use in children and youth.49

These documents show in more detail what Dr. Jackson testified to, and Dr. Healy

wrote about, as set forth above, how "Key Opinion Leaders" are being paid handsomely to

prostitute their academic positions to promote the commercial interests of their drug

company sponsors.

Dr. Biederman's egregious conduct in this regard recently prompted United States

Senator Grassly, just a few days ago, on March 20, 2009, to write to the presidents of

Harvard University and Massachusetts General Hospital (MGH), which house the J&J

Center, about their organizations being used to produce and disseminate what appears to be

fraudulent information in support of prescribing Risperdal to children and youth. 50

46 Exhibit S, page 18.
" Exhibit T, page 3
"Exhibit T, page 4,5.
49 Exhibit T, page 3, 4. Dr. Healy also mentions these parent pressure groups in his article
about the creation of pediatric bipolar disorder. Exhibit H, p. I
50 Exhibit M.
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(2) Eli Lilly and Zyprexa

Eli Lilly & Co (Lilly) recently plead guilty to the illegal marketing of Zyprexa to

the elderly and agreed to pay $1.4 Billion in criminal and civil fines." While Lilly may

have been able to negotiate away pleading guilty to the off-label promotion ofZyprexa to

children and youth, Dr. Healy noted that Lilly had identified the potential for marketing

Zyprexa to the children and youth market as early as 1997."

At the January 17,2007, hearing in In Re: Zyprexa Litigation (Zyprexa MDL),'3 the

following testimony was presented about the illegal off-label marketing ofZyprexa

revealed by previously secret documents:

[T]he documents document the fact that Eli Lilly knew that the -- that
Zyprexa causes diabetes. They knew it from a group of doctors that they
hired who told them you have to come clean. That was in 2000. And instead
of warning doctors who 3re widely prescribing the drug, Eli Lilly set about in
an aggressive marketing campaign to primary doctors. Little children 3re
being given this drug. Little children 3fe being exposed to horrific diseases
that end their lives shorter.54

(3) Astra-Zeneca and Seroquel

In Re: Seroquel Products Liability Litigatian (Seroquel MDL)" is a consolidation

of many products liability lawsuits against the manufacturer ofSeroquel, AstraZeneca, for,

among other things, (a) AstraZenecats concealment of Seroquel's propensity to cause

diabetes and other related life threatening and deadly conditions, (b) illegal off-label

" See, Exhibit G.
" Exhibit H, n 39.
53 MDL 04-1596, United States District Court for the Eastern District ofNew York.
54 Exhibit W, page 3.
55 Multi-District Litigation (MDL) Case #: 6:06-md-01769-ACC-DAB, United States
District Court, Middle District of Florida
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marketing, and (c) violation of state consumer protection laws, including AS 40.50.471, et

56seq.

As is apparently typical in these cases,57 a global protective order was entered under

which over 30 million pages of material was produced in discovery,S8 with various

mechanisms for their becoming unsealed.59 On December 12,2008, the plaintiffs

challenged the confidentiality designation of over 60 of these documents, which under §12

of the protective order caused them to automatically lose confidentiality protection unless

AstraZeneca filed a motion to maintain confidentiality within 30 days.60 AstraZeneca filed

such a motion on January 12,2009," and a hearing on the motion set for February 26,

20086
'

On February 9, 2009, PsychRights e-mailed the lead plaintiffs' attorney, Camp

Bailey, indicating it anticipated having a subpoena issued to take Mr. Bailey's deposition

and obtain (a) certain specified documents, (b) information on other negative effects, (c)

unpublished studies, including those involving children and youth, and (d) documents

56 Master Complaint, Docket No. 42. 86(a) is the allegation regarding the Alaska
consumer protection violation count, which, along with the rest of the public docket in the
Seroquel MDL case is available on PACER, the United States Court System's eleclronic
access system, and of which this Court can take public notice.
S1 Without comparing them word for word, the protective order in the Seroquel MDL
afpears to be substantially identical to the one in the Zyprexa MDL.
5 In Re: Seroquel MDL, Docket No. 1222, p. 5.
" In Re: Seroquel MDL, Docket No. 478.
60 In Re: Seroquel MDL, Docket No. 478.
61 In Re: Seroquel MDL, Docket No. 1222.
62 See, Exhibit R, page I.
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regarding the promotion ofSeroquel for pediatric use.63 Under 14 of the protective order,

upon being served with such a subpoena Mr. Bailey is required to notify AstraZeneca,

cooperate with AztraZeneca, and give them a reasonable opportunity to object, prior to

producing the documents.64

The parties agreed to the release of many of the documents before the February 26,

2009, hearing and on February 27, 2009, a number of documents were unsealed, including

a July, 2008, Clinical Overview on Weight Gain in Pediatric Patients on Seroquel.6S It

seems as a result of this study, on December 18,2008, in a letter that was also unsealed on

February 27, 2009, the Food and Drug Administration directed AstraZeneca to advise

doctors through the labeling that the safety and effectiveness of Seroquel has not been

established for pediatric patients and is not approved for patients under the age of 18

years.66 As far as PsychRights has been able to detennine, at this point, this warning has

yet to be conveyed to doctors through the directed changes to the label.

The unsealed documents include e-mails regarding AstraZeneca's suppression of

unfavorable studies while promoting favorable data:

There has been a precedent set regarding "cherry picking" of data. This
would be the recent Velligan presentations ofcognitive function data from
Trial 15 (one of the buried trials). Thus far, I am not aware of any
repercussions regarding interest in the unreported data.

That does not mean that we should continue to advocate this practice. There
is growing pressure from outside the industry to provide access to all data

63 Exhibit R.
64 In Re: Seroquel MDL, Docket No. 478.
6' Exhibit O.
66 Exhibit N, page 2.
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resulting from clinical trials conducted by industry. Thus far, we have buried
Trials 15,31,56, and are now considering COSTAR.

The larger issue is how do we face the outside world when they begin to
criticize us for suppressing data.67

On March 18,2009, the Washington Post reported as follows about "Study 15:"

The results of Study 15 were never published or shared with doctors, even as
less rigorous studies that came up with positive results for Seroquel were
published and used in marketing campaigns aimed at physicians and in
television ads aimed at consumers. The results of Study 15 were provided
only to the Food and Drug Administration -- and the agency has strenuously
maintained that it does not have the authority to place such studies in the
public domain. ...

The saga of Study 15 has become a case study in how drug companies can
control the publicly available research about their products, along with other
practices that recently have prompted hand-wringing at universities and
scientific journals, remonstrations by medical groups about conflicts of
interest, and threats of exposure by trial lawyers and congressional
watchdogs. 68

It appears Study 15 may have been unsealed on March 13,2009, and PsychRights is

attempting to get it reviewed. However, it also appears with other documents of interest to

PsychRights produced in the In Re: Seroquel MDL are still being kept secret, including (I)

Study 144, Study 125 and its draft manuscript, Study 165, Study 127, (2) the

Investigational New Drug Application (IND) to the FDA, and (3) marketing call notes.69

B. The Necessity of Determining the Bases Upon Which Current
Pediatric Psychopharmacology'is Practiced.

It is necessary for PsychRights to be able to depose at least a few child psychiatrists,

and perhaps other physicians and other people prescribing psychotropic drugs to Alaskan

67 See, Exhibit P, p. 2. That Trial 15 is still buried is revealed
68 Exhibit Q.
69 Exhibit R, pages 4 & 5.
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children and youth, to have them disclose upon what they are relying in doing so. In

addition, since it is illegal for the State to use Medicaid to pay for medications unless they

are prescribed for FDA approved indications or included in three specified compendia,7o

and nearly all prescriptions of psychotropic medications to children and youth are off

label,71 it is essential that these prescribers identify where in such compendia such

prescribing is included. It is expected that, especially with respect to the neuroleptics and

the anti-seizure medications re-branded as "mood stabilizers," they are prescribing these

drugs based on off-label marketing by the pharmaceutical companies masquerading as

science. Even with respect to the stimulants, such as Ritalin, which have been approved

for children and youth, the truth is there is a lack of data supporting long-term efficacy or

safety,72 and it is necessary for PsychRights to learn upon what these prescribers are

relying for these drugs as well in order to demonstrate to this Court such prescribing

practices are not in Alaskan children and youth's best interests.

Starting in mid-February, PsychRights started trying to coordinate deposition

schedules for some psychiatrists with the State's schedule, wanting to give everyone at

70 Ex Rei Franklin v Parke Davis, 147 F.Supp.2d 39 (DMass2001).
71 Exhibit S, page 3 ("[N]early all psychiatric medication use in children is offlabel").
n See, ~s 154, 156-165 of the Amended Complaint herein; APA Working Group on
Psychoactive Medications for Children and Adolescents. (2006); and Report of the
Working Group on Psychoactive Medications for Children and Adolescents.
Psychopharmacological, psychosocial, and combined interventions for childhood
disorders: Evidence-base, contextual factors, and future directions, Washington, DC:
American Psychological Association; National Institute of Mental Health Multimodal
Treatment Study of ADHD Follow-up: 24-Month Outcomes of Treatment Strategies for
Attention-DeficitlHyperactivity Disorder, MTA Cooperative Group, American Academy
alPediatrics, 113;754-761 (2004)
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least a month to prepare.73 To the extent discovery is stayed for any length of time, the

luxury of being able to give the psychiatrists so much notice and accommodate the State's

schedule will be diminished.

Most importantly, it is anticipated that this discovery will result in grounds for one

or more preliminary injunctions because of the extreme harm being inflicted on Alaskan

children and youth by these practices. No further delay should be countenanced. It is also

anticipated that this discovery will result in grounds for at least a partial summary

judgment for declaratory relief.74

C. The Necessity of Developing the True Involvement of the State.

In its Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings the State asserts the administration of

psychiatric drugs to children and youth in its custody "is left to the parent or legal guardian

of the child, or to the superior court."" This is disingenuous at best" and PsychRights

intends to conduct focused discovery to show the State's true involvement. It is

PsychRights understanding, the "consents" are virtually always obtained because one or

73 Exhibit D, p.1.
74 The State has essentially admitted it is not protecting the children and youth in its care
and this discovery will provide the detail for the declaratory judgment aspect. The more
difficult task will be to fashion the injunctive relief if the State continues to be unwilling to
voluntarily take the appropriate steps. It is PsychRights hope that if such preliminary relief
is obtained, the State and PsychRights will be able to fashion a program that will only
authorize the administration of psychotropic medications to Alaskan children and youth in
state custody or through Medicaid in appropriate circumstances and under appropriate
conditions.
" Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings, p. 5.
"It is also patently untrue because under AS 47.10.084, if parental rights have been
terminated and there is no guardian, which is often the case, these residual parental rights
accrue to the State.
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more of the defendants seek such consent (or court order) and that parents are often

subjected to extreme pressure to agree to the psychiatric drugging of their children. Thus,

another aspect of PsychRights' discovery plan is to have the defendants disclose the

sources and information it is

(a) relying upon in deciding to seek, and

(b) providing in obtaining,

parental consent and court orders.

Assuming PsychRights obtains the computerized records it intends to seek,

PsychRights is contemplating generating a random sample of case files for review to get an

objective view of the actual process. Because of the expectation that the State will

interpose every objection it can to each and every one of PsychRights' discovery requests,

there is likely to be a series of motions related thereto, which will be the occasion for

further delay which could seriously jeopardize the entire discovery plan.

For example, even with respect to obtaining information about the file structures of

the State's computerized records in order to be able to fashion a discovery request to obtain

the actual computerized records, the State first refused to infonnally provide the

information, then it agreed to a deposition date, and then at the last minute it moved for the

instant stay. This has been going on since January.77

As set forth above, there is an extant request for production of seven case files, for

which authorizations have been given and, based on the State's past behavior one can

77 See, Exhibit C., page 2.
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expect it will even object to providing that information, necessitating a motion to compel.

For example, on January 20, 2009, the State raised the issue of state confidentiality laws in

connection with getting a qualified protective order in place under federal law and

PsychRights asked it to identify such laws.78 The State has thus far failed to do so, but can

be expected to interpose it when it has to do so. Presumably the State will do so in

response to PsychRights First Requests for Production, served March 3, 2009, and this

should not be further delayed.

Just as discovery of what prescribers are relying upon in giving psychotropic drugs

to Alaskan children and youth is likely to generate evidence for one or more preliminary

injunctions and partial summary judgments, the discovery sought from the State is likely to

do the same. Stopping Alaskan children and youth from being subjected to these

improvidently administered and harmful drugs should not be delayed through a stay of

discovery.

In addition, as set forth above, in Chavaus, which the State cited, the court held a

trial court ordinarily should not stay discovery which is necessary to gather facts in order

to defend against a motion to dismiss and that discovery should precede consideration of

dispositive motions when the facts sought to be discovered are relevant to consideration of

the particular motion at hand. In its Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings the State

asserts it plays no role in the psychiatric drugging of children and youth in its custody and

through Medicaid. The State bringing this issue into the Motion for Judgment on the

78 Exhibit U.
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Pleadings, even though it was not supported by any competent evidence, means

PsychRights must be allowed to conduct discovery on the issue before this Court may

properly consider it.

D. The Necessity of Obtaining Pharmaceutical Company Off­
Label Marketing Information

In addition to deposing some psychiatrists and other prescribers regarding the off-

label marketing to which they have been subjected by the drug companies, PsychRights

intends to seek such materials directly from the pharmaceutical companies and/or from

parties having access to discovery depositories concerning these matters. It seems likely

that the pharmaceutical companies will object and to the extent that deponents can not be

served in Alaska, a commission/letter rogatory for an out of state subpoena must be

obtained pursuant to Civil Rule 28(b) and then procedures pursued in another state to have

a subpoena issued and enforced. This very well might consume a considerable amount of

time -- even to the point of still being unresolved as of the date trial is scheduled. There is

no reason for such delay. It certainly isn't a burden on the State, which is the basis for its

Motion for Stay. This information is very important to acquire for the Court to get the

whole picture about what is transpiring with respect to the administration of psychotropic

drugs to Alaskan children and youth.

E. The Necessity of Acquiring Suppressed Dala

PsychRights believes it can demonstrate, based on publicly available information,

that the current practice of psychopharmacology is ineffective and counterproductive, is

doing great harm, and non-pharmacological psychosocial approaches should be used

Opposition to Motion to Stay Discovery Page 2S
S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 169



instead in most cases,79 but to the extent this Court might find this insufficient,

PsychRights is entitled to seek suppressed studies and evidence related to the off-label

marketing of psychotropic drugs for pediatric use. Moreover. this information could be

very important in fashioning the form of the injunction sought herein. It is likely the

pharmaceutical companies will object to this discovery. and whether or not the discovery

should be had, and if so, to what extent this information should be kept secret by this

Court, will take some time. As with the evidence sought from the drug companies with

respect to the off-label marketing to Alaskan prescribers, this very well might consume a

considerable amount oftime -- even to the point of still being unresolved as of the date

trial is scheduled. There is no reason for such delay with its concomitant extreme harm to

the children and youth of Alaska in State custody, nor the disadvantaged children and

youth of Alaska who are being subjected to these drugs through Medicaid payments.

VI. Overview

Psychiatrists ought to be able to rely on the information they receive through

medical journals and continuing medical education.so The State ought to be able to trust

that psychiatrists recommending the administration of psychiatric drugs are basing these

recommendations on reliable information. Unfortunately, neither of these things which

ought to be true are true. It is essential for PsychRights to establish the extent of the

administration of psychiatric drugs to Alaskan children and youth in State custody and

79 See, e.g., the CriticalThinkRx Curriculum, including references, that can be accessed
from hnp://criticalthinkrx.org/.
80 They should be skeptical, however, about Ilinformation ll provided by drug companies.
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through Medicaid. It is essential that PsychRights establish upon what the psychiatrists are

relying in prescribing psychiatric drugs to Alaskan children and youth in State custody and

through Medicaid in order for this Court to determine whether current practice sufficiently

protects Alaska's children and youth in state custody and whether or not Medicaid is

making illegal payments for psychiatric medication to Alaskan children and youth.

The trial in this case is set to begin on February 1,2010. At first blush, this seems a

fair way off, but pretrial deadlines are now looming. The deadline for preliminary witness

lists and identification of retained experts is August 31, 2008, just five months from now.

The other deadlines follow-on quickly. These deadlines are simply coming up too fast for

any delay of any length.

Moreover, by inserting into its Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings, however

improperly, that the State plays no role in the authorization of these drugs to children and

youth of whom the State has seized custody, the State has set up the situation where

discovery with respect to this situation may be necessary in order to determine the

motion.'] Thus, discovery must be allowed to proceed without further delay.

PsychRights has a very focused discovery plan designed to produce the necessary

evidence. This discovery plan depends on the discovery occurring in a certain order and to

the extent that discovery is delayed for any length of time, the ability to conduct the

discovery with minimal burden on the parties is jeopardized.

8J PsychRights believes the Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings is so devoid of merit
that this Court should have no difficulty in denying it without consideration of the
unsupported assertions of the State that it plays no role in the administration of psychiatric
drugs to children and youth in State custody.
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Most importantly, Alaskan children and youth are being greatly harmed by the

State's admitted inability to properly care for and protect them from the improvident,

psychiatric drugging and this should cease as soon as possible. Discovery should not be

further delayed and prevent this.

VII. CONCLUSION

For the foregoing reasons, PsychRights respectfully urges this Court to deny the

State's Motion to Stay Discovery

DATED: March 24, 2009.
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IN THE SUPERJOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA
ATANCHORGE

Law Project for Psychiatric Rights, Inc.,
Plaintiff(s)

Defendant(s)

vs.

State of Alaska, et aI.,

)
) RE-NOTICE OF TAKING
) DEPOSITION DAVID CAMPANA
)
)
)

o;-~--;;-;-;c;-;;;~c;-;-;o;-;----)
Case No. 3AN 08-10115 CI

TO:

Elizabeth M. Bakalar/Stacie L. Kraly
Attorney General's Office
P.O. Box 110300
Junean, AK 9981 1-0300

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that on behalf of Law Project for Psychiatric Rights,

Plaintiff, the deposition of David Campana has been changed to I :00 PM on tbe 26th

day of February, 2009, at the offices of the Law Project for Psychiatric Rights, 406 G

Su·eet, Suite 206, Anchorage, Alaska 99501, before a court reporter. The designation of

materials to be produced is attached and you are invited to attend.

DATED: February 17,2009.
Law Pro·ect for Psychiatric Rights Inc.
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AtlJ.chl11i?nt 10 David Campana Subpoena Dllces Tecllm

All documentation of computerized records relating to payment (or reimbursement) by
Medicaid for psychotropic drugs prescribed to children and youth \'\'ho have or had
claims for payment (or reimbursement) for psychotropic drugs from Janurlry 1, 1999, to
date, including but notlimiled to:

(I) rVlanuals,
(2) File formal,
(3) File structure,
(4) The identity and meaning (including codes and/or lookup tables, etc.) of all

fields cOlltained in such computerized records, and
(5) Examples of all report types.
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IN THE SUPERIOR COURT FOR THE STATE OF ALASKA
THIRD JUDICIAL DISTRICT

LAW PROJECT FOR PSYCHIATRIC )
RIGHTS, Inc., an Alaskan non-profit )
corporation, ))

)
Plaintiff, )

)
vs )

)
STATE OF ALASKA, ef aI., )

)
Defendants, )

-c------c--,-----,-------)
Case No. 3AN 08-10 I ISCI

FIRST REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION

COMES NOW the Plaintiff, Law Project for Psychiatric Rights (PsychRights~,

and, pursuant to Rules 26 and 34 of the Alaska Rules of Civil Procedure, requests

defendants State of Alaska ef al.., to produce and permit PsychRights to inspect and copy

each document requested as follows:

You must serve written responses to these requests for production within thirty (30)

days of service hereof. The responses must state, with respect to each item or category,

that the document has been produced as requested, unless the request is objected to, in

which event the reasons for objection shall be specifically stated. If objection is made to

part of an item or category, the part shall be specified.

In the event that any document called for by these requests is to be withheld for any

reason, please identify that document as follows: title, addressor, addressee, indicated or

blind copies, date, subject matter, number of pages, attachments or appendices. all persons
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to whom distributed, shown or explained, present custodian, and the basis for withholding

the document.

In the event that any document called for by these requests has been destroyed for

any reason, please identify that document as follows: date of destruction, manner of

destruction, reason for destruction, person authorizing destruction, and person destroying

the document.

The requests apply to all documents in your possession, custody or control,

including documents in the possession of or subject to the custody or control of your

agents or attorneys. Unless otherwise specified, the documents called for by these

document requests are documents in your possession, custody or control that were

applicable, effective, prepared, written, generated, sent, dated, or received at any time

since January I, 1999.

"Documents" as used herein means all original writings and other forms of

recording or documentation of any nature whatsoever, and all non~identical copies thereof,

in your possession, custody or control, regardless of where located, and includes, but is not

limited to, computer stored or computer generated information, legal documents,

agreements, records, communications, reports, studies, summaries, regulations, indices,

memoranda, calendar or diary entries, handwritten notes, working papers, agendas,

bulletins, notices, announcements, instructions, charts, manuals, brochures, policies,

schedules, telegrams, teletypes, films, videotapes, photographs, microfilm or microfiche,

all papers, books, journals, ledgers, statements, memoranda, reports, invoices, work sheets,

work papers, notes, transcription of notes, letters, correspondence, abstracts, checks,

Plaintiffs First Requests for Production Page 2
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diagrams, plans, blueprints, specifications, pictures, drawings, graphic representations,

lists, logs, publications, advertisements, instructions, minutes, orders, purchase orders,

messages, resumes, contracts, cables, recordings, audio tapes, magnetic tapes, visual tapes,

transcription tapes or recordings or any portion thereof or summaries thereof, on which any

handwriting, typing, printing, photostatic, or other form of communications are recorded or

reproduced, as well as all notations on the foregoing; all originals, all file copies and all

other copies of any of the foregoing; and all drafts and notes (whether typed, handwritten

or otherwise) made or prepared in connection with such documents, whether used or not,

pertaining, describing, referring or relating, directly or indirectly, in whole or in part, to the

subject matter of each request, and which are in the possession, custody, or control of

defendant, State of Alaska, its subsidiaries, officers, directors, employees, agents,

representatives, predecessors, attorneys, or others acting on behalf of it defendants.

THIS REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION SHALL BE DEEMED TO BE

CONTINUING IN NATURE SO AS TO REQUIRE SEASONAL, SUPPLEMENTAL

RESPONSES IF YOU, YOUR AGENTS, REPRESENTATIVES OR ATTORNEYS

OBTAIN FURTHER INFORMATION AS TO THE EXISTENCE OF

ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS BETWEEN THE TIME YOUR RESPONSES ARE

FILED AND SERVED AND THE TIME OF TRIAL.

Please produce the following at the Law Project for Psychiatric Rights, 406 G

Street, Suite 206, Anchorage, Alaska 99501, or designate the location where PsychRights

may inspect and copy such documents, on or before thilty days from service of this

request:

Plaintiffs First Requests for Production Page 3
S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 177



Exhibit B, page 4 of 14

{j
z

REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION NO.1. Any and all documentation of

computerized records pertaining children and/or youth who have had contact with the

Office of Children's Services (OCS) from January I, 1999, to date, including but not

limited to:

I. Software utilized,
2. Manuals,
3. File format,
4. File structure,
5. The identity and meaning (including codes and/or lookup tables, etc.) of all

fields contained in such computerized records, and
6. Examples of all report types.

RESPONSE

REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION NO.2. Any and all documentation of

computerized records pertaining children and/or youth who have had contact with the

Division of Juvenile Justice (DJJ) from January I, 1999, to date, includiug but not limited

to:

1. Software utilized,
2. Manuals,
3. File format,
4. File structure,
5. The identity and meaning (including codes and/or lookup tables, etc.) of all

fields contained in such computerized records, and
6. Examples of all report types.
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RESPONSE

REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION NO.3. Any and all documentation of

computerized records pertaining children and/or youth who have had contact with the

Alaska Psychiatric Institute (API) from January I, 1999, to date, including but not limited

to:

I. Software utilized,
2. Manuals,
3. File format,
4. File structure,
5. The identity and meaning (including codes and/or lookup tables, etc.) of all

fields contained in such computerized records, and
6. Examples of all report types.

RESPONSE

REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION NO.4. Any and all documentation of

computerized records pertaining children and/or youth kept by the Division of Behavioral

Health (DBH) from January I, 1999, to date, including but not limited to:

I. Software utilized,

Plaintiffs First Requests for Production Page 5
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2. Manuals,
3. File format,
4. File structure,
5. The identity and meaning (including codes and/or lookup tables, etc.) of all

fields contained in such computerized records, and
6. Examples of all report types.

RESPONSE

REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION NO.5. Any and all documentation of

computerized records relating to payment (or reimbursement) by the Division of

Healthcare Services (HCS) for psychotropic drugs prescribed to children and/or youth who

have or had claims for payment (or reimbursement) for psychotropic drugs from January 1,

1999, to date, including but not limited to:

I. Software utilized,
2. Manuals,
3. File format,
4. File structure,
5. The identity and meaning (including codes and/or lookup tables, etc.) of all

fields contained in such computerized records, and
6. Examples of all report types.

RESPONSE

Plaintiffs First Requests for Production Page 6
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REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION NO.6. Any and all documents in the care,

custody, or control ofDHSS, OCS, DJJ, API, DBH & HCS, pertaining to the following

individuals, all of whom have executed Authorizations for Release ofInformation: 1

I.
2.
3.
4.
5.
6.
7.

RESPONSE

DATED: +-0""'-'/C:.1\.-1-"'----~, 2008.

y hiatric Rights

By: ~~Ij~L- _
mes B. Gottstein

ABA # 7811100

I See, Attachment A.

Plaintiffs First Requests for Production Page 7
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o ,m
Psych ugi1~s

Law Project for
Psychiatric Rights, Inc.

AUTHORIZAnON FOR RELEASE OF INFORMAnON

To: All Treating Medical Personnel and their Employers, Alaska Department ofHealth and Social
Services, Alaska Office ofChildren's Services, Alaska Division of Juvenile Justice, Alaska
Psychiatric Institute, Alaska Division ofBehavioral Health and Alaska Division of Health Care
Services.

to e extent afmy autho by authorize and direct you to:
(1) communicate with the Law Project for Psychiatric Rights (psychRightslSj,
(2) answer all ofPsychRights' questions, and
(3) provide copies of all documents and other materials requested by PsychRights pertaining to

me.

The purpose of this CODsent is to enable PsychRights to acquire information in connection with its
prosecution ofLaw Project for Psychiatric Rights v. State ofAlasla:J et 01., 3AN 08-1 0115CI, Alaska
Superior Court, Third Judicial District, State ofAlaska. This authorization encompasses all information
that is relevant or may lead to relevant information in the lawsuit as determined by PsychRigbts,
including, but not limited to:

(i) medical and mental health treatment, including tbe administration ofpsycbotropic medication,
(li) diagnoses and indications,
(iii) medical necessity,
(iv) informed consent,
(v) monitoring for negative effects of treatment,
(vi) communications with individuals and agencies,
(vii) consideration ofpsychosocial interventions, and
(viii) monitoring the level and type(s) of improvement or deterioration in behavior, life skills, family,

school, and social relationships, sports, and the ability to cope with life's demands.

I understand tbat:
(a) The records are protected under federal confidentiality regulations issued. under the Health

Insurance Portability and Accountability Act (HIPAA) and cannot be disclosed without
written consent unless otherwise provided for in the regulations.

(b) The released records may contain sensitive information.
(c) PsychRigbts is not a covered entity under HlPAA and the information being disclosed may

be subject to redisclosure, including use in the court case, and may othernise no longer be
protected under the regulations.

(d) I may revoke this consent at any time by notifying PsycbRights.
(e) This consent expires at the earlier of , or the conclusion of the lawsuit if the

blank is left empty.

A copy hereof, shall be effective.

Executed tills 1.2 day of I:::eb"IjQ, (12009.

Attachment A page 1 of 7
406 G Street, Suite 206, Anchorage, Alaska 99501 - (907) 274-7686 Phone - (907) 274-9493 Fax
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Psych ighb~®
Law Project for

Psychiatric Rights, Inc.

AUTHORIZATION FOR RELEASE OF INFORMATION

To: All Treating Medical Personnel and their Employers, Alaska Department ofHealtb and Social
Services, Alaska Office of Children's Services, Alaska Division ofJuvenile Justice, Alaska
Psychiatric Institute, Alaska Division ofBebavioral Health and Alaska Division of Health Care
Services. -----.

,to the extent crmy authority, hereby authorize and direct you to:
(1) communicate with the Law Project for Psychiatric Rights (psychRigbts~.
(2) answer all of PsychRights' questions, and
(3) provide copies of all documents and other materials requested by PsychRights pertaining to

me.

The purpose of this consent is to enable PsychRigbts to acquire information in connection with its
prosecution ofLaw Project/or Psychiatric Rights v. State ofAlasko et al., 3AN 08-10l15CI, Alaska
Superior Court, Third Judicial District, State of Alaska. This authorization encompasses all information
that is relevant or may lead to relevant information in the lawsuit as determined by PsycbRights,
including, but not limited to:

(i) medical and mental health treatment, including the administration ofpsychotropic medication,
(ii) diagnoses and indications,
(iii) medical necessity,
(iv) informed consent,
(v) monitoring for negative effects of treatment,
(vi) communications with individuals and agencies,
(vii) consideration of psychosocial interventions, and
(viii) monitoring the level and type(s) of improvement or deterioration in behavior, life skills, family,

school, and social relationships, sports, and the ability to cope with life1s demands.

I understand that:
(a) The records are protected under federal confidentiality regulations issued under the Health

Insurance Portability and Accountability Act (HIPAA) and cannot be disclosed without
written consent unless otherwise provided for in the regulations.

(b) The released records may contain sensitive information.
(c) PsycbRights is not a covered entity under HlPAA and the information being disclosed may

be subject to redisclosure, including use in the court case, and may otherwise no longer be
protected under the regulations.

(d) I may revoke this consent at any time by notifying PsycbRights.
(e) This consent expires at the earlier of ,or the conclusion of the lawsuit if the

blank is left empty.

A copy hereof, shall be effective.

-+\ /
Executed this..l.2- day of ('I., ..../~ '" ""

Attachment A page 2 of 7
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Psych ugr(fl~~@
Law Project for

Psychiatric Rights, Inc.

AUTHORIZATION FOR RELEASE OF INFORMATION

To: All Treating Medical Personnel and their Employers, Alaska Department of Health and Social
Services, Alaska Office ofChildren's Services, Alaska Division of Juvenile Justice, Alaska
Psychiatric Institute, Alaska Division of Behavioral Health and Alaska Division of Health Care
Services.

, to the extent of my authority, hereby authorize and direct you to:
(l) communicate with the Law Project for Psychiatric Rights (psychRights~,

(2) answer all ofPsycbRights' questions, and
(3) provide copies of all documents and other materials requested by PsychRights pertaining to

me.

The purpose of this consent is to enable PsychRights to acquire information in connection with its
prosecution of Law Project!or Psychiatric Rights v. State ofAlaska et al., 1AN 08-101l5Cl, Alaska
Superior Court, Third Judicial District, State of Alaska. This authorization encompasses all information
that is relevant or may lead to relevant information in the lawsuit as detennined by PsychRights,
including, but not limited to:

(i) medical and mental health treatment, including the administration of psychotropic medication,
(ii) diagnoses and indications,
(iii) medical necessity,
(iv) informed consent,
(v) monitoring for negative effects oftreatment,
(vi) communications with individuals and agencies,
(vii) consideration of psychosocial interventions, and
(viii) monitoring tbe level and type(s) of improvement or deterioration in behavior, life skills, family,

school, and social relationships, sports, and the ability to cope with life's demands.

I understand that:
(a) The records are protected under federal confidentiality regulations issued under the Health

Insurance Portability and Accountability Act (mPAA) and cannot be disclosed without
written consent unless otherwise provided for in the regulations.

(b) The released records may contain sensitive information.
(c) PsychRights is not a covered entity under HIPAA and the information being disclosed may

be subject to redisclosure, including use in the court case, and may otherwise no longer be
protected under the regulations.

(d) I may revoke this consent at any time by notifying PsycbRights.
(e) This consent expires at the earlier of , or the conclusion of the lawsuit if the

blank is left empty.

A copy hereof, shall be effective.

Executed this 15 day of FebuQ..r1j .2009.

Attachment A page 3 of 7
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• @Psych ighft~
Law Project for

Psychiatric Rights, Inc.

AUTHORIZATION FOR RELEASE OF INFORMATION

To: All Treating Medical Personnel and their Employers, Alaska Department of Health and Social
Services, Alaska Office of Children's Services, Alaska Division of Juvenile Justice, Alaska
Psychiatric Institute, Alaska Division of Behavioral Health and Alaska Division ofHealth Care
Services.

,to the extent afmy authority, hereby authorize and direct you to:
(1) communicate with the Law Project for Psychiatric Rights (psychRights"1.
(2) answer all of PsycbRights' questions, and
(3) provide copies of all documents and otber materials requested by PsychRigbts pertaining to

me.

The purpose of this consent is to enable PsychRights to acquire information in connection with its
prosecution of Law Project/or Psychiatric Rights v. State ofAlaska eJ al., 3AN 08-101 1SCI, Alaska
Superior Court, Third Judicial District, State of Alaska. This authorization encompasses all information
that is relevant or may lead to relevant infonnation in the lawsuit as determined by PsycbRights,
including, but not limited to:

(i) medical and mental health treatment, including the administration ofpsychotropic medication,
(ii) diagnoses and indications,
(iii) medical necessity,
(iv) informed consent,
(v) monitoring for negative effects of treatment,
(vi) communications with individuals and agencies,
(vii) consideration ofpsychosocial interventions, and
(viii) monitoring the level and type(s) of improvement or deterioration in behavior, life skills, family,

school, and social relationships, sports, and the ability to cope with life's demands.

1understand that:
(a) The records are protected under federal confidentiality regulations issued under the Health

Insurance Portahility and Accountability Act (HIPAA) and cannot be disclosed without
written consent unless otherwise provided for in the regulations.

(b) The released records may contain sensitive information.
(c) PsychRights is not a covered entity under HIPAA and the information being disclosed may

be subject to redisclosure, including use in the court case, and may otherwise no longer be
protected under the regulations.

(d) I may revoke this consent at any time by notifying PsychRights.
(e) lIDs consent expires at the earlier of , or the conclusion of the lawsuit iftbe

blank is left empty.

A copy hereof, shall be effective.

.-tl r (
Executed this 1!L- day of...J...r-,-,-,-,-"-,-J-'-~-'-/'-/./_J'2009.

('

(print name]

Attachment A page 4 of 7
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Psych iglh1t~®
Law Project for

Psychiatric Rights, Inc.

AUTHORIZATION FOR RELEASE OF INFORMATION

To: All Treating Medical Personnel and their Employers, Alaska Department of Health and Social
Services, Alaska Office of Children's Services, Alaska Division of Juvenile Justice, Alaska
Psychiatric Institute, Alaska Division ofBehavioral Health and Alaska Division ofHealth Care
Services.

1IIaLJ
, to the extent afmy authority, hereby authorize and direct you to:

(1) communicate with the Law Project for Psychiatric Rights (psychRights~.

(2) answer all ofPsychRights' questions, and
(3) provide copies of all documents and other materials requested by PsychRights pertaining to

me.

The purpose of this consent is to enable PsychRights to acquire information in connection with its
prosecution of Law Project for Psychiatric Rights v. State ofAlaska et al., 3AN 08-10115CI, Alaska
Superior Court, Third Judicial District, State of Alaska. This authorization encompasses all information
that is relevant or may lead to relevant information in the lawsuit as determined by PsychRights,
including, but not limited to:

(i) medical and mental health treatment, including the administration ofpsychotropic medication,
(ii) diagnoses and indications,
(iii) medical necessity,
(iv) informed consent,
(v) monitoring for negative effects of treatment,
(vi) communications with individuals and agencies,
(vii) consideration ofpsychosocial interventions, and
(viii) monitoring the level and type(s) of improvement or deterioration in behavior, life skills, family,

school, and social relationships, sports, and the ability to cope with life's demands.

I understand that
(a) The records are protected under federal confidentiality regulations issued under the Health

Insurance Portability and Accountability Act (HIPAA) and cannot be disclosed without
written consent unless otherwise provided for in the regulations.

(b) The released records may contain sensitive information.
(c) PsychRights is not a covered entity under HIPAA and the information being disclosed may

be subject to redisclosure, including use in the court case, and may otherwise no longer be
protected under the regulations.

(d) I may revoke this consent at any time by notifying PsychRights.
(e) This consent expires at the earlier of , or the conclusion of the lawsuit if the

blank is left empty.

A copy hereof, shall be effective.

'rf\ 1": 1
Executed this _1'>_ day of-,r,-,-'1",,,",-'=,-'_''I'1,-_, 2009... I

[print name]
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Psych Dght~®
Law Project for

Psychiatric Rights, Inc.

AUTHORIZATION FOR RELEASE OF INFORMATION

To: All Treating Medical Personnel and their Employers, Alaska Department ofHealth and Social
Services, Alaska Office ofChildren's Services, Alaska Division of Juvenile Justice, Alaska
Psychiatric Institute, Alaska Division of Behavioral Health and Alaska Division of Health Care
Services.

,to e extent afmy authority, here yaut onze and direct you to:
(1 communicate with the Law Project for Psychiatric Rights (psychRights~.
(2) answer all of PsychRigbts' questions, and
(3) provide copies of all documents and other materials requested by PsychRights pertaining to

me.

The purpose of this consent is to enable PsychRigbts to acquire information in connection with its
prosecution of Law Projectfor Psychiatric Rights 1'. State ofAlaska et al., 3AN 08-101l5Cl, Alaska
Superior Court, Third Judicial District, State of Alaska. This authorization encompasses all information
that is relevant or may lead to relevant information in the lawsuit as determined by PsycbRigbts,
including, but not limited to:

(i) medical and mental health trealment, including the administration ofpsychotropic medication,
(ii) diagnoses and indications,
(iii) medical necessity,
(iv) informed consent,
(v) monitoring for negative effects of treatment,
(vi) communications with individuals and agencies,
(vii) consideration ofpsychosocial interventions, and
(viii) monitoring the level and t)'pe(s) of improvement or deterioration in behavior, life skills, family,

school, and social relationships, sports, and the ability to cope with life's demands.

I understand that:
(a) The records are protected under federal confidentiality regulations issued under the Health

Insurance Portability and Accountability Act (HIPAA) and cannot be disclosed without
written consent unless otherwise provided for in the regulations.

(b) The released records may contain sensitive infonnation.
(c) PsychRights is not a covered entity under HIPAA and the information being disclosed may

be subject to redisclosure, including use in the court case, and may otherwise no longer be
protected under the regulations.

(d) I may revoke this consent at any time by notifying PsycbRights.
(e) This consent expires at the earlier of , or the conclusion of the lawsuit if the

blank is left empty.

A copy hereof, shall be effective.

Executed thisb. day of~ 2009.
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PsychlRigh~~®
Law Project for

Psychiatric Rights, Inc.

AUTHORIZATION FOR RELEASE OF INFORMATION

To: All Treating Medical Personnel and their Employers. Alaska Department ofHealth and Social
Services, Alaska Office of Children's Services, Alaska Division of Juvenile Justice, Alaska
Psychiatric Institute, Alaska Division of Behavioral Health and Alaska Division ofHealth Care
Services.

extent 0 my authority, hereby authorize and direct you to:
(I) communicate with the Law Project for Psychiatric Rights (psychRights~,
(2) answer all ofPsychRigbts' questions, and
(3) provide copies of all documents and other materials requested by PsychRigbts pertaining to

me.

The purpose of this consent is to enable PsychRights to acquire infonnation in connection with its
prosecution ofLaw Project/or Psychiatric Rights v. State ofAlaska et al., 3AN 08-10115CI, Alaska
Superior Court, Third Judicial District, State of Alaska. This authorization encompasses all infonnation
that is relevant or may lead to relevant infonnation in the lawsuit as determined by PsychRights,
including, but not limited to:

(i) medical and mental health treatment, including the administration ofpsychotropic medication,
(ii) diagnoses and indications,
(iii) medical necessity,
(iv) informed consent,
(v) monitoring for negative effects ofn-eatment,
(vi) communications with individuals and agencies,
(vii) consideration of psychosocial interventions, and
(viii) monitoring the level and type(s) of improvement or deterioration in behavior,life skills, family,

school, and social relationships, sports, and the ability to cope with life's demands.

I understand that:
(a) The records are protected under federal confidentiality regulations issued under the Health

Insurance Portability and Accountability Act (HIPAA) and cannot be disclosed without
written consent unless otherwise provided for in the regulations.

(b) The released records may contain sensitive information.
(c) PsychRights is not a covered entity under HIPAA and the information being disclosed may

be subject to redisclosure, including use in the court case, and may otherwise no longer be
protected under the regulations.

(d) I may revoke this consent at any time by notifying PsychRights.
(e) This consent expires at the earlier of , or the conclusion of the lawsuit if the

blank is left empty.

A copy hereof, shall be effective.

Executed this -f.S. day of-+l--#-'t7'"""'?,-,'-':'~
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Re: Medicaid Database

1 of 3 3/22/2009 12:05 PM

Subject: Re: Medicaid Database
From: Jim Gottstein <jim.gottstein@psychrights.org>
Date: Mon, 02 Feb 2009 12:28:26 -0900
To: "Bakalar, Elizabeth M (LAW)" <libby.bakalar@alaska.gov>
CC: "Kraly, Stacie L (LAW)" <stacie.kraly@alaska.gov>, Jim Gottstein <jim.gottstein@psychrights.org>

Hi Libby,

Bakalar, Elizabeth M (LAW) wrote:

Hi Jim,

We’d prefer to do any meetings with Dave through a formal deposition.  If you have some particular data query in
mind that you’re thinking of, you can run it by us and we’ll talk to Dave.  But this is a complex suit of significant
proportion/impact with potentially lots of discovery, and we want to make sure all our dots are connected properly
(i.e. discovery is formalized and done via Civil Rules). So let’s just do this as a deposition on the record. 

That's fine.

On that topic, and in response to your other email, we will accept deposition subpoenas for defendants/employees

Thanks.  I assume I can serve them to the Anchorage office.

, but first can you let us know (a) whom you want deposed;

I sent you a draft of a Rule 30(b)(6) notice, so other than Mr. Campana, who I think we all agree is the person to
depose about Medicaid records, for at least the first round, you will be designating the persons to testify about the
identified topics.

(b) the time frame in which you want to depose them, being mindful that many of the principals will be jammed up
with legislative business during the session—we can then check on availability of those you want deposed, and
you can notice the depos and we can get them scheduled as fast as possible.

I'd like to depose Mr. Campana as soon as possible, at least within the next couple of weeks.  I will also need to
coordinate with my database person.   It seems like we ought to be able to work up a schedule for the others that
will work for both of us.  I'll probably just set a date for the 30(b)(6) depositions for maybe three weeks out and
then we can make adjustments to accommodate the various witnesses' schedules.  

I got your voice mail but I am swamped today—if there’s anything else you need that’s not addressed here, please
feel free to try me again.

Thanks for getting back to me.

Best,
Libby

Libby Bakalar
Assistant Attorney General
Office of the Attorney General
P.O. Box 110300
Juneau, Alaska 99801-0300
(907) 465-4135 (direct)
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Re: Medicaid Database

2 of 3 3/22/2009 12:05 PM

(907) 465-3600 (main)
(907) 465-2539 (fax)

From: Jim Gottstein [mailto:jim.gottstein@psychrights.org]
Sent: Thursday, January 29, 2009 12:46 PM
To: Bakalar, Elizabeth M (LAW); Kraly, Stacie L (LAW)
Subject: Medicaid Database

Hi Libby and Stacie,

Can we meet informally with David Campana in the near future to formulate a request for production of
computerized Medicaid records rather than take his deposition.  What I'd like to do is meet with him with
our computer person to formulate the request for production.  I am not asking that you waive any rights
to object to a request for production.

--

James B. (Jim) Gottstein, Esq.
President/CEO

Law Project for Psychiatric Rights
406 G Street, Suite 206
Anchorage, Alaska  99501
USA
Phone: (907) 274-7686)  Fax: (907) 274-9493
jim.gottstein[[at]]psychrights.org
http://psychrights.org/

PsychRights®

            Law Project for

       Psychiatric Rights

The Law Project for Psychiatric Rights is a public interest law firm devoted to the defense of people
facing the horrors of forced psychiatric drugging.  We are further dedicated to exposing the truth about
these drugs and the courts being misled into ordering people to be drugged and subjected to other brain
and body damaging interventions against their will.  Extensive information about this is available on our
web site, http://psychrights.org/. Please donate generously.  Our work is fueled with your IRS 501(c) tax
deductible donations.  Thank you for your ongoing help and support.

--

James B. (Jim) Gottstein, Esq.
President/CEO

Law Project for Psychiatric Rights
406 G Street, Suite 206
Anchorage, Alaska  99501
USA
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RE: Depositions

1 of 3 3/22/2009 12:46 PM

Subject: RE: Depositions
From: "Bakalar, Elizabeth M (LAW)" <libby.bakalar@alaska.gov>
Date: Tue, 17 Feb 2009 09:32:04 -0900
To: Jim Gottstein <jim.gottstein@psychrights.org>
CC: "Kraly, Stacie L (LAW)" <stacie.kraly@alaska.gov>

1 p.m. should work.  Not sure what you mean by manuals and descriptions—if you can be more specific I can let you
know if it’s something publicly available online or if it will need to come out at the depo.

Libby Bakalar
Assistant Attorney General
Office of the Attorney General
P.O. Box 110300
Juneau, Alaska 99801-0300
(907) 465-4135 (direct)
(907) 465-3600 (main)
(907) 465-2539 (fax)

From: Jim Gottstein [mailto:jim.gottstein@psychrights.org] 
Sent: Tuesday, February 17, 2009 9:13 AM
To: Bakalar, Elizabeth M (LAW)
Cc: Kraly, Stacie L (LAW); Matt Joy; Lisa Smith
Subject: Re: Depositions

Hi Libby,

I'm sorry I missed that you proposed the afternoon.  I will re-notice the deposition.  Does 1:00 work? 
Is there any way we can get the manuals and file descriptions, etc., enough ahead of time to make the
deposition more efficient?

Thanks for the other names.

I'm also planning on taking the depositions of at least some of the psychiatrists.  I've started to try
and coordinate with their schedules, advising them I was thinking it would be a month or so out. 
When I hear back (or not) I will contact you to coordinate with you as well.

Bakalar, Elizabeth M (LAW) wrote: 
Hi Jim,

I observed that you noticed Dave Campana’s deposition for 10 a.m. on 2/26, but as we stated in this earlier email
below, he is not available until the afternoon of that day, so the morning won’t work.  As already indicated we can do
the afternoon though.  Also, I have the additional information that you requested re: appropriate people to depose re:
other databases and records as follows:

1.  API: Belinda Hopkins and Steve Schneider
2.  DJJ: Dave Salmon
3.  OCS: Stevan “Tim” Huffman

All of these folks’ mailing addresses are available online on the state website
http://www.state.ak.us/local/whtpage1.html.  So far no one has any major leave planned that we’re aware of.

Thanks,
Libby
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RE: Depositions

2 of 3 3/22/2009 12:46 PM

Libby Bakalar
Assistant Attorney General
Office of the Attorney General
P.O. Box 110300
Juneau, Alaska 99801-0300
(907) 465-4135 (direct)
(907) 465-3600 (main)
(907) 465-2539 (fax)

From: Bakalar, Elizabeth M (LAW) 
Sent: Wednesday, February 11, 2009 8:54 AM
To: 'Jim Gottstein'
Cc: Kraly, Stacie L (LAW)
Subject: Dave Campana's Deposition

Hi Jim,

We are working on figuring out the best date for Dave’s deposition.  The dates that would work best on our end are the

afternoons of Feb 26 and/or 27th.  Feb. 19 would be the third choice.  We’d prefer to do the depo at your office.  Stacie
will be there in person, in Anchorage, and I will be telephonic.

Thanks,
Libby

Libby Bakalar
Assistant Attorney General
Office of the Attorney General
P.O. Box 110300
Juneau, Alaska 99801-0300
(907) 465-4135 (direct)
(907) 465-3600 (main)
(907) 465-2539 (fax)

--

James B. (Jim) Gottstein, Esq.
President/CEO

Law Project for Psychiatric Rights
406 G Street, Suite 206
Anchorage, Alaska  99501
USA
Phone: (907) 274-7686)  Fax: (907) 274-9493
jim.gottstein[[at]]psychrights.org
http://psychrights.org/

PsychRights®

            Law Project for

       Psychiatric Rights

The Law Project for Psychiatric Rights is a public interest law firm devoted to the defense of people facing
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RE: Discovery in Psych Rights

1 of 3 3/17/2009 9:07 AM

Subject: RE: Discovery in Psych Rights
From: "Bakalar, Elizabeth M (LAW)" <libby.bakalar@alaska.gov>
Date: Tue, 24 Feb 2009 16:51:10 -0900
To: Jim Gottstein <jim.gottstein@psychrights.org>
CC: "Kraly, Stacie L (LAW)" <stacie.kraly@alaska.gov>

That’s fine, with the understanding that we’re not agreeing to a date certain at this point and re-notice will be subject to
further discussions and/or motion practice as we get closer to the time.  So I believe we’re on the same page with how
to proceed.

Libby Bakalar
Assistant Attorney General
Office of the Attorney General
P.O. Box 110300
Juneau, Alaska 99801-0300
(907) 465-4135 (direct)
(907) 465-3600 (main)
(907) 465-2539 (fax)

From: Jim Gottstein [mailto:jim.gottstein@psychrights.org] 
Sent: Tuesday, February 24, 2009 4:17 PM
To: Bakalar, Elizabeth M (LAW)
Cc: Kraly, Stacie L (LAW); Lisa Smith
Subject: Re: Discovery in Psych Rights

Hi Libby,

I will serve you with a re-notice of deposition for say three weeks out, which when we get closer we
will presumably have another discussion about.

Bakalar, Elizabeth M (LAW) wrote: 
Good enough Jim, we understand that concern.  Thanks for your understanding and courtesy on this point and we will
be in touch.  Procedurally, will you be issuing a notice that cancels Thursday’s deposition?

Libby Bakalar
Assistant Attorney General
Office of the Attorney General
P.O. Box 110300
Juneau, Alaska 99801-0300
(907) 465-4135 (direct)
(907) 465-3600 (main)
(907) 465-2539 (fax)

From: Jim Gottstein [mailto:jim.gottstein@psychrights.org]
Sent: Tuesday, February 24, 2009 3:51 PM
To: Bakalar, Elizabeth M (LAW)
Cc: Kraly, Stacie L (LAW); Lisa Smith
Subject: Re: Discovery in Psych Rights

Hi Libby,

I will agree to postpone it for two weeks or maybe a bit more, but I don't think I can agree to
anything that open-ended.
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RE: Discovery in Psych Rights

2 of 3 3/17/2009 9:07 AM

Bakalar, Elizabeth M (LAW) wrote: 
Jim,

In preparing for Dave Campana’s upcoming deposition, Stacie and I have taken a more extensive look at the complaint
and we have concerns about engaging in discovery at this point.  As a result of our review we are preparing a
dispositive motion that we hope to file in the next two weeks.  Therefore we would request that you agree to postpone
Dave’s deposition until after the court has ruled on our motion.  If you are unable to agree to that postponement, we’ll
file an expedited motion to quash the deposition on similar grounds.  We apologize for the late notice but we need to
know by COB today if you can agree to this plan.

Libby

Libby Bakalar
Assistant Attorney General
Office of the Attorney General
P.O. Box 110300
Juneau, Alaska 99801-0300
(907) 465-4135 (direct)
(907) 465-3600 (main)
(907) 465-2539 (fax)

--

James B. (Jim) Gottstein, Esq.
President/CEO

Law Project for Psychiatric Rights
406 G Street, Suite 206
Anchorage, Alaska  99501
USA
Phone: (907) 274-7686)  Fax: (907) 274-9493
jim.gottstein[[at]]psychrights.org
http://psychrights.org/

PsychRights®

            Law Project for

       Psychiatric Rights

The Law Project for Psychiatric Rights is a public interest law firm devoted to the defense of people facing
the horrors of forced psychiatric drugging.  We are further dedicated to exposing the truth about these drugs
and the courts being misled into ordering people to be drugged and subjected to other brain and body
damaging interventions against their will.  Extensive information about this is available on our web site,
http://psychrights.org/. Please donate generously.  Our work is fueled with your IRS 501(c) tax deductible
donations.  Thank you for your ongoing help and support.

--

James B. (Jim) Gottstein, Esq.

Exhibit E, page 2 of 2S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 194



Exhibit F, page 1 of 8

O~ ,."",1:
J,... H ~I ••• Jr.

OmH I II' t~M &n ••lyl

ompnn

TL

r 5, 007

R:

Matthew L. Garretson, Esq.
Joseph W. Steele, Esq.
Eric T. Sanders, Esq.
David Suggs, Esq.

EXHIBIT~

PAGEL OF -X.-

With kindest regards, r remain,

001440

En :

Pleas find enclosed a list ofavailable d ta fields from the Medicaid claims datnbasc, bale'
r Z P- -0 354 to ZVP- T -0 360.num

cc:

I J1 C 01. E BLVD, BLDa·A.IIT. PLEAlA TIe lUIC P.O. BOX IOU, lIT. PLEASANT Ie 1141S PH: lCun.uoo FAX: ICU1UStt WWW.APWB.COM
o COl I 10 &, IU. Ie I e II OIloa, e .1I0llllf'..UOUCfMIIOIll.Al.CA,OC.f\,CI.\. ... 1I .... Il/I,1IO lie I' ,.. .."... &""

S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 195



Exhibit F, page 2 of 8

Hl!ADtt Q (, SVC' 'PROV' 'NO'I

ZYP·AK.Q3354

I'BILLY C' 'PROV')
II
II HF.AOI
1\

00\44\

EXHIBIT~

PAGE~OF.)L

R£ADI G ('CL."'l' 'TYP')
H DING I'C' ''I'' 'H')
H 01 'G (' PROV' , 0')

1\
II
II
P 0 HBADINO (, CIP' 'NUMBER'I
II HEIIDr ('NOC/" PROC' I
II
A
A HEADING (' NOC' 'CODe:')
A HEADING 'PROCEDURE'
II
A
II HEADING (' PROC' 'CODE:')
A
A
A HEADING (' PROC' 'MOD')
II HEADING (' PROC' 'MOD')
A. HEADING (' PLACE OE" 'SERVICE ')
II
11
A llEA.DING "TYPE' 'OE" 'SERV')
P 3 HEADING (' UNITS' I
P
P HEADING (' E'ROM' 'DATE')
PH£ADING ('THRU' 'DA1E"
P
P
P HEADING ('STATUS' 'OATH')
P HEAOING I' PAYMENT' 'DATE')
P 2 HBADD G (' BILLBD' 'C1lARGES')
P 2 HEADING ('10'1" 'DOC' 'CHARGE')
P 2 HllADINQ (' LINE' '1PL' 'AMOUNT t )

P 2 HEADING ('')'PL' 'AMOUNT')
P 2 HSIIDINO (' co- PAY' 'AMOUNT')
P 2 HEADING (' ALLOweo' 'AMOUNT' I
P 2 HEADING (' PAID' 'MT')
P HEADING ('PRIOR' 'AUTH' 'NUMBER')
II
11
11
A
II
A
A
11

1 P H OCG I'CCN')
PH or' I'JULlA"

H OU-IG (' I 'V' 'TYP'I

S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 196



Exhibit F, page 3 of 8

EXHmIT __E"","---=-_
PAGE.....3.-0 L

ZYP·AK-G3366

('TPL' 'J 0'1

If r G ('KIlO' '!U>C' 'NO'I
IlEllDt· 'DtAG'
IfKAI)W (. BEC' 'DIAO')

A

A OCCURS 10 INDEX BRRIOX
P
A

HaADlt Q (' COLLOCATION' 'CODE')
P HEIlOr ( , FOfUo\E:R' 'CCN' I

HEADt N (' PRIOR' 'PIIYMENT' '0111'£')
P
P HEAot NG (' fOfUo\ER' •WARRANT I')
A
P 0 H£l\otllG ('RE IF' 'CNTL')
A
I IlEAOING ('EI.1G' 'CODE'I
A HEADING (' SUB' 'TYPE')
A
A /lEADtNG (' PROV' 'TYPE' I
1\ HEADtNG (' PROV' 'SPEC' I
II
A
A
P
P /lEADING (' CHECK' 'WARRANT I')
1\ ~

('CATEGORY' 'or' 'SERVrCE')
N IlEADING ('S' 'T' 'A'I
N
II
A HEADING ('TYPE' 'OF' 'BILL'I
A
A
A

2 P KllAOING (' ERR' 'CoE' , l' I
1 II HEADING (' ERR' 'FLG' '11' 1
2 P HEADING (' ERR' 'CoE' , 2' 1
1 A Il£AOI G (' ERR' 'FLG ' , 2' I
2 P HEADING ('ERR' 'COE' '13'1
1 A HEADI G ('ERR' 'FLC' '13'1
2 P HEADING (' ERR' , CoE ' '14' I
1 A HEADI 'G (' ERR' 'fLG' '14' I
2 P HEADI G (' ERR' •COE' 't 5 ' I
1 A HEADI G (. ERR' • FLG' '15' I
2 P

240
242
2 3
245
246
248
249
251
252
254
255

R­
Ji­
R-OP
H- rP-
H-SulG- ROO
H-ELtQ-CO E
H-ButO-SUBTYPE
/l- a-CASH-GAA
If-PROV-TYPE
H-PROV-S EC
H-MAX- IMf:
H-DRO-COoE
H-M -CODE
R-RE/UT-tO
H-CRECK-NUM
H-COS

It- ORS 240 )
H-BACH-RRRO H-ERRORS 2
H-BACK-ERROR-FLAG Il-BRRORS +2 1

Ji·STATUS
H-LINK-HOS
R-SIG-tNo
H-UB82-B LL-TYPE
H-BT-FACILITY
H- 81' - BILl.-CLASS
K-BT-FRB UENCY

H-BACH-BRROn
H-BACH-BRiOR-fLAG
H-B1\CH- RROll2
R-BACR-BiROR-FLAG2
a-BACH -BRROR.)
H-RACH-ERRDR-FLAG3
R-BACH-tmROR4
FH3ACH- 11- FLAG~
K- CR-ERRORS
H-£ACH-B II-FLAG5
lH?ACB-£ R6

S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 197



Exhibit F, page 4 of 8

EXHIBIT~

PAGE-!:L OF X-.

ZYP·AK.Q3356

001443

, 11'1
'11' )
• 2' I

"2' I
'IJ' )
'"3' ),'4 'I
'"4 ,)
"5' I
'Is' )

'ERRl' )
'rLG1' J
'ERR2' J
'rLG2' )
'ERR3' )
'FLG3' )
'ERR4'1

')

'COE'
'FLG'
'CDe'
'FLG'
'CDE'
'FLO'
'CDE'
I FLO I

'CDE'
'FLG'

I'HIST' 'ERRS')

( 'HIST'
( 'HI8T'
( 'RIST'
('Ii ST'
I'RIST'
( '1lIST'
I'RIST'

(' EOB'
( 'EOB'
( 'EOB'
l'EOB'
l'EOB'
('BOB'
( 'EOB'
( 'BOB'
( 'E08'
('BOB'

3
2
HEADING (' RTO

A
p

A

A
P
A
P

A OCCURS 10 INDEX HST OX
2 P
1 A

P HEADING
I!EAOrtO

P HEADING
A HEADING
P HEADI G
1\ /lEADING
P READING
A
P HEADING
A
P
A
P
A
P
A
P
A
P
A
P H£ADING
A IfEADING
P HEAOWG
A HEADING
P HEADING

HBADING
P HEADING
A HeADING
P HEADING
A RBADIUO
P
A
P
A
P
A
P
A
p
1\
P
P
P

210
272 1
213 2
275
276 2
278 1
219 2
281 I
282 2
284 1
285 2
287 1
288 2
290 1
291 2
293 1
294 2
296 1
297 2
299 1
)00 2
302 1
303 2
305 1
306 2
308
309 2
311 1
312 2
314
315 2
3 7 1
318 2
320 1
321 2
323
324 2
326 1
321 2
329 1
330 5
335 4
339 1

27
ll-HIS'Z'-&RJl

_~ a-RIST-ERR 2

g- -ERRl
ft- CH-at -P 1
n- ClI-BYST-EllR2
D- -HtST-BRR-PLAQ2
R- -DIST-CRR3
H-BACH-HI -aaR-PLAG3
s- -IUST-ElRR.
s- CH-HIST-ERR-PLAG~

H- oCR-MIST-ERRS
n- CR-HIS't"-ERR- f"1.AG5
n- CH-HIST-ERR6
U-RACH-HIST-ERR-FLAG6
R-BACH-MIST-ERRl
H-BACH-HIST-ERR-FLAGl
B-BACH-KIST-ERR8
H-BACH-HtST-BRR-rLAG8
H-BACH-HIST-ERR9
R-BACH-KI8T-ERR-FLAG9
H-BACH-BIST-ERRlO
R-EACH-KIST-ERR-FLAG10
H-BACR-OVER-EOBl
s- CH-OVER-BOB-FLAGI
a-EACH-OVRR-EOB2
n-EACH-OVER-EOB-FLAG2
R-EACH-OVER-tOB)
H-EACH-OVER-EOB-F 03
B-RACB-OVBR-EOB4
B-EACB-OVBR-£OB-FLAa~

B-BACH-OVBR-EOB5
B-2ACH-OVBR-80B- LAGS
R-EACB-OVBR- B6
B-eACB-OVER-BOB-PLA06
B-BACB-OVRR-E081
a-EACH-OVER-BOB-PLAOl
B-EACB-OVBR-EOB8
8-BACB-OVBR-EOB-P~08

R-BACB-OVBQ-EOB9
S- CB-O rBR- B-FLAG9
a-£ACH-OVER-EOBIO
H-EACB-O B-FLAGIO
H-CUT9kCK-DAYS-U I S
B- C'UTI!ACK- A.."i
H- RRSU3MITTAL - NUMJ.

S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 198



Exhibit F, page 5 of 8

ZYP-AK.Q3367

EXInBIT~

PAGE~OF~

NOEl( veOIDX
2 A

2 4 P 2

INDEX TTOJDK
2 A

+2 4 P

"I
1 P
1
1 A
2
7
4
0( P

A H 01 '0 l'tH RO' , NO'I

:z A
0 1\
1 A
1 A

414 5 2
4l!1 5 P 2
424 5 P 2
429 5 P 2
434 5 2
439 4 P

443 4 P HEAD! G ('BLOOD' • DE:OUC'l'T BLE' I
447 1 A
448 1 A
449 7 1\
456 7 1\
463 2 A
H5 4 P
469 2 N
414 4 P
478 1 1\
479 2 A.
481 1 A HEAOl NO (' NATURE' 'OF" 'ADMIT',
482 2 P
484 2 P

516 2 A
518 4 P
522 0( P
526 2 A
528 2 A.
530 2 A
512 2 A
534 2 A

584 2 A
586 2 A
588 2 A

590 24 A OCCURS 46 INDEX INDXB

486 6 A OCCURS 5
R-TT-OCCURRBNCB-OATA
H-TT-OCct1RRBNCE-DATA

536 6 A OCCURS 8
H-Tl'-\'ALOE-OODES
R-Tl'-VALOB-CODE8

Ii- -OCCURJlBIlCB-IlATA
H- -occ-caoll:
H-TT-OCC-DATB

H-TT-OCC-SP I·CODS
N- -OCC-SPAl -mo."!
H-T"l'-OCC-SPAN-THRU
H- -COJID-COD::l
H -'l'T-COQI) -CODB2
li-T"l'-COlm-COD J
H-'l'T-OOlro-COD~

H- 'l'T - CXUlD-CODE

H-TT-VALOB-OODES
H-TT-VAL-CODE
H-T"l'-VAL-1;.'f

H-TT-BLOOD-FU ISHEO
H-TT-BLOOD-R.BP1AC&D
R-TT-BLOOD- IOT-REPL

H-TT-RB\~ S-COO£-DATA

S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 199



Exhibit F, page 6 of 8
OOI~ 5

ZYP·AKo03368

EXHmlT f---.......--
PAC ~O <z

It cex INOXA
A +

A t

1\
N
P

5 A
3 A

J 2 A
5.., 2

• S P 2
-.14 5 P 2

19 5 P 1

INDex HOCIDX
2 A
4 P

OCCURS 46
5

'CODE')
3

'CODE' )
2

+3 2
5 2

'UNITS')

441 6 A OCCURS 5
H-HO-OCCURRE:NCB-DATA
H-1l0-0CCORR~NCB-OA1'A -.2

545 2 II
S41 2 A
549 2 A

551 23 A
H-ElO-REV-DATA
HEADI G ('PROC'
H-HO-RRV-OATA
Il£AOHlG (' REV'
H-HO-RBV-DATA
R-HO-RBV-OATA
H-HO-REV-OATA
HEAD G (' REV'

a-HO ace SPA! -CODE 4<1 2 A

"-RO-OCe-s 11! -FRO:~ 09 4 P
a-HO-OCC-SPAN-THRU 493 e p

IHf -co.m-CODEI 481 2 A

Il-HO-CO){l)-CODE2 489 2 A
II- -co -CODE3 491 2 A
H -H -COUD-CODEe 493 2 A
B-HO-CO -CODES 495 2 A

H-HO-VALUB-CODES 491 6 Po OCCURS 8 INDEX HOVIOX
H-HO-VAL-COOE H-HO-VALUB-CODES :I A
H-HO-VAL-Ju1T H-HO-VALVE-CODES +2 4 P

H-Hl)-OC REt CH-DA A
H -HO-OCe-CODB
H-IlO-ace-DATa

H- -BLOOD- RN
H-I! -BLOOD-RBPL
H-BO-BLOOD-. -REPL

H-HO- £V-co £

H-RO-REV-DA A
B-IiO-paOC-COOE

H-HO- -co 82
R-1iO - I'ILL.ER
g-RO- TS-9

S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 200



Exhibit F, page 7 of 8

Zyp·AKo03369

001446

EXHmIT ~F--::~
PAGE~ 0 <6'

2

11.

A HEADING ('REFER' 'PROV')
A
P

A HEADING ('PRESCR' 'PHYS')
11. BEADING I' RX ' , 'I
A HEADING ('REFILL' 'CODE')
P 2 IlEAO NO ('DROG' 'PRICE')
P "tADnIC ('DAY' '501"1
1\

P 2 HEADI a ('DEDUCT BLE')
P HEADI 0 (' co NSOAANCE')
p
P 2 HEAD I G ('IolEDICJUD' 'BILLED' t

'AMOONT')

7
1.
4

S
5
5
5

1 A
1 1\
1. A
6 A

5 P 2
( P
( P
7 A
1. A
1 A
1 A
1 A
8 N 2

414
ell
422
423

414 7
421 10
431
4) ,
437 2
439 1

4H
421
422

414 2 A H~DING ("I" '0' '0' 'T' 'H' I
416 1 A HEADINO ('S' '0' 'R' 'F' '1')
411 1 A HEADING ('5' '0' '(I.' 'F' '2')
418 1\ BBADIlro ('8' 'u' 'R' 'I''' ')')
419 1 A H£ADItlG 1'5' '0' 'R' 'f" '('I
420 1 A READING ('S' 'U' 'R' 'F' '5 i )

421 1 A

U
H9

24
429

1609 !i
16 (
1.618
1.623 4
Y 1627 (
nl 2
633 ( I' 2

YB 1. 37 2 N
163 ( P

H-TT-PR-, KD CARR-PAlO-AM 43(
B-TT-PR- &-PAY-DAT& 439
H -TT-PR-Sl.OOO-OBO H 3
M-TT-? -RKPER-PROV .47
R-TT-PR-Til. T-pLACE 4S4
H-TT-PR-LAB-INO .55
H-TT-Pll-ASSIONMBI'T-IND 456
B-TT-PR-! ST-TYPE 4S7
R_TT_PR_MCARB-ALUOW&O-AMT 458

H-TR-fUlPER-PRO
a-TIl.- RR-tHD
R-TR-O:u.O- NO
H-TR-CONTROL-

H-SPBar-svc-co t

a-PR-RBPIDl-PROV
H-PR-LAB-IND
H-PR-OMB-CKRT-DA E

R-Pl{-PRESC-I'HYS
B-PH-RX- 10
B-PH-fUlPYLL-OODE
H-PH-D UG-PRIC£
a-PR- YB-SOPPLY
B-PH-coH -0008

H-D -.00 "
H-D -SURY-1
H-O -stlRP-2
H-IlA-SURY-)
B-D -BURP-(
B-OA-BORP-,
H-IlA-EMERG CY-IND

S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 201



Exhibit F, page 8 of 8

,

S-13558 PsychRights v. Alaska Exc. 202



FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE

Thursday, January 15, 2009

WWW.USDOJ.GOV

CIV

(202) 514-2007

TDD (202) 514-1888

Eli Lilly and Company Agrees to Pay $1.415 Billion to Resolve Allegations
of Off-label Promotion of Zyprexa

$515 Million Criminal Fine Is Largest Individual Corporate Criminal Fine in History; Civil
Settlement up to $800 Million

American pharmaceutical giant Eli Lilly and Company today agreed to plead guilty and pay $1.415 billion for
promoting its drug Zyprexa for uses not approved by the Food and Drug Administration (FDA), the Department of
Justice announced today. This resolution includes a criminal fine of $515 million, the largest ever in a health care
case, and the largest criminal fine for an individual corporation ever imposed in a United States criminal
prosecution of any kind. Eli Lilly will also pay up to $800 million in a civil settlement with the federal government
and the states.

Eli Lilly agreed to enter a global resolution with the United States to resolve criminal and civil allegations that
it promoted its antipsychotic drug Zyprexa for uses not approved by the FDA, the Department said. Such
unapproved uses are also known as "off-label" uses because they are not included in the drug’s FDA approved
product label.

Assistant Attorney General for the Civil Division Gregory G. Katsas and acting U.S. Attorney for the Eastern
District of Pennsylvania Laurie Magid today announced the filing of a criminal information against Eli Lilly for
promoting Zyprexa for uses not approved by the FDA. Eli Lilly, headquartered in Indianapolis, is charged in the
information with promoting Zyprexa for such off-label or unapproved uses as treatment for dementia, including
Alzheimer’s dementia, in elderly people.

The company has signed a plea agreement admitting its guilt to a misdemeanor criminal charge. Eli Lilly also
signed a civil settlement to resolve civil claims that by marketing Zyprexa for unapproved uses, it caused false
claims for payment to be submitted to federal insurance programs such as Medicaid, TRICARE and the Federal
Employee Health Benefits Program, none of which provided coverage for such off-label uses.

The plea agreement provides that Eli Lilly will pay a criminal fine of $515 million and forfeit assets of $100
million. The civil settlement agreement provides that Eli Lilly will pay up to an additional $800 million to the federal
government and the states to resolve civil allegations originally brought in four separate lawsuits under the qui
tam provisions of the federal False Claims Act. The federal share of the civil settlement amount is $438 million.
Under the terms of the civil settlement, Eli Lilly will pay up to $361 million to those states that opt to participate in
the agreement.

Under the Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (FDCA), a company must specify the intended uses of a product in
its new drug application to the FDA. Before approving a drug, the FDA must determine that the drug is safe and
effective for the use proposed by the company. Once approved, the drug may not be marketed or promoted for
off-label uses.

The FDA originally approved Zyprexa, also known by the chemical name olanzapine, in Sept. 1996 for the
treatment of manifestations of psychotic disorders. In March 2000, FDA approved Zyprexa for the short-term
treatment of acute manic episodes associated with Bipolar I Disorder. In Nov. 2000, FDA approved Zyprexa for
the short term treatment of schizophrenia in place of the management of the manifestations of psychotic
disorders. Also in Nov. 2000, FDA approved Zyprexa for maintaining treatment response in schizophrenic patients
who had been stable for approximately eight weeks and were then followed for a period of up to eight months.
Zyprexa has never been approved for the treatment of dementia or Alzheimer’s dementia.
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The criminal information, filed in the Eastern District of Pennsylvania, alleges that from Sept. 1999 through at
least Nov. 2003, Eli Lilly promoted Zyprexa for the treatment of agitation, aggression, hostility, dementia,
Alzheimer’s dementia, depression and generalized sleep disorder. The information alleges that Eli Lilly’s
management created marketing materials promoting Zyprexa for off-label uses, trained its sales force to disregard
the law and directed its sales personnel to promote Zyprexa for off-label uses.

The information alleges that beginning in 1999, Eli Lilly expended significant resources to promote Zyprexa in
nursing homes and assisted-living facilities, primarily through its long-term care sales force. Eli Lilly sought to
convince doctors to prescribe Zyprexa to treat patients with disorders such as dementia, Alzheimer’s dementia,
depression, anxiety, and sleep problems, and behavioral symptoms such as agitation, aggression, and hostility.

The information further alleges that the FDA never approved Zyprexa for the treatment of dementia,
Alzheimer's dementia, psychosis associated with Alzheimer's disease, or the cognitive deficits associated with
dementia.

The information also alleges that building on its unlawful promotion and success in the long-term care market,
Eli Lilly executives decided to market Zyprexa to primary-care physicians. In Oct. 2000, Eli Lilly began this
off-label marketing campaign targeting primary care physicians, even though the company knew that there was
virtually no approved use for Zyprexa in the primary-care market. Eli Lilly trained its primary-care physician sales
representatives to promote Zyprexa by focusing on symptoms, rather than Zyprexa’s FDA approved indications.

The qui tam lawsuits alleged that between Sept. 1999 and the end of 2005, Eli Lilly promoted Zyprexa for use
in patients of all ages and for the treatment of anxiety, irritability, depression, nausea, Alzheimer’s and other mood
disorders. The qui tam lawsuits also alleged that the company funded continuing medical education programs,
through millions of dollars in grants, to promote off-label uses of its drugs, in violation of the FDA’s requirements.

"Off-label promotion of pharmaceutical drugs is a serious crime because it undermines the FDA’s role in
protecting the American public by determining that a drug is safe and effective for a particular use before it is
marketed," said Gregory G. Katsas, Assistant Attorney General for the Civil Division. "This settlement
demonstrates the Department’s ongoing diligence in prosecuting cases involving violations of the Food, Drug, and
Cosmetic Act, and recovering taxpayer dollars used to pay for drugs sold as a result of off-label marketing
campaigns."

"When pharmaceutical companies ignore the government’s process for protecting the public, they undermine
the integrity of the doctor-patient relationship and place innocent people in harm’s way," said acting U.S. Attorney
for the Eastern District of Pennsylvania, Laurie Magid. "Off-label marketing created unnecessary risks for
patients. People have an absolute right to their doctor’s medical expertise, and to know that their health care
provider’s judgment has not be clouded by misinformation from a company trying to build its bottom line."

The global resolution includes the following agreements:

A plea agreement signed by Eli Lilly admitting guilt to the criminal charge of misbranding. Specifically, Eli
Lilly admits that between Sept. 1999 and March 31, 2001, the company promoted Zyprexa in elderly
populations as treatment for dementia, including Alzheimer’s dementia. Eli Lilly has agreed to pay a $515
million criminal fine and to forfeit an additional $100 million in assets.
A civil settlement between Eli Lilly, the United States and various States, in which Eli Lilly will pay up to
$800 million to the federal government and the states to resolve False Claims Act claims and related state
claims by Medicaid and other federal programs and agencies including TRICARE, the Federal Employees
Health Benefits Program, Department of Veterans Affairs, Bureau of Prisons and the Public Health Service
Entities. The federal government will receive $438,171,544 from the civil settlement. The state Medicaid
programs and the District of Columbia will share up to $361,828,456 of the civil settlement, depending on
the number of states that participate in the settlement.
The qui tam relators will receive $78,870,877 from the federal share of the settlement amount.
A Corporate Integrity Agreement (CIA) between Eli Lilly and the Office of Inspector General of the
Department of Health and Human Services. The five-year CIA requires, among other things, that a Board of
Directors committee annually review the company’s compliance program and certify its effectiveness; that
certain managers annually certify that their departments or functional areas are compliant; that Eli Lilly
send doctors a letter notifying them about the global settlement; and that the company post on its website
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information about payments to doctors, such as honoraria, travel or lodging. Eli Lilly is subject to exclusion
from Federal health care programs, including Medicare and Medicaid, for a material breach of the CIA and
subject to monetary penalties for less significant breaches.

"OIG’s Corporate Integrity Agreement will increase the transparency of Eli Lilly’s interactions with physicians
and strengthen Eli Lilly’s accountability for its compliance with the law," said Department of Health and Human
Services Inspector General Daniel R. Levinson. "This historic resolution demonstrates the Government’s
commitment to improve the integrity of drug promotion activities."

In addition to the $1.415 billion criminal and civil settlement announced today, Eli Lilly previously agreed to
pay $62 million to settle consumer protection lawsuits brought by 33 states. The state consumer protection
settlements were announced on Oct. 7, 2008.

"Today's announcement of the filing of a criminal charge and the unprecedented terms of this settlement
demonstrates the government's increasing efforts aimed at pharmaceutical companies that choose to put profits
ahead of the public's health," said Special Agent-in-Charge Kim Rice of FDA's Office of Criminal Investigations.
"The FDA will continue to devote resources to criminal investigations targeting pharmaceutical companies that
disregard the safeguards of the drug approval process and recklessly promote drugs for uses for which they have
not been proven to be safe and effective."

"The illegal scheme used by Eli Lilly significantly impacted the integrity of TRICARE, the Department of
Defense's healthcare system," said Ed Bradley, Special Agent-in-Charge, Defense Criminal Investigative Service.
"This illegal activity increases patients’ costs, threatens their safety and negatively affects the delivery of
healthcare services to the over nine million military members, retirees and their families who rely on this system.
Today’s charges and settlement demonstrate the ongoing commitment of the Defense Criminal Investigative
Service and its partners in law enforcement to investigate and prosecute those that abuse the government's
healthcare programs at the expense of the taxpayers and patients."

"This case should serve as still another warning to all those who break the law in order to improve their
profits," said Patrick Doyle, Special Agent-in-Charge of the Office of Inspector General for the Department of
Health and Human Services in Philadelphia.  "OIG, working with our law enforcement partners, will pursue and
bring to justice those who would steal from vulnerable beneficiaries and the taxpayers."

The civil settlement resolves four qui tam actions filed in the Eastern District of Pennsylvania: United States
ex rel. Rudolf, et al., v. Eli Lilly and Company, Civil Action No. 03-943 (E.D. Pa.); United States ex rel. Faltaous
v. Eli Lilly and Company, Civil Action No. 06-2909 (E.D. Pa.); United States ex rel. Woodward v. Dr. George B.
Jerusalem, et al., Civil Action No. 06-5526 (E.D. Pa.); and United States ex rel. Vicente v. Eli Lilly and
Company, Civil Action No. 07-1791 (E.D. Pa.). All of those cases were filed by former Eli Lilly sales
representatives.

The criminal case is being prosecuted by the U.S. Attorney’s Office for the Eastern District of Pennsylvania
and the Office of Consumer Litigation of the Justice Department’s Civil Division. The civil settlement was reached
by the U.S. Attorney’s Office and the Commercial Litigation Branch of the Justice Department’s Civil Division.

This matter was investigated by the FDA’s Office of Criminal Investigations, the Defense Criminal
Investigative Service and the Department of Health and Human Services Office of Inspector General.

Assistance was provided by representatives of FDA’s Office of Chief Counsel and the National Association
of Medicaid Fraud Control Units.

The Corporate Integrity Agreement was negotiated by the Office of Inspector General of the Department of
Health and Human Services.

Eli Lilly's guilty plea and sentence is not final until accepted by the U.S. District Court.

###
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Pediatric bipolar disorder: An object of study
in the creation of an illness

David Healy ∗ and Joanna Le Noury
North Wales Department of Psychological Medicine, Cardiff University, Bangor LL57 2PW, Wales, UK

Abstract. In the past decade bipolar disorder in children has been diagnosed with rapidly increasing frequency in North Amer-
ica, despite a century of psychiatric consensus that manic-depressive illness rarely had its onset before adolescence. This
emergence has happened against a background of vigorous pharmaceutical company marketing of bipolar disorder in adults. In
the absence of a license demonstrating efficacy for their compound for bipolar disorder in children, however, companies cannot
actively market pediatric bipolar disorder. This paper explores some mechanisms that play a part in spreading the recognition
of a disorder in populations for which pharmaceutical companies do not have a license. These include the role of academic
experts, parent pressure groups, measurement technologies and the availability of possible remedies even if not licensed.

Keywords: Bipolar disorder, mood-stabilizers, mood-watching, disease mongering, off-label prescribing

1. Introduction

The diagnosis of bipolar disorder is rapidly increasing in frequency in North America. It seems com-
monly assumed that pharmaceutical companies must have engineered this.1 However, no company has a
license for treating bipolar disorder in children and hence no company can advertise their drug for use in
children in either academic or lay outlets. As such this disease cannot be mongered as readily as social
anxiety disorder, panic disorder or other such entities.

This paper seeks to explore the capacities of companies to create a culture that legitimizes practices
that would otherwise appear extra-ordinary. The article aims at offering a historically accurate narrative
that shares many background themes in common with developments in other medical disorders, but
which has in its foreground a comparatively small number of actors whose roles may merit further
research. The narrative illustrates how company strategies in one domain can resonate in another, in
this case the pediatric domain. To bring this point out, we first describe the marketing of adult bipolar
disorder.

2. The marketing of adult bipolar disorder

Just as other corporations do, pharmaceutical companies attempt to establish what marketing depart-
ments refer to as the unmet needs of their market [2]. One mechanism is to use focus groups; in the case

*Address for correspondence: David Healy, North Wales Department of Psychological Medicine, Cardiff University, Bangor
LL57 2PW, Wales, UK. Fax: +44 1248 371397; E-mail: healy_hergest@compuserve.com

1It seems to the authors that this assumption is common and it seems unlikely that this increase in diagnosis would be
happening in the absence of possible treatments clinicians could give.

0924-6479/07/$17.00 © 2007 – IOS Press and the authors. All rights reserved
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of psychotropic drugs, focus groups consist of academic psychiatrists, also termed opinion leaders. In
this process, academics have three roles. As repositories of psychiatric knowledge they help companies
understand what the average clinician might perceive as a development. As opinion leaders they help
deliver the company message to non-academic clinicians. As academics, they lend their names to the
authorship lines of journal articles and presentations at professional meetings reporting the results of
company studies or discussing clinical topics of strategic interest to marketing departments [20].

From work like this with opinion leaders in the early 1990s, a series of unmet mental health needs
clustering around the concept of bipolar disorder were identified. The field was prepared to believe that
bipolar disorder could affect up to 5% of the population; that it was an unacknowledged and under-
researched disorder; that antidepressants might not be good for this disorder; that treatment might be
better focused on the use of a “mood stabilizer”; and that everybody stood to gain by encouraging
patients to self monitor.

Early market research was linked to the introduction of Depakote. In the form of sodium valproate,
this anticonvulsant had been available and shown to be helpful in manic-depressive illness from the mid-
1960s. Abbott Laboratories reformulated it as semi-sodium valproate,2 which it was claimed formed a
more stable solution than sodium valproate. This trivial distinction was sufficient to enable the company
to gain a patent on the new compound, which as Depakote was introduced in 1995 for the treatment of
mania. Depakote was approved by the Food and Drugs Administration on the basis of trials that showed
this very sedative agent could produce beneficial effects in acute manic states [37]. Any sedative agent
can produce clinical trial benefits in acute manic states but no company had chosen to do this up till then,
as manic states were comparatively rare and were adequately controlled by available treatments.

Depakote was advertised as a “mood stabilizer”. Had it been advertised as prophylactic for manic-
depressive disorder, FDA would have had to rule the advertisement illegal, as a prophylactic effect for
valproate had not been demonstrated to the standards required for licensing. The term mood stabilizer in
contrast was a term that had no precise clinical or neuroscientific meaning [15]. As such it was not open
to legal sanction. It was a new brand.3

Depakote was referred to exclusively as a mood stabilizer rather than an anticonvulsant, even though
there still have not been any studies that prove it to be prophylactic for manic-depressive illness. This
branding played a major role in leading to increased sales of the compound compared for instance to
sodium valproate, which had better evidence for efficacy but was never referred to as a mood stabilizer.
Although the term still has no precise clinical or neuroscientific meaning, mood stabilizers have become
the rage, with a range of other agents passing themselves off as mood stabilizers. Before 1995 there
were almost no articles in the medical literature on mood-stabilizers but now there are over a hundred
a year [21]. Both clinicians and patients seem happy to endorse this rebranding of sedatives despite a
continuing lack of evidence that these drugs will achieve their stated aim.

But in addition to branding a new class of psychotropic drugs, the 1990s saw the rebranding of an
old illness. Manic-depressive illness became bipolar disorder. While the term bipolar disorder had been
introduced in DSM-III in 1980, as late as 1990 the leading book on this disease was called Manic-
Depressive Disease [16]. It is rare to hear the term manic-depressive illness now. This combination of a
brand new disease and brand new drug class is historically unprecedented within psychiatry.

2United States Patent 4,988,731. Date of Patent Jan. 29th 1991; United States Patent 5,212,326. Date of Patent May 18th
1993.

3While the term mood-stabilizer is not a trade-marked term, this use of the word brand here is deliberate. While the drugs are
products, the identification of these previously existing products under one advertising rubric such as mood-stabilizer or SSRI
appears to conform to the notion of a brand.
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Lilly, Janssen and Astra-Zeneca, the makers of the antipsychotic drugs, olanzapine (Zyprexa), risperi-
done (Risperdal) and quetiapine (Seroquel), respectively sought indications in this area and the steps they
have taken to market their compounds as mood stabilizers illustrate how companies go about making
markets. We will outline six such steps.

First, each company has produced patient literature and website material aimed at telling people more
about bipolar disorder, often without mentioning medication; this is a feature of what has been termed
disease mongering [32]. In the case of Zyprexa, patient leaflets and booklets – routed in Britain through
a patient group, the Manic-Depressive Fellowship – aim at telling patients what they need to do to stay
well. Among the claims are “that bipolar disorder is a life long illness needing life long treatment; that
symptoms come and go but the illness stays; that people feel better because the medication is working;
that almost everyone who stops taking the medication will get ill again and that the more episodes you
have the more difficult they are to treat”.4

A similar message is found in a self-help guide for people with bipolar disorder sponsored by Janssen
Pharmaceuticals which under a heading ‘the right medicine at the right time’ states: “Medicines are
crucially important in the treatment of bipolar disorders. Studies over the past 20 years have shown
without a shadow of doubt that people who have received the appropriate drugs are better off in the long
term than those who receive no medicine” [8].

If studies had shown this, there would be a number of drugs licensed for the prophylaxis of bipolar
disorder when in fact until recently lithium was the only drug that had demonstrable evidence for pro-
phylactic efficacy but even this had not received a license from the FDA. More to the point all studies
of life expectancy on antipsychotics show a doubling of mortality rates on treatment compared to the
non-treated state and this doubling increases again for every extra antipsychotic drug that the patient
takes [25]. Patients taking these drugs show a reduction of life expectancy of up to 20 years compared
to population norms [6].

Furthermore, to date when all placebo-controlled studies of Depakote, Zyprexa and Risperdal in the
prophylaxis of bipolar disorder are combined they show a doubling of the risk of suicidal acts on active
treatment compared to placebo [21,38]. In addition, valproate and other anticonvulsants are among the
most teratogenic in medicine [10].

These claims about the benefits of treatment therefore appear misleading. No company could make
such public statements without the regulators intervening. But by using patient groups or academics,
companies can palm off the legal liability for such claims [20].

A second aspect of the marketing of the drugs uses celebrities such as writers, poets, playwrights,
artists and composers who have supposedly been bipolar. Lists circulate featuring most of the major
artists of the 19th and 20th Century intimating they have been bipolar, when in fact very few if any had
a diagnosis of manic-depressive illness.

A third aspect of the marketing has involved the use of mood diaries. These break up the day into
hourly segments and ask people to rate their moods on a scale that might go from +5 to −5. For exam-
ple, on the Lilly sponsored mood diary,5 one would rate a +2 if one was very productive, doing things
to excess such as phone calls, writing, having tea, smoking, being charming and talkative. For a score
of +1 your self-esteem would be good, you are optimistic, sociable and articulate, make good decisions
and get work done. Minus 1 involves slight withdrawal from social situations, less concentration than

4Staying Well. . . with bipolar disorder. Relapse Prevention Booklet. Produced in Association with the Manic-Depressive
Fellowship of Great Britain, Sponsored by Eli Lilly and Company (2004), page 17.

5Mood diary produced in consultation with the Manic-Depressive Fellowship of Great Britain, Sponsored by Eli Lilly &
Company (2004). Other companies have similarly sponsored mood diaries.
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usual and perhaps slight agitation. Minus 2 involves feelings of panic and anxiety with poor concentra-
tion and memory and some comfort in routine activities. Most normal people during the course of the
week will probably cycle between at least +2 and −2, which is almost precisely the point behind this
mood-watching. Most normal people will show a variation in their moods that might be construed as an
incipient bipolar disorder.

On IsItReallyDepression.com,6 Astra-Zeneca, the makers of Seroquel (quetiapine), provide a mood
questionnaire which asks whether there has been a period when you were more irritable than usual,
more self-confident than usual, got less sleep than usual and found you didn’t really miss it, were more
talkative than usual, had thoughts race through your mind, had more energy than usual, were more active
than usual, were more social or outgoing than usual, or had more libido than usual.

These are all functions that show some variation in everyone. Answering Yes to 7 of these, leads to
two further questions one of which is whether you have ever had more than one of these at any one time
and the second of which is whether you have ended up in any trouble as a result of this. If you answer
yes to these two questions you may meet criteria for bipolar disorder and are advised to seek a review by
a mental health professional. Whether or not you meet criteria, if concerned, it is suggested you might
want to seek a mental health review.

This measurement induced mood watching has an historical parallel in the behavior of weight watch-
ing that came with the introduction of weighing scales [19]. This new behavior coincided with the
emergence of eating disorders in the 1870s. There was subsequently an increase in frequency in eating
disorders in the 1920s that paralleled a much wider availability of weighing scales and the emergence
of norms for weight that had a rather immediate impact on our ideas of what is beautiful and healthy. In
the 1960s there was a further increase in the frequency of eating disorders and again this paralleled the
development of smaller bathroom scales and their migration into the home. While there are undoubtedly
other social factors involved in eating disorders, it is a moot point as to whether eating disorders could
have become epidemic without the development of this measurement technology.

There is an informational reductionism with mood diaries that is perhaps even more potent that the
biological reductionism to which critics of psychiatry often point. Measuring is not inherently a problem
and figures may provide potent reinforcement to behaviors, but the abstraction that is measurement can
lead to an oversight for context and other dimensions of an individual’s functioning or situation that are
not open to measurement or that are simply not being measured. If these oversights involve significant
domains of personal functioning, we are arguably being pseudoscientific rather than modestly scientific
in measuring what we can.

A fourth aspect of the current marketing of all medical disorders involves the marketing of risk. This
is true for the marketing of depression and bipolar disorder as well disorders like osteoporosis, hyper-
tension and others. In the case of osteoporosis, companies will typically present pictures of a top model
looking her best in her mid-20s and juxtapose that image with a computer generated image of how the
same person might look during her 60s or 70s with osteoporosis. On the one hand a beautiful woman,
on the other a shrunken crone. The message is ‘one can never be too safe’. If one wants to retain beauty
and vitality it is best to monitor for osteoporosis from an early age and even treat prophylactically. In the
case of bipolar disorder the risks of suicide, alcoholism, divorce, and career failure are marketed.

All of the above come together in a fifth strategy in North America – direct to consumer advertising.
A now famous advertisement produced by Lilly, the makers of Zyprexa (olanzapine) begins with a vi-
brant woman dancing late into the night. A background voice says, “Your doctor never sees you like

6Accessed April 27th 2006.
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this”. The advert cuts to a shrunken and glum figure, and the voiceover now says, “This is who your
doctor sees”. Cutting again to the woman, in active shopping mode, clutching bags with the latest brand
names, we hear: “That is why so many people being treated for bipolar disorder are being treated for
depression and aren’t getting any better – because depression is only half the story”. We see the woman
depressed, looking at bills that have arrived in the post before switching to seeing her again energeti-
cally painting her apartment. “That fast talking, energetic, quick tempered, up-all-night you”, says the
voiceover, “probably never shows up in the doctor’s office”.

Viewers are encouraged to log onto bipolarawareness.com, which takes them to a “Bipolar Help Cen-
ter”, sponsored by Lilly Pharmaceuticals. This contains a “mood disorder questionnaire”.7 In the televi-
sion advert, we see our heroine logging onto bipolarawareness.com and finding this questionnaire. The
voice encourages the viewer to follow her example: “Take the test you can take to your doctor, it can
change your life. Getting a correct diagnosis is the first step in helping your doctor to help you”.

No drugs are mentioned. The advert markets bipolar disorder. Whether this is a genuine attempt to alert
people who may be suffering from a debilitating disease, or an example of disease mongering, it will
reach beyond those suffering from a clearcut mood disorder to others who as a consequence will be more
likely to see aspects of their personal experiences in a way that will lead to medical consultations and
will shape the outcome of those consultations. “Mood-watching” like this risks transforming variations
from an emotional even keel into indicators of latent or actual bipolar disorder. This advert appeared in
2002 shortly after Zyprexa had received a license for treating mania, when the company was running
trials to establish olanzapine as a “mood stabilizer”.

The sixth strategy involves the co-option of academia and is of particular relevance to the pediatric
bipolar domain. The American Psychiatric Association meeting in San Francisco in 2003 offers a good
symbol of what happened. Satellite symposia linked to the main APA meeting, as of 2000, could cost
a company up to $250,000. The price of entry is too high for treatment modalities like psychotherapy.
There can be up to 40 such satellites per meeting. Companies usually bring hundreds of delegates to their
satellite. The satellites are ordinarily distributed across topics like depression, schizophrenia, OCD, so-
cial phobia, anxiety, dementia and ADHD. At the 2003 meeting, an unprecedented 35% of the satellites
were for just one disorder – bipolar disorder.8 These symposia have to have lecturers and a Chair,9 and 57
senior figures in American psychiatry were involved in presenting material on bipolar disorder at these
satellites, not counting other speakers on the main meeting program. One of these satellite symposia, a
first ever at a major meeting, was on juvenile bipolar disorder.

The upshot of this marketing has been to alter dramatically the landscape of mental disorders. Until
recently manic depressive illness was a rare disorder in the United States and Canada involving 10 per
million new cases per year or 3300 new cases per year. This was a disorder that was 8 times less common
than schizophrenia. In contrast bipolar disorder is now marketed as affecting 5% of the United States and
Canada – that is 16.5 million North Americans, which would make it is as common as depression and
10 times more common than schizophrenia. Clinicians are being encouraged to detect and treat it. They
are educated to suspect that many cases of depression, anxiety or schizophrenia may be bipolar disorder
and that treatment should be adjusted accordingly [23]. And, where recently no clinicians would have
accepted this disorder began before adolescence, many it seems are now prepared to accept that it can
be detected in preschoolers.

7http://www.bipolarhelpcenter.com/resources/mdq.jsp.
8American Psychiatric Association (2003). Meeting Program.
9All of which comes with a fee, unlike symposia on the main program.
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3. Bipolar disorder in children

The emergence of bipolar disorder in children needs to be reviewed against the background outlined
above. Until very recently manic-depressive illness was not thought to start before the teenage years and
even an adolescent onset was atypically early. The clearest indicator of change came with the publication
of The Bipolar Child by Papolos and Papolos [35]. This sold 70,000 hardback copies in half a year.
Published in January 2000, by May it was in a 10th printing. Other books followed, claiming that we
were facing an epidemic of bipolar disorders in children [24] and that children needed to be treated
aggressively with drugs from a young age if they were to have any hope of a normal life [12]. Newspapers
throughout the United States reported increasingly on cases of bipolar children, as outlined below.

A series of books aimed at children with pastel colored scenes in fairy tale style also appeared. In My
Bipolar Roller Coaster Feelings Book [23], a young boy called Robert tells us he has bipolar disorder.
As Robert defines it doctors say you are bipolar if your feelings go to the top and bottom of the world, in
roller coaster fashion. When Robert is happy he apparently hugs everybody, he starts giggling and feels
like doing backflips. His parents call it bouncing off the walls. His doctor, Doctor Janet, calls it silly,
giddy and goofy.

Aside from giddiness, Robert has three other features that seem to make the diagnosis of pediatric
bipolar disorder. One is temper tantrums. He is shown going into the grocery store with his Mum and
asking for candy. When she refuses, he gets mad and throws the bag of candy at her. His mum calls this
rage and he is described as feeling bad afterwards.

Second, when he goes to bed at night Robert has nightmares. His brain goes like a movie in fast
forward and he seemingly can’t stop it. And third, he can be cranky. Everything irritates him – from the
seams in his socks, to his sister’s voice, and the smell of food cooking. This can go on to depression
when he is sad and lonely, and he just wants to curl up in his bed and pull the blanket over his head.
He feels as though it’s the end of the world and no one cares about him. His doctor has told him that at
times like this he needs to tell his parents or his doctor and he needs to get help.

Dr. Janet gives Robert medication. His view on this is that while he doesn’t like having bipolar disor-
der, he can’t change that. He also doesn’t like having to take all those pills but, the bad nightmares have
gone away and they help him have more good days. His father says a lot of kids have something wrong
with their bodies, like asthma and diabetes and they have to take medicine and be careful, and so from
this point of view he’s just like many other children.

His parents have told him that his bipolar disorder is just a part of who he is, not all of who he is. That
they love him and always will. Finally his doctor indicates that it’s only been a little while since doctors
knew that children could have bipolar disorder, and that they are working hard to help these children feel
better.

In another book, Brandon and the Bipolar Bear, we are introduced to Brandon, who has features in
common with Robert that the unwary might fail to realize indicate bipolar disorder [1]. When we are
introduced to Brandon, he has just woken up from a nightmare. Second, when requested to do things
that he doesn’t want to do he flies into a rage. And third, he can be silly and giddy.

His mother takes both Brandon and his bear to Dr. Samuel for help, where Brandon is told that he has
bipolar disorder. Dr. Samuel explains that the way we feel is controlled by chemicals in our brain. In
people with bipolar disorder these chemicals can’t do their job right so their feelings get jumbled inside.
You might feel wonderfully happy, horribly angry, very excited, terribly sad or extremely irritated, all in
the same day. This can be scary and confusing – so confusing that it can make living seem too hard.
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When Brandon responds that he thinks he got bipolar disorder because he is bad, Dr. Samuel responds
that many children have bipolar disorder, and they come to the doctor for help. Neither they nor Brandon
are bad – it’s a case of having an illness that makes you feel bad.

Brandon moves on to asking how he got bipolar disorder if he didn’t get it from being bad, to which
Dr. Samuel responds by asking him how he got his green eyes and brown hair. Brandon and his mother
respond that these came from his parents. And Dr. Samuel tells them it’s the same with bipolar disorder.
That it can be inherited. That someone else in the family may have it also.

The final exchange involves Brandon asking whether he will ever feel better. Dr. Samuel response is
upbeat – there are now good medicines to help people with bipolar disorder, and that Brandon can start
by taking one right away. Brandon is asked to promise that he will take his medicine when told by his
mother.

Brandon and the Bipolar Bear comes with an associated coloring book, in which Brandon’s Dad
makes it clear that a lot of kids have things wrong with their bodies, like asthma and diabetes, and they
have to take medicine and be careful too.

Janice Papolos, co-author of The Bipolar Child, in a review on the back cover of Brandon and the
Bipolar Bear says: ‘children will follow (and relate to) Brandon’s experience with rapid mood swings,
irritability, his sense of always being uncomfortable and his sadness that he can’t control himself and no-
one can fix him. The comforting explanation that Dr. Samuel gives him makes Brandon feel not alone,
not bad, but hopeful that the medicine will make him feel better. We were so moved by the power of this
little book and we feel better that we can now highly recommend a book for children aged 4 through 11’.

The book The Bipolar Child arrived at Sheri Lee Norris’ home in Hurst, Texas, in February 2000.
When it did Karen Brooks, a reporter in the Dallas Star-Telegram describes Norris as tearing open the
package with a familiar mix of emotions. Hope, skepticism, fear, guilt, shame, love. But as she reads in
the book about violent rages, animal abuse, inability to feel pain, self-abuse and erratic sleeping patterns,
Norris is reported as feeling relief for the first time in over a year. Now she finally knew what was wrong
with her daughter. . . Within days, Heather Norris, then 2, became the youngest child in Tarrant County
with a diagnosis of bipolar disorder [5].

Brooks goes on to note that families with mentally ill children are plagued with insurance woes, a
lack of treatment options and weak support systems but that parents of the very young face additional
challenges. It is particularly hard to get the proper diagnosis and treatment because there has been scant
research into childhood mental illness and drug treatments to combat them. Routine childcare is difficult
to find, because day-care centers, worried about the effect on other children, won’t accept mentally ill
children or will remove them when they are aggressive. Few baby sitters have the expertise or the desire
to handle difficult children, leaving parents with little choice but to quit work or work from home.

Having outlined these difficulties, Brooks also notes that the lack of public awareness of childhood
mental illness means that parents are judged when their children behave badly. They are accused of
being poor parents, of failing to discipline their children properly, or even of sexual or physical abuse
or neglect. The sense of hopelessness is aggravated when they hear about mentally ill adults; this leaves
them wondering whether the battles they and their children are fighting will go on forever.

In a few short paragraphs here Brooks outlines the once and future dynamics of disease from ancient
to modern times – the reflection on parents or family, the concerns for the future, the hope for an in-
tervention. But she also covers a set of modern and specifically American dynamics. Heather Norris’s
problems began with temper tantrums at 18 months old. Sheri-Lee Norris had a visit from the Child
Protective Services. Someone had turned her in because Heather behaved abnormally. Sheri-Lee was
furious and felt betrayed. She brought Heather to pediatricians, play therapists and psychiatrists, where
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Heather was diagnosed with ADHD and given Ritalin. This made everything worse. Faced with all this,
a psychiatrist did not make the diagnosis of bipolar disorder because the family had no history of it. But
Sheri-Lee began asking relatives and discovered that mental illness was, indeed, in her family’s history.
She presented that information along with a copy of The Bipolar Child to her psychiatrist, and Heather
got a diagnosis of bipolar disorder immediately.

Heather Norris’ story is not unusual. The mania for diagnosing bipolar disorders in children hit the
front cover of Time in August 2002, which featured 9-year-old Ian Palmer and a cover title Young and
Bipolar [26], with a strapline, why are so many kids being diagnosed with the disorder, once known
as manic-depression? The Time article and other articles report surveys that show 20% of adolescents
nationwide have some form of diagnosable mental disorder. Ian Palmer, we are told, just like Heather
Norris, had begun treatment early – at the age of 3 – but failed to respond to either Prozac or stimulants,
and was now on anticonvulsants.

While Heather Norris was in 2000 the youngest child in Tarrant County to be diagnosed as bipolar,
Papolos and Papolos in The Bipolar Child indicate that many of the mothers they interviewed for their
book remembered their baby’s excessive activity in utero, and the authors seem happy to draw conti-
nuities between this and later bipolar disorder. The excessive activity amounts to hard kicking, rolling
and tumbling and then later keeping the ward awake with screaming when born. Or in some instances
being told by the sonographer and obstetrician that it was difficult to get a picture of the baby’s face or
to sample the amniotic fluid because of constant, unpredictable activity [35]. It is not unusual to meet
clinicians who take such reports seriously.

Anyone searching the Internet for information on bipolar disorder in children are now likely to land
at BPChildren.com, run by Tracy Anglada and other co-authors of the books mentioned above. Or at
the Juvenile Bipolar Research Foundation (JBRF), linked to the Papoloses and The Bipolar Child. Or
at a third site, bpkids.org, linked to a Child and Adolescent Bipolar Foundation, which is supported by
unrestricted educational grants from major pharmaceutical companies.

In common with the mood-watching questionnaires in the adult field, all three sites offer mood-
watching questionnaires for children. The Juvenile Bipolar Research Foundation has a 65-item Child
Bipolar Questionnaire, which also featured in the Time magazine piece above; on this scale most normal
children would score at least modestly.10

The growing newsworthiness of childhood bipolar disorder also hit the editorial columns of the Amer-
ican Journal of Psychiatry in 2002 [40]. But where one might have expected academia to act as a brake
on this new enthusiasm, its role has been in fact quite the opposite.

4. The academic voice

As outlined above until very recently manic-depressive illness was not thought to start before the
teenage years. The standard view stemmed from Theodore Ziehen, who in the early years of the 20th
century established, against opposition, that it was possible for the illness to start in adolescence [3].
This was the received wisdom for 100 years.

As of 2006, European articles on the issue of pre-pubertal bipolar disorder continued to express ag-
nosticism as to whether there was such an entity [28]. The view was that patterns of overactivity could
be seen in patients with learning disabilities/mental retardation, or for example in Asberger’s syndrome,
but it was not clear that these should be regarded as indicative of manic-depressive disease.

10www.jbrf.org/cbq/cbq_survey.cfm. Accessed December 1st 2005.
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Geller and colleagues in St. Louis framed the first set of criteria for possible bipolar disorder in chil-
dren in 1996 as part of an NIMH funded study [13]. Using these criteria the first studies reporting in
2002 suggested that essentially very little was known about the condition. There were children who
might meet the criteria, but these had a very severe condition that in other circumstances have been
likely to be diagnosed as childhood schizophrenia or else they displayed patterns of overactivity against
a background of mental retardation [14].

The course of this study and the entire debate had however been derailed by the time the Geller
study reported. In 1996, a paper from an influential group, based at Massachusetts’ General Hospital,
working primarily on ADHD, suggested there were patients who might appear to have ADHD who in
fact had mania or bipolar disorder [4,11]. This study had used lay raters, did not interview the children
about themselves, did not use prepubertal age specific mania items, and used an instrument designed for
studying the epidemiology of ADHD. Nevertheless the message stuck. Cases of bipolar disorder were
being misdiagnosed as ADHD. Given the many children diagnosed with ADHD who do not respond to
stimulants, and who are already in the treatment system, this was a potent message for clinicians casting
round for some other option.

A further study by Lewinsohn and colleagues in 2000 added fuel to the fire [29]. Even though this
study primarily involved adolescents and pointed toward ill-defined overactivity rather than proper bipo-
lar disorder, the message that came out was that there was a greater frequency of bipolar disorder in
minors that had been previously suspected.

These developments led in 2001 to an NIMH roundtable meeting on prepubertal bipolar disorder [34]
to discuss the issues further. But by then any meeting or publication, even one skeptical in tone, was
likely to add fuel to the fire. Simply talking about pediatric bipolar disorder endorsed it. The Juvenile
Bipolar Research Foundation website around this time noted that bipolar disorder in children simply
does not look like bipolar disorder in adults, in that children’s moods swing several times a day – they
do not show the several weeks or months of elevated mood found in adults. They baldly state that “The
DSM needs to be updated to reflect what the illness looks like in childhood”.11

The Child and Adolescent Bipolar Foundation convened a meeting and treatment guideline process
in July 2003 that was supported by unrestricted educational grants from Abbott Astra-Zeneca, Eli Lilly,
Forrest, Janssen, Novartis and Pfizer. This assumed the widespread existence of pediatric bipolar disorder
and the need to map out treatment algorithms involving cocktails of multiple drugs [27].

There are many ambiguities here. First is the willingness it seems of all parties to set aside all evidence
from adult manic-depressive illness which involves mood states that persist for weeks or months and
argue that children’s moods may oscillate rapidly, up to several times per day, while still holding the
position that this disorder is in some way continuous with the adult illness and therefore by extrapolation
should be treated with the drugs used for adults.

Another ambiguity that the framers of the American position fail to advert to is a problem with
DSM-IV. Advocates of pediatric bipolar disorder repeatedly point to problems with DSM-IV that hold
them back from making diagnoses. But in fact, DSM-IV is more permissive than the rest of world in
requiring a diagnosis of bipolar disorder following a manic episode – in practice any sustained episode
of overactivity. The International Classification of Disease in contrast allows several manic episodes to
be diagnosed without a commitment to the diagnosis of bipolar disorder. The rest of the world believes
it simply does not know enough even about the relatively well understood adult illness to achieve di-
agnostic consistency worldwide. DSM-IV in fact therefore makes it easier to diagnose bipolar disorder

11www.jbrf.org/juv_bipolar/faq.html. Accessed December 1st 2005.
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than any other classification system, but therapeutic enthusiasts want an even further loosening of these
already lax criteria.

Finally, we appear to have entered a world of operational criteria by proxy. Clinicians making these
diagnoses are not making diagnoses based on publicly visible signs in the patients in front of them,
or publicly demonstrable on diagnostic tests, as is traditional in medicine. Nor are they making the
diagnoses based on what their patients say, as has been standard in adult psychiatry, but rather these are
diagnoses made on the basis of what third parties, such as parents or teachers, say without apparently
any method to assess the range of influences that might trigger parents or teachers to say such things –
the range of influences brought out vividly by Karen Brooks in her Star-Telegram articles.

When clinicians raise just this point [17], the response has been aggressive. “Mood need not be ele-
vated, irritable etc. for a week to fulfill criteria. . . A period of 4 days suffices for hypomania. This is. . .
itself an arbitrary figure under scrutiny. . . Dr. Harris is incorrect. . . that the prevalence of adult bipolar
disorder is only 1–2%. When all variants are considered the disease is likely to be present in more than
6% of the adult pop. There are still those who will not accept that children commonly suffer from bipolar
illness regardless of how weighty the evidence. One cannot help but wonder whether there are not polit-
ical and economic reasons for this stubborn refusal to allow the outmoded way of thought articulated by
Dr. Harris to die a peaceful death. It is a disservice to our patients to do otherwise” [9].

Where one might have thought some of the more distinguished institutions would bring a skeptical
note to bear on this, they appear instead to be fueling the fire. Massachusetts’s General Hospital (MGH)
have run trials of the antipsychotics risperidone and olanzapine on children with a mean age of 4 years
old [30,31]. A mean age of 4 all but guarantees three and possibly two year olds have been recruited to
these studies.

MGH in fact recruited juvenile subjects for these trials by running its own DTC adverts featuring
clinicians and parents alerting parents to the fact that difficult and aggressive behavior in children aged
4 and up might stem from bipolar disorder. Given that it is all but impossible for a short term trial of
sedative agents in pediatric states characterized by overactivity not to show some rating scale changes
that can be regarded as beneficial, the research can only cement the apparent reality of juvenile bipolar
disorder into place.

As a result where it is still rare for clinicians elsewhere in the world to make the diagnosis of manic-
depressive illness before patients reach their mid to late teens, drugs like olanzapine and risperidone are
now in extensive and increasing use for children including preschoolers in America with relatively little
questioning of this development [7].

Studies run by academics that apparently display some benefits for a compound have possibly be-
come even more attractive to pharmaceutical companies than submitting the data to the FDA in order
to seek a license for the treatment of children. Companies can rely on clinicians to follow a lead given
by academics speaking on meeting platforms or in published articles. The first satellite symposium on
juvenile bipolar disorder at a major mainstream meeting, the American Psychiatric Association meeting
in 2003 featured the distinguished clinical faculty of MGH. The symposium was supported by an unre-
stricted educational grant. None of the speakers will have been asked to say anything other than what
they would have said in any event. The power of companies does not lie in dictating what a speaker will
say but in providing platforms for particular views. If significant numbers of clinicians in the audience
are persuaded by what distinguished experts say, companies may not need to submit data to FDA and
risk having lawyers or others pry through their archives to see what the actual results of studies look
like. As an additional benefit, academics come a lot cheaper than putting a sales force in the field.
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It would seem only a matter of time before this American trend spreads to the rest of the world. In a
set of guidelines on bipolar disorder issued in 2006, Britain’s National Institute of Health and Clinical
Excellence (NICE), which is widely regarded as being completely independent of the pharmaceutical
industry, has a section on children and adolescents [33]. The guideline contains this section because if
there are treatment studies on a topic, NICE has to perforce consider them; it cannot make the point
that hitherto unanimous clinical opinion has held that bipolar disorders do not start in childhood. But
simply by considering the treatment for bipolar disorders in childhood, NICE effectively brings it into
existence, illustrating in the process the ability of companies to capture guidelines (Healy D., submitted).
And again, the need for a company to seek an indication for treatment in children recedes if influential
guidelines tacitly endorse such treatment.

5. Munchausen’s syndrome new variant?

As outlined above, a number of forces appear to have swept aside traditional academic skepticism
with the result that an increasing number of children and infants are being put on cocktails of potent
drugs without any evidence of benefit.

One of the features of the story is how a comparatively few players have been able to effect an extra-
ordinary change. There the academics noted above and a handful of others. One was Robert Post who
was among the first to propose that anticonvulsants might be useful for adult manic-depressive disease,
who when the frequency of the disorder began to increase rather than decrease as usually happens when
treatments work, promoted the idea that the reason we were failing was because we had failed to catch
affected individuals early enough. No age was too early.

One would encourage major efforts at earlier recognition and treatment of this potentially incapac-
itating and lethal recurrent central nervous system disorder. It would be hoped that instituting such
early, effective, and sustained prophylactic intervention would not only lessen illness-related mor-
bidity over this interval, but also change the course of illness toward a better trajectory and more
favorable prognosis [36].

Another group consists of evangelical parents and clinicians, who bring to the process of proselytiz-
ing about bipolar disorder a real fervor. Some of these parents and clinicians readily contemplate the
possibility of making a diagnosis in utero. When those challenging such viewpoints are subject to op-
probrium, one has to ask what has happened to the academic voices that should be questioning what is
happening here.

Finally there is the role of companies who make available the psychoactive drugs without which the
diagnoses would not be made, unrestricted educational grants, and access to academic platforms. This
has clearly facilitated the process outlined above. While companies cannot market directly to children,
it is now clear that documents from 1997 show that at least one company was aware of the commercial
opportunities offered by juvenile bipolar disorder [39].

If the process outlined here was one that could reasonably be expected to lead to benefits it could re-
garded as therapeutic. But given that there is no evidence for benefit and abundant prima facie evidence
that giving the drugs in question to vulnerable subjects in such quantities cannot but produce consequent
difficulties for many of these minors, one has to wonder whether we are not witnessing instead a vari-
ation on Munchausen’s syndrome, where some significant other wants the individual to be ill and these
significant others derive some gain from these proxy illnesses.
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The contrast between the developing situation and the historical record is striking. The records of all
admissions to the asylum in North Wales from North West Wales for the years from 1875 to 1924 show
that close to 3,500 individuals were admitted, from a population base of slightly more than a quarter of
a million per annum (12,500,000 person years). Of these, only 123 individuals were admitted for manic-
depressive disease. The youngest admission for manic-depression was aged 17. The youngest age of
onset may have been EJ, who was first admitted in 1921 at the age of 26, but whose admission record
notes that she “has had several slight attacks in the last 12 years, since 13 years of age”. All told there
were 12 individuals in 50 years with a clear onset of illness under the age of 20 [18]. But it would seem
almost inevitable that there will be a greater frequency of hospital admissions for juveniles in future
diagnosed with bipolar disorder. This is not what ordinarily happens when medical treatments work.
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